Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 4:39 PM

To: 'PERUMAL_B3@HOTMAIL.COM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 7565L AND S5LQ 9323C ON 10/12/2017

! U V Auto

i ey Consufiants
Al . B S Fre Lid

51 UBIAVE 1. #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065)67414108
Our Ref: CC6/A1G17023944/Ueal3

22 DEC 2017

SPSD SERVICES / KANATHASAN PERUMAL

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 7565L AND SLQ) 9323C ON 10/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng(@lkkauto.com

é.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO: PEGASUS EMNGINEERING & TRADIMG PTELTD

FROM: OWNER OF VEHICLE NUMBER 31093130

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 3L6THh5 L

ALONG/AT __ 105 EUNDY AVENVE 3 ow 10/n[l}

We hereby authorize you to act on our behalf in pursuance of our claim for all damages during
the repair arising out of the above accident.

This letter serve as the 'AUTHORITY TO ACT.

We also hereby authorize all agreed settlement payment be made in favour to PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

MName : Grab Rentals Pte Ltd

CoRegNo  : 2016172006

Address : 18 Sin Ming Lane #01-08 Midview City Singapore 573960
Contact : 6655 0005

Date 1 ( 113

Signature
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Owner



RELEASE VOUCHER

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm
that we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount
claimed for $84,000.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLQ 9323C that was damaged pursuant to the
accident which occurred on 10/12/2017 (date) along 105 EUNOS AVENUE 3 involving vehicle no/s
SLG 7565L.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/12/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GRAB RENTALS 2 PTE LTD (“the third
party claimant™) of vehicle no. SLQ 9323C make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLO
9323C (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 2 % (day) of ﬂ{'{w] (month) 20_(§_(year)

CKS :
Signed by appointed surveyor Signed b‘gr “the workshop" (with chop)
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‘2 PEGASUS

%

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C
Tax Invoice

From : Customer :
PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS 2 PTE LTD
C/0O 51 DEFU LANE 10 28, SIN MING LANE,
SINGAPORE 539216 #07-71 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573969
Officer in Charge : ALVIN LOW WAI LUN
Tel : Attn :
Email : Tal:
Fax
Inv No : IW1TM12-1219 Inv Date ; 28/12/2017 ]anrn : 30 DAYS
Vehicle No : SLO9323C Chassis No : JMGBNZ2ABHO151597

Model : MAZDA 3
k _ ‘emarks : TP INSURER: AIG, INSURED'S VEHICLE NUMBER: SLG7565L, DATE OF ACCIDENT: 10.12.2017

| Em | DESCRIPTION [ ary UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 TOLUMP SUM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR 1 2,000.0000 3,000.00
[
Cheques should be made payable to PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD Sub Total 3,000.00
GST(7.00%) 210.00
Total (SGD) 3,210.00

PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

Authorised Signature™ —



Our Ref, GR

A=ACC-209 702

071 June 2017

Pagasus Engineering & Trading Pie Lid
Mo, 51 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539216

To whom it may concam,

Re: WVehicla Rental Rates fc:rr Loss of Rental Claims. -

Groo

Rentals

Mailing Address

18 Sin Ming Lane,
#01-08 Midview Chy,
Singapore 572960
Co. No. 201617200G

With regards tothe above subject matter, we are pleased to mfon‘n you our Grab Rental rate
for our varicus vehicles which are as follows:

S/No. | Make & Model Daily Rental Rates {S$)
o1 Toyota Privs 1,798¢c, 90kw, 120bhp, Automatic $70.05
02 | Mazda 3 1.5 (A) Sedan $66.95 |
03 Miszan Qashgal 1.2L $78.95
04 Honda Vezal 1.5L $77.85
05 Honda Vezel 1.5L Hybrid £84.95
D8 . | Toyota Vies 1.5L $66.95

Flease note that the above stated rate i our daily rental rate to our drivers. For your necessary
O attions on third party accident claims on loss of rental.

Fagelof1

GRAE Singapare



121112017 Wehicls Hub

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SLG7565L As At 10

Dec2017/13:00:00)

LawFirm SearchDetaills =~~~ | -
Search Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case No.: SLG9323C

Current Owner Dét_ails

Cwner 1D Type: Business
Owner 1D 53347003W
Owner Name: SPSD SERVICES
Rpletarad AddraaE e Private Residential (Condo Apt or House) / Shopping / Office
Complexes
R Registered Block/House 394
] Mo.:
Registered Street Mame:  BENDEMEER ROAD
Registered Unit No.: #06-800

Registered Building Name:

Registered Postal Code: 331039
Current Vehicle Details |

Vehicle No.: SLG75465L

Make Description/Model: KIA/FORTE K3 1.64

Insurance Company Name: A|G ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

Print = OK

https:/fvrl.ita.gov.sgiitalvriactionlawrirmDetail PFUNCTION_ID=F1801071ET ' 1



