Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Li Seah <enquiry@maximusracing.com>

Sent: Friday, 2 February, 2018 3:22 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Daphne Tan; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: AUDI A4 SFP2608D ACCIDENT

Attachments: Estimation SFP2608D.pdf; Finalisation SFP2608D.pdf; After Repair Photos.pdf
Hi Taufikh,

Can we tally and finalise on the final lump sum amount quickly?
Hear from you very soon.

Regards,

Arry Seah
Operation Executive
Maximus Racing Team Support

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Guo Li Seah <enquiry@maximusracing.com>
To: "taufikh@lkkauto.com" <taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 January 2018, 19:00

Subject: AUDI A4 SFP2608D ACCIDENT

Hi Taufikh,

Attachment is the estimation & finalisation for subject.
Please let me know regard on your side. Thanks

Regards,

Arry Seah
Operation Executive
Maximus Racing Team Suppor



