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TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

— 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933

Feg. Mo 159607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8807188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automobile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CCB/AIG1T023854/Uual
Y A
CHARTIS BUILDING Date 16-12-2017
SINGAPORE 078120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKZ 1602P Veh. Inspected SLB 65344
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 151272017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.
Chassis No. Colour
Odomaeter - Steering
Brakes Modificatica
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre | mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Informatios
Accident Date  26/11/2017 |Inspection Date 26/12/2017
Survey held at  JIN AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10
#01-412
SINGAPORE 539185
5a. Remarks y
A)THE INSFECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
BlIN ACCORUOANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




i
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 Defu Lane 100 801412
Singapore 539195
Tel:62898126 Fax :62BT0590
Company Reg No:200T0H3TOC GST Reg No 2 2007043700C
Y our ref ;
Our Rel 22/122017
M/S AIG
DEAR SIR / MADAM
ESTIMATE REPAIR COST FOR SLB6534)
TO SUPPLY
8 NETT ITEM
01y 1PC FRONT RH DOOR 4,.(_5,":? S 92000 —
02y 1PC FRONT RH DOOR RUBBER -7 s 1vso0 X
03) 2PCS  FRONT RH LOWER GARNISTJ j"“ S 21600
04) 1 PC REAR RH DOOR S 92000
05) 1PC REAR RH DOOR RLIBBER a1 $ 19500 /,....
06) 1 PC REAR RH DOOR LOWER GARNISH <4+ S 21600
i £ 266200 P L
less 5 % o/ S (266.20) T
$ 239580
Labour Charge
07 SPRAY PAINTING (4 PORTION) % 220,00 Sq-’-:’
08) LABOUR CHARGE § 48000 S5O0
(9) WIRING AND TRANSFER DOOR FITTING § 160 /20
10) TUFF KOTING $ 10000 O
$  3.65580
'/vw‘ Mf' 5 /
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Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 12:29 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAUto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017

*** LKK REF - CCB/AIG17023854/ua3

Dear Thin Thin,
We confirm acceptance . DV plaease

Thank you & Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Alk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel - (65) 62898126
Fax :(65) 62870590

Email : jouis@]inauto.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 October 2018 2:15 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017 *** LKK REF -
CCe/AIG17023854/ual3

"Without Prejudice"
Dear Jouis,
We refer to the above matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we propose the settlement at Global Sum 5%
1,370.00 (all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ Inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2960 | email; thinthin® lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

From: jouis <jouis@iinauto.com.sg>
Sent; Friday, 27 July 2018 1:04 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AlG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017 *** LKK REF -

CC6/AIG17023854/ua3
Without Prejudice
Dear Thin Thin

LOD AND REPAIR BILL ATTACHED

Thank you & Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel  :(65) 62898126
Fax :(65) 62870590
Email : jouls@{inauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 24 May 2018 2:49 PM

To: 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto)' <thinthin@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017 *** LKK REF -
CCB/AIG17023854/ua3

Without Prejudice
Dear Thin Thin

We settle at 50/50

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.



Tel  :(65) 62898126
Fax :(65) 62870590
Email : jouis@]i LCOM.5

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ilkkauto.com
Sent: Wednesday, 20 December 2017 10:53 AM

To: Jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Cc: 'Elaine’ <elaine@chuanhockhardware.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @Ik m>: Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assi nts@Ikkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LB6534) AND 5KZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017 *** LKK REF -
CCH/AIG17023854/ua3

"Without Prejudice

Dear Jouis,

We refer 1o the below matter.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in
the above matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we

have our principal instruction to offer 50% to your client’s claim.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount 1o an authorisation of repair to
vour client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 2:28 PM

To: jouis <jouis@iin SE>

Ce: 'Elaine’ <elaine@chuanhockhar re_com>: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
<jaskhine @Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017 *** LKK REF -
CCH/AIG17023854/ua3

Dear Jouis,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Thin Thin at 6841 2360.



Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shiriey Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: ShifkeyHiew lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg|
Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 11:55 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Elaine’ <elaine@chuanhockhardware.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6534) AND SKZ1602P | AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017

Dear Officer In Charge,

Able to establish liability for this case?

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 ¥01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : [65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 15 December 2017 1:53 PM

To: jouls <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com=; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
<ShirleyHiew @Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LB6534) AND SKZ1602P | AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017

Dear Jouis,

Thank you for your email.

By copy to Assignment team and Shirley,

FY1 and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: jouls ilto: i
Sent: Friday, 15 December, 2017 1:31 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6534) AND SKZ1602P ( AIG INSURED ) ON 26/11/2017

Please appoint Marcus 's to conduct SLB&534) inspection at :

Place : Blk 14 #01-412

Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

We would be appreciate if could revert to us on the liability urgently .

Thank you & Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel  :(65) 62898126
Fax :(B65) 62870590
Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg



Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 339195

Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590
Business Reglstration No: 2007003700 GST Reglstration No: 2007043700

Date:27/7/2018

M/S AIG INSURANCE

Dear SirMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLB6534) & SKZ1602P ON 26/11/2017

We are instructed by the owner SLB6534) to write, negotiate and settle claim on his behalf for the
above mentioned accident. Our client’s vehicle SLB6534) was inspected and surveved by vour
appointed survevor's. We are now seeking the total amount of claim as follow:

1) Repair cost 8% 235400
2) loss of Used ( 4days ) 400.00
S$ 2754.00

The following documents are enclosed to support our claims:
» Letter of Authority and repair bill
Yours faithfully

Jouis Seow
Email: jouis@jinauto.com.sg



L

“We/l, Jin Auto Services Pte Litd (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an

agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd ALTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for

§51.370.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLB6534J that was damaged uant to the actidemt

which occurred on 26/11/2017 (date) along 206 BEDOK NORTH STREET 1 460206 CP
involving vehicle no/s SKZ16021.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 26/12/20 17 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l arc/am authorized by the owner ONG N HONG (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLB6534J make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lud for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLB6534J (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimam™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

m m (month) 20 l ‘1

e y

cks

Dated this @ (day) of

(year)

NS
waorkshop™ (with chop)

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed}p?h:



Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412
Singapore 539195

Tel:62898126 Fax :62870590
Rusiness Reghstration No:200TIHIT0C

Date 1 50172018
Your ref - SKZ1602P (AIG Insured)

Our Ref : SLB6534]

C/O LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
51 Ubi Ave |

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(5) 408933

Dear Sir'Madam
Accident involving vehicle : SLB6534) & SKZ1602P ON 26/11/17

We are instructed by the owner SLB6534) 1o write ,negotiate and settle claim on her
behalf for the above mentioned accident. we are now seeking the total amount of claim
as follow:

Repair cost S$ 2354.00( with gst)

Loss of Use ( S$100X3days) S$ 300,00

TOTAL S5 2654.00

We shall appreciate if you could kindly consider our claim at your earliest convenience and kindly let us
have your acknowledgement of receipt of this letter within 14days of vour receipt of this letter,

Yours faithfully
NS

Jouis Seow (Email: jouis@jinamo.com.sg)



S1UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN ¢ (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIGIT023854/ual
20 DECEMBER 2017

WONG CHOI YING @ WONG CHOI
17 LENGKONG SATU
SINGAPORE 417487

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ 1602P & SLB 6534 ON 26/11/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 7 days i.e. by 30/12/2017, after we shall
proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and
any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
THIN THIN HLAING
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360
Fax: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



L

LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Block 14 Defu Lane 10
#01-410/412
Singapore 539195

rDm Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ1602P & SLB 6534] ON 26/11/2017

[/'We ,the owner of vehicle ng; SLB 6534 J hereby instruct and authorise you to commence repairs to
the said vehicle.

[/We, hereby appoint you recover my damages sustained in the above accident.
Please recover the following:

. Costof repairs
2. Rental

You may proceed to apply to the relevant authorities for all necessary reports/documents to enable
you to process my claim.. The entire amount claimed shall belong and make payable to Jin Auto
Services Pte Ltd absolutely.

Yours faithfully

Name: ONb Becdl Honb |




RELEASE VQUQHER
AlIG Asia Pacific - Ex Third Pa ai

“We/l, Jin_Auto Services Pte Ltd (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
§§1.370.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLB6534J that was dameged pursuant 1o the accident
which occurred on 26/11/2017 (date) along ORTH . P
involving vehicle no/s SKZ1602P,

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 26/12/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner ONG BOON HONG (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLB6534J make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in 8 manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”™.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lt for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLB6534J (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the npplicmirfn of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

\& MR

(day) of

& & N
Signed by appointed surveyor Sigde.tx workshop” (with chop)

Dated this (month) znﬁ (year)
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Faullahes
[CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - B ) {
| Case |Notified Est Submitrad Ad) Assigned | Aaj Rpr Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth’ed i.‘itlru
|27 Now 2017 ooe SV ss2,20000  |ss2,20000 | iml for Survey |
| Ed O et Ady apt | e Extmates | | _view hox | | Canenl Case | |

Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]

{insured: _ Wong Chal Ying © Wong Chol, 1D: SODIGHSSE
ONG BOON HONG, D¢ S1187E35D

I [26/11/2017 09:00 - .59
B Date of Low! |49 manths and 8 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Policy/Cover | 2100447170 (Comprehensive )
TP / 823904763756 Note No.. | Coverage: 12/01/2017 - 11/01/2018
Policy No.
(Claimant )

| )
| I d | Exgmss: |
| Bepairer: | Jin Auto Services Pte Lid (Defu) Bik 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412, 539195 Defu Lane - Tel: 6I8% 8136
[ Handiing ]A.I:ﬂ Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 . [Handled by Ler, Bernard-10]
Insurer: BernardbCian, Lerghaig. com

Claimant’s .
e ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. (HQ) - Tel 6829 9169

| DMPC175005167

SKIlBO2P

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view ANl |  Compose Case Mai | |
There are o mail for this case. 1

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View All | Search Tasks | Cruate New Task | Compiete I|

Diie Date Priority Type  Task Group Handler Ansigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.

hitps://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 25/3/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLB6534) (8239047637SG)

[SKZ1602P]
™

ONG BOON HONG
Nov 26 2017 9:00AM
Chol Ying @ Wong Chol]

Page 1 of 2

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Upload Documents | Upad Photos | Compose tew Latter | Upioed video | Upioad Auso | View [View in Browser| <]
Video 1 per page ~| & |
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|’ﬁhl¢h No: SKZ1602P (Insd veh) Model: UBARLU FORESTER 2.0 I-L
SLBE534J (TP veh) VT AWD SR (A)
| Date of Accident: |26/11/2017
Global Sum Settiement | - | [X] Yes |1 1 me
Repair Estimate 5 3gnm
Final Repair Cost 5 1,370.00
Loss of Use s 4.00 days at $100.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 days
LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ -
Othars 5
5
Final Settiement Sum (Global Sum) s 1.370.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability ____ 50 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenaric No

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability %) Assessed Liability (*) (%)

* Assessed Liabilily o be fitled only for chain coliisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Jdin Aute Services Ple Lid s 1,370.00
2) '8
25 Mar
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Data

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg o 1ssscr1sen)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industnal Park
Singapore 408833
Tel B256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall; sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCB/AIG1T023854/UPA302

Date: 25/032018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100447170
Claimant Vehicle st pas34s Insured Vehicle No: SKZ1602P
Date of Loss; 26112017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: B2380476375G
I Fl FVEH
Reg No: SLB6534J
Make & Model: SUBARU FORESTER, 2.0 I-L CVT AWD SR (A) Engine No: FB20Y231412
Req. Date: 18/04/2016 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: JF1SJ5KC5GG06E8428
Colour: White Cdometer JETES km
Engine Capacity: 1885 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S5). Market Valua/New Car Price
ONDITION OF VEHI AT THE TIM F SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/60 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/60 R17
Front Left Side: Yokohama 7 mm Rear Left Side Yokohama 7 mm
Front Right Side Yokohama 7T mm Rear Right Side Yokohama 7 mm
The above values represent the ramaining (yre reads depth
COSTOFCLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 2,395.80 181760 578.20 2413
Miscellansous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,260.00 880.00 280.00 2222
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towmng 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 3,655.80 2,797.60 858.20  23.48
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,200.00
(S5%) 3.655.80 2,200.00 1.455.80 3082
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (58) 25591 154.00 101.91 3982
Nett Amount (55) 391171 2,354.00 1,557.71 39.82
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x 55100.00/day) (55) 400.00
(5%) 2,754.00
Liable Amaount (50.00%) (S%) 1,377.00
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 1,370.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 261122017
Date Inspected: 26/1272017  Inspected At
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Jin Auto Services Pte Lid (Defu)
Blk 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412
Singapore 539195

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: CHEW HSIAOQ TONG

NOTE: This mport represents our findings af the fme and piace of mspechion efafed herein. Such mspection has been carmed out o the best of our
knowiedgs and abiity bu! any other fabiity under any other circumatances is homeby expressly excluded.
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT RH DOOR Badly Dented 920,00 FL “820.00 FL
2 1 *FRONT RH DOOR RUBBER Not Necessary 195,00 FL “-FL
3 2 *FRONT RH LOWER GARNISH Grazed 216.00FL  *216.00FL
a 1 *REAR RH DOOR Badly Dented 92000FL  "82000FL
] 1 *REAR RH DOOR RUBBER Not Necessary 185.00FL *-FL
B 1 *REAR RH DOOR LOWER GARNISH Missing 216.00FL *216.00 FL
FaFranchiss par. L=ListitemDac
Sub Total (S8) 2,662.00 2,272.00
- List tem Discount en L ltems 10.00/20.00% (S%) 286.20 454 40
Total Parts (5$) 2,395.80 1,817.60
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 25/3/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellancous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour items

1 SPRAY PAINTING (4 PORTION) New 520.00 500.00

2 LABOUR CHARGE New 480.00 300.00

3 WIRING AND TRANSFER DOOR FITTING New 160.00 120.00

4 TUFF KOTING Naw 100.00 £0.00
Gross Labour Cost (53) 1,260.00 980.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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