Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Loh Kok Chi <kcloh@familymedicare.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 9:50 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKW803Z and SHD 9795P on 11 Dec 2017
Thanks Mr Chew.

| have also sent you the summaons just received from traffic police.
Mr Zaimi from your office has kindly agreed that we should settle the fine with the TP.
Appreciate your kind assistance in the negotiations.

It does appear from the video that the cab that hit my car was driving very fast and unable to stop unlike the other
vehicle what was ahead of him managed to. The speed of his vehicle certainly contributed to the severity of the
damage.

Best regards,

Loh Kok Chi
SKWa032

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 9:00 AM

To: Loh Kok Chi <kcloh@familymedicare.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKWB803Z and SHD 9795P on 11 Dec 2017

Hi dr Loh,
Thank you for your video and email.

Based on all available information on hand, liakility is not our driver favour. We will proceed to negotiate for
an amicable setflernent with the Third Party.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be profected,

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408033)



From: Loh Kok Chi [mailto:kcloh@familymedicare.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 10:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) schewht@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Accident invelving SKWB803Z and SHD 9795P on 11 Dec 2017

Dear Mr Chew,

I will be sending you the dash-cam video clip via WeTransfer. You will receive the link to download via a separate
email.

My daughter (driver of my vehicle at the time of the accident) also received a traffic police summons just a few days
ago. It is attached herein,

Best regards,

Loh Kok Chi
SKWB03Z

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 February 2018 10:59 AM

To: Loh Kok Chi <kcloh@familymedicare.com=

Subject: RE: Accident invalving SKW803Z and SHD 9795P on 11 Dec 2017

Dear Mr Loh,
Thank you for your photos,
As for the video clip, will you able to come down to our office for submission?

Flease call us if you have any queries.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Loh Kok Chi [mailto:kcloh@familymedicare.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 January 2018 6:09 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Accident involving SKW803Z and SHD 9795P on 11 Dec 2017

S PrEs P A PrA4, Fr < Pr<< B3I A<, B3 << B>

Dear Mr Chew,



Please refer to your letter dated 24 January 2018 (Ref CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3) requesting for the infarmation
attached.

Police Report, Driver’s Particulars and photos are included in the pdf document. More photos taken at the scene are
also attached.

We have not received any summons or info from the police.

A video clip from our car camera was submitted to the police and returned to us. We have the clip but it is too big a
file to send so | have it put on an 5D Card. Will you be able to pick that up from me?

Thank you for attending to this case.

Kindly let me know once you have received this email.
Best regards,

Loh Kok Chi

Owner of

SKW803Z

Virus-free. www.avg.cor




Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)
Sent: Saturday, 15 September 2018 9:24 AM
To: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg’; "Ng Wai Yin'; 'Zhe Wei'
{zhewei kek@transcab.com.sg); claims@transcab.com.sg
Subject: AFTER REPAIR/ AFTER PAINT PHOTOS FOR SHD 9795P (DOA: 11/12/2017) -

AADITIZ- 116

Yourref: AAD1712 - 116 (SHD $795F) Without Prejudice
Our ref: CC3/ASMI702383%/Kpa3

Hi Sirs/Mdm,
We rafer to the above matier,
We are seeking mandate approval from AXA.,

Kindly advise if there is any after repair/ after paint photos for SHD 9795P (DOA: 11/12/2017). If so, kindly let
us have a copy of the photos.

Tharnk you.

Best Resards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)
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please advise the repair limit of TP vehicle, Also, TP vehicle was damaged on the front portion but the COR
is-s0 high, kindly advise
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TP Veh SHD 9795P
Date of Reg 14.04.2014
DOA 11.12.2017
COE Expiry Date 13.04.2022

S
(1) Estimated Book Value
Unit Cost 38,000.00
Import Duty 3,999.60
Registration Fee 140.00
PQP Paid 59,871.00
ARF Paid 12,498.00
Estimated Per Taxi Purchase Price 114,508.60
Estimated Per Taxi Purchase Price 114,508.60
Less 60% of ARF Paid 7,498.80
Estimated Full Lifespan Depreciation 107,009.80
Estimated Full Lifespan Depreciation 107,009.80
Times Balance Life (52/96 months)

57,963.64
Add 60% of ARF Paid 7,498.80
Estimated Book Value 65,462.44
(I1) Adjusted LTA Rebate
'PARF Rebate 9,373.00
PQP Paid 59,871.00
Times Balance Life (52/96 months)
Adjusted COE Rebate 32,430.13
PARF Rebate 9,373.00
Add Adjusted COE Rebate 32,430.13
Adjusted LTA Rebate 41,803.13
{Summary) Estimated Nett Value
Estimated Book Value 65,462.44
Less Adjusted LTA Rebate 41,803.13

Estimated Net Value

23,659.31

(est)
OMVY x15%
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1001142018 Claim Portal

<SEEK MANDATE> - S7M|(j)05H1 ACCIDENT

<« INVOLVING SKW 803Z(Ol) & SHD 9795P(TP) ON
11/12/2017]

Type
@ Question

Message

Liability: 100%. Insured made right turn and collided with third party who was driving straight. Inform Ol
about third party claim. Agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate up to
$20.850.79(all-in}. |1A with mandate had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your
approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 11 Oct 2018

[ oo |

https./ivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/htmilindex-vendor-service-req uests.himi#/zervice-requests/view-message/7serviceRequestNumbe. .. 111
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SUREAYE T, 00225 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 08938 TED

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey Details:

Company Reglstration Me 193607 1380

P B2EASRTD FAN 6 250405

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party

Vehicle number SHD 9795P

Make and Model Renault Latitude {1995¢c)

Date of registration 14.04.2014

Excess MIL

Market Value/ Book Value 5 59,400.00

Parf/COE Rebate s 41,823.00

Mett Loss 5 17,577.00

Repair details:

lInitial Estimate [$ 88,960.27 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 29,530.27

Check items (estimate) NIL

Labour 5 2,630.00

Supplementary MNIL

Total 5 32,160.27

Lump Sum(if applicable) ] 17,500.00

|Number of days for repair | 1

=

—

Date: 11.10.2018

Date of loss 11.12.2017
Date of appointment 14.12.2017
Date of survey 14,12.2017
Location of survey TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

(est)
(est)
[est)



Pra Lref Comgany Registration Mo 195607 138R

SEUBEAVE L #02-25 PAYA URLINIMUS TRIAL PARK, SINUGATORE S0 TEL (0681 62503561 FANX  (DA5) h25A10]) &
Date:

Remarks:
Mandate:

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed repair cost (w/G5T) S 18,725.00

Loss of use MNIL

Loss of rental 5 1,420.44 | (14days x 5101 .46)

Loss of income 5 700.00 | (14days x $50.00)

LTA/GIA search fees 5 5.35

Others MNIL

Proposed Total s 20,850.79




5182019 Claim Portal

LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTDH(TP) » Menu

2
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Message
PLS PROCEED

Reply
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Hsiao Tonﬁ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 18 May 2019 9:37 AM

To: Jasminetan@transcab.com.sg’; Ng Wai Yin; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: Your ref: AAD1712-116 (SHD 9795P) *Qur Ref: CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SKW 803Z(AXA) AND SHD 9795P ON 11/12/2017]

Your ref: AAD1712-116 (SHD 9795P) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW B03Z(AXA) AND SHD 9795P ON 11/12/2017

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $20,800.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

"Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(a08033)



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May 2019 7:03 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); 'Ng Wai Yin'; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your ref: AAD1712-116 (SHD 9795P) *Our Ref: CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW B0O3Z({AXA) AND SHD 9795P ON 11/12/2017]

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong

Please proceed to send us the DV.

Thank you
Best Regards
Jasmine Tan
TRAN ﬁ TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 43, Singapore 5692111
amnd ¥/ | Main Line :(65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6257 1330
Direct Line :(65) 6603 1250
Website: www . transcab.comsg
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work produck immunity or ather le xgal rules, If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system: you may not copy this

message or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are
not screened for response deadlines. The Integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 18 May 2019 9:37 AM

To: 'jasminetan@transcab.com.sg’ <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>;
claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: Your ref: AAD1712-116 (SHD 9795P) *Our Ref: CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW
BO3Z(AXA) AND SHD 9795P ON 11/12/2017]

Your ref: AAD1712-116 (SHD 9795P) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW BO3Z(AXA) AND SHD 9795P ON 11/12/2017

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $20,800.00(all-in).

Flease confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”



Besl Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd
No. Z Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref : AADI1T712-116
Your Ref : SKWB03Z
Date ¢ 03June 2019

AXA INSURANCE S PTE LTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD9795P AND SKW803Z ON 11/12/17 09:20 AM ALONG
TAMPINES AVE 2 TOWARDS TAMPINES STREET 31

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1 Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% G5T) 4 18,725.00

3 Loss of Rental for ‘% _days @ $.100-%b per day $ 1,420.44

3 Loss of Income for 14  days @ §_58-99 per day $ 700.00

4, LTA Search Fee b1 E.35

5. Survey Fee i 0.00
Total % 20,850.79

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)

Mote : Please email any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: SKW 8032 (Insd veh) Model: RENAULT LATITUDE (A)
SHD 9795P (TP veh)
Date of Accident: |11/12/2017
Global Sum Settlement I : [ [X] Yes [ 1 Mo
Repair Estimate 15 95,187 .49
Final Repair Cost '8 18,725.00
Loss of Token Sum 3 700.000 14 days at $50.00 per day
Rental {if any) 3 1,420.44 14  days
LTA / GIA Search Fee % 5.35
Others: |.' $| |
Final Settlement Sum (GOLBAL SUM) ' % 20.800.00

below)

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X]1 YES |

| NO (Kindly indicate

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop:

Agreed Liability

(%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Ne BOLA Scenario No:

5

Assessed Liability (*); (%)

" Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does niot apply.

Remarks  pLEASE SEND THE CHEQUE PAYMENT TO TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

MNO.2 ANG MO KIO 5T 63 SINGAPORE 569111

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

¥

20,800.0

NUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL
WAHAR

21/06/2019

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill {if any)




'Y V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl = 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref |  CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3s2
RATONERSNGAFORE s ooe: ooz [N
ATTN: STACEY NG Code: ASM
7k Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SKWB03Z Veh. Inspected SHD 9795P
Policy No. GA276256 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S7MO05H1 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 14/12/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model REMNAULT LATITUDE (A) c.C 1895
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. VF1ABL1SAUC277284 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 337344 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 FALKEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 FALKEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/60R16 LING LONG 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/80R16 LING LONG 5 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/12/2017 |Inspection Date 14/12/2017
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST 63
SINGAPORE 569111
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IEETIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 10 Working Days




/|

L,

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 9795P

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406933

Page Mo 1 of @

Report Ref No. CC3/ASM17023839/Kpa3s2

' Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wdrklhﬁp?:ﬂ A’;I} :
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER FRT (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,258 42 1,2568.42
1{BUMPER SPOILER FRT (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 181.75 181.75
1{BUMPER ABSORBER FRT (CONSISTENT) MISSING 394 68 30468
1|EUMPER RETAINER FRT LH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 151.41 151.41
T|BUMPER SUPPORT FRT (COMNSISTENT) DISTORTED 123.88 12388
1|BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 150.77 1680.77
1|BUMPER SUPPORT FRT [CONSISTENT) REPEATED 123.88 -
1|BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT (CONSISTENT) MISSING 472.83 472.83
1|BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT [CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 266.80 268.80
1|BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE LH [COMNSISTENT) MISSING 207.21 207.21
1|BUMPER BEAM FRT (CONSISTENT) BENT 914.08 914.08
1| TOW COVER FRT (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 28.61 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE {CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1,707.78 1,707.78
1|RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE 'RENAULT (CONSISTENT) MNECESSARY 225.36 22536
T1|RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME (CONSISTENT) BROKEMN 1,353.75 1,353.75
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 61590 615,90
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET (CONSISTENT) BENT Bay9 89,79
1|FRONT BRACE PANEL (CONSISTENT) BENT 177.22 177.22
1]HORN (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 31417 -
1|HORN BRACKET (COMNSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 40.45 -
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP LH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1,184.43 1,184 43
1|HEADLAMP RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,184 43 -
1|HEADLAMP PANEL FRT LH (CONSISTENT) BENT 18215 152.16
1|HEADLAMF PANEL FRT RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 16215 -
LABOUR

1|BONNET (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,941.63 1,941 63
1|BONNET INSULATOR (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 40573 405.73
1|BONNET STRUT LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE BBA1 .
1(BONNET STRUT RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE £8.61 -
1|BONNET HINGE LH (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 34831 348.31




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Report Ref No. CC3/ASM17023838/Kpa3s2

Bl RS B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No. 2 of 6
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | Csirate By f Ouridl
1|BONNET HINGE RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 34831 1
LABOUR
1|BONNET LOCK (CONSISTENT) BENT 305.48 305.48
1|BONNET CABLE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 119.19 -
1|BONNET CABLE COVER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 161.03 :
1|BONNET SEAL OUTER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 92.36 .
1|BONNET SEAL INNER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 157.28 2
1|CHASSIS PANEL REINFORCEMENT FRT LH TO REPAIR SEE 1,095.24 d
(CONSISTENT) LABOUR
1|FENDER PANEL FRT LH (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 783.83 783 83
1|FENDER PANEL FRT RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 783.83 -
LABOUR
1|WHEELARGH FRT LH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 278.84 278 84
1|WHEELARCH FRT RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 278.84 :
1|FENDER BRACKET LOWER LH (CONSISTENT) BENT 15.79 15.79
1|FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 15.79 :
LABOUR
1|FENDER INSULATOR LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 130.84 .
1|FENDER INSULATOR RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 130.84 :
1|LOWER ARM LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 685.76 "
1|KNUCKLE ARM LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 846.98 -
1|KNUCKLE HUB+BEARING LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 497 69 <
1|ABSORBER FRT LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 360.54 -
1|AIR CLAENER LOWER (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 271.26 271.26
1|AIR CLEANER HOSE (CONSISTENT) DENTED 76.14 76.14
1|AUTO COMPUTER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 5,032.17 =
1|STEERING PUMP ELECTRIC (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 2,306.90 !
1|STEERING PINION RACK (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 441311 x
LABOUR
1|ENGINE HARNESS (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 4,084.54 :
1|SUBFRAME OUTER FRT (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 2,652.45 "
1|SUBFRAME BRACKET OUTER LH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 9236 -
LABOUR
1|SUBFRAME BRACKET OUTER RH (CONSISTENT) EEE%EJP;M SEE 92.36 =
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1|ENGINE UNDERTRAY (CONSISTENT) REPEATED 564.98 :
1|BASE BATTERY TRAY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 363.40 3
1|AIR CLEANER BOX (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 454 20 -
1|A/C CONDENSER (CONSISTENT) BENT 2,020.37 2,020.37
1|A/C CONDENSER GARNISH LH UPPER (CONSISTENT)  |SERVICEABLE 39,67 <
1|A/C CONDENSER GARNISH RH UPPER (CONSISTENT)  |SERVICEABLE 39.67 g
1|A/C CONDENSER GARNISH LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 58.81 -
1|A/C CONDENSER GARNISH RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 59.60 -
1|A/C PIPE CONDENSER TO COMPRESSOR (CONSISTENT) |SERVICEABLE 208.39 =
1|A/C PIPE CONDENSER TO EXPANSION VALVE SERVICEABLE 658.72 :
(CONSISTENT)
1|A/C PIPE COMPRESSOR (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 334.29 5
1|A/C PIPE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 658.72 -
1|A/C COMPRESSOR (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 2,684.61 "
1|AIR COOLER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 792.60 2
1|AIR INTERCOOLER HOSE (LONG) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,014.13 "
1|AIR INTERCOOLER HOSE (SHORT) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 375.14 -
1| TRANSMISSION COOLER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,219.30 .
1| TRANSFERMISSION COOLER PAD (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 17.96 I
1|RADIATOR (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,202.20 ;
2|RADIATOR STUD UPPER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 14.41 :
2|RADIATOR BUSH UPPER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 50.12 .
2|RADIATOR MTG LOWER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 55.85 :
1|RADIATOR FAN COWLING (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE B20.54 =
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 967.36 o
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,479.46 =
1|RADIATOR TANK (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 324 62 -
1{RADIATOR HOSE UPPER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 240.56 ;
1|RADIATOR HOSE LOWER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 491.18 -
1|RADIATOR TANK HOSE (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 61.18 3
1|WINDSCREEN FRT (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,364.06 .
1|SEATBELT LH (CONSISTENT) JAMMED 2,937.80 2,937.80
1|SEATBELT RH (CONSISTENT) JAMMED 2,925.37 2,925.37
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1|SEATBELT BUCKLE LH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 984.13 -
1|SEATBELT BUCKLE RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 549 80 .
1|PASSENGER AIRBAG (CONSISTENT) BURST 3,412.40 3,412.40
1|STEERING AIRBAG (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 2,525.75 b
1|AIRBAG COMPUTER (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 1,258 82 -
1|AIRBAG SENSOR (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 724,83 724,63
1|AIRBAG SENSOR (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 289.30 289.30
1|ROTARY SWITCH (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 1,253.11 1,253.11
1|DASHBOARD (CONSISTENT) TORN 4,900.54 4,900.54
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -8,126.42 -3,251.97
73137.87 29 267.77
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|1SET RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP (SN) (CONSISTENT) |NECESSARY 52,00 52.00
1|SET BUMPER CLIP FRT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 66.00 66.00
1|BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT LH (SN} (CONSISTENT} NOT NECESSARY 12.00 -
1|BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT LH (SN} (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 10.50 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 12.00 :
1|BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 10.50 -
1|TOW COVER FRT (SN} (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 14.50 -
1|SET RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 16.00 -
1|SET BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP (SN} (CONSISTENT) |NECESSARY £9.00 69.00
1|SET FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70,00 -

{CONSISTENT)
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL NUT (SN) (CONSISTENT) |SERVICEABLE 20.00 -
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD (SN} SERVICEABLE 30.00 -

({CONSISTENT)
1|SET WHEELARCH CLIP FRT LH (SN} (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 30.50 30.50
1|SET WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 29.40 -
1|CAP HUE LH FRT (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 35.00 -
1|RIM LH FRT [(SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 385.00 -
1|TYRE LH FRT (SN} ({CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 330,00 =
1|CAP HUE RH FRT (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 35.00 2
1|RIM RH FRT (SN} (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 385.00 -

Report Ref No. CC3/ASM17023838/Kpads2
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1|TYRE RH FRT (SN} (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 330.00 -
1|SET FRONT LICENCE PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN) DENTED B80.00 45.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|DOOR STICKER "6555-3333" LH (SN} (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY B0.00 -
1|DOOR STICKER "6555-3333" RH (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 <
2,182.40 262.50
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 4,200.00 500.00
NECESSARY PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS, ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME. INCLUSIVE
OF THE REPAIR OF HORN BRACKET, HEADLAMP PANEL
FRT RH, BONNET HINGE RH, CHASSIS PANEL
REINFORCEMENT FRT LH, FENDER PANEL FRT RH,
FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH, STEERING PINION RACK,
SUBFRAME BRACKET OUTER LH AND SUBFRAME
BRACKET OUTER RH.
TOWING FEES. 120.00 50.00
TO APPLY PAINT PROTECTION SYSTEM (PPS) MAINTAIN |[NOT NECESSARY 380.00 e
AND ENHAMCEMENT
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 4,500.00 1,100.00
PORTION.
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. 170.00 60.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR FITTINGS, TRIMINGS, |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 .
GARNISH, FITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENABLE REPAIR
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT NECESSARY 220.00 2
WHEEL ALIGNMENT.
TO TRANSFER OF TIRE, RIM AND ON WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 .
BALANCING
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED. 170.00 20.00
TO PULL AND JACK OUT CHASSIS FRAME AND NOT MECESSARY 380.00 -
CORRECT IT TO SYMMETRICAL POSITION WITH THE AID
OF HYDRAULIC PNEUMATIC JACK.
LABOUR CHARGE TO MOUNT AND DISMOUNT VEHICLE |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
ON JIG BENCH, TO FACILITATE REPAIR.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT AIR BAG SYSTEM AND RESET. 480.00 240.00
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT FRONT END SUSPENSION, |NOT NECESSARY 380,00 -

UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS, FINAL CHECKING AND

TESTING.
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TO REMOVE AND RENEW POWER STEERING PUMP, QIL 440.00 50.00
COOCLER PIPE AND FINAL CHECKING AMD TESTING.
TO DROP DIESEL TANK, PIPES, HOSES TO FACILITATE |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 .
BODYWORK REPAIR, FINAL CHECKING AND TESTING
TO VACUUM, REPLACE, REFIX AND RECHARGE AIR 380.00 100.00
CONDEMSER
TO REPLACE , REFIX AND TOP UP COOLANT FOR 170.00 50.00
RADIATOR
TOVACUUM, REPLACE, REFIX ANMD RECHARGE AIR 170.00 50.00
INTERCOOLER.
TO TRANSFER OF FENMDER FITTINGS, ATTACHMENTS NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
13.640.00 2,630.00

GRAND TOTAL 88,960.27 32,160.27
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 17,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) i
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Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Clienl named on the front page of this Report.




