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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3567 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607108R GST Reg. Mo, 18.0807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

QOBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

1 RAFFLES QUAY #29-10 SOUTH
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583

Ref : CC3/QBE17023836/K1hb3
oweezor [N
Code: QBE

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. GBB 82780 Veh. Inspected SHD 11898
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 151122017
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer : Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
|
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/12/2017 Inspection Date 16/12/12017
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




g ¥y ou Aufo

- Sl = Consullants

B B AR T Pte Lid Company Registration No 199607 198R
21 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UKL INDL STRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 40933 TEL ¢ (M) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Your ref:  To Be Advised Date: 15.12.2017

Qur ret: CC3/QBE17023836/K 1hb3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s QBE INSURANCE (INTERNATIONAL) LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD11895
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on_14.12.2017
at the premises of M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd _and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S% 2,798.35

Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 620.00

"Check” Items Amount : 5% -

Market Value : S% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S% -

Nett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage: . l,::(;ﬂ:?g .
The vehicle sustained damages at the - =
Rear Portion R Saaa

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

— e —— R ——————
From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com:=
Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 3:.05 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto); Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8278D (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHD11895
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/0BE17023836/K1hb3) on 14.12 2017
Attachments: GBBE27AD pdf
T Thu P&
chicle should read as GBR22 730 not GBBR279D, informed workshap to do the améndment

ghifgbe.com

We create insurance soltions for

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuta) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 12 March, 2018 11:48 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@qgbe.com:
Subject: RE: Direct Settlerment - Accident Invalving GBBE278D (01 : QBE - TEA) AND SHD11895 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/0BE17023836/K1hb3) on 14.12.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards
Shu Pai] Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366-0065 | emall: shupei@ [kkautocom | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51 Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933]

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuta)

sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 6:12 PM

Ta: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@agbe.com=

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.camz=; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<Ashersng@lkkauto.com>; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@qgbe.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB&278D (Ol : QBE - TBA} AND 5HD11895 [TP : LKK REF -
£C3/QBE17023836/K1hb3) on 14.12.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action,

Thank you.

eit Regards
Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{308933)

From: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman [mailto:syaheeda.othman@abe. com]
Sent: Tuesday, 19 December 2017 9:29 AM

To: lenny Tah <jenny.tohig

Ce: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupel@ikkauto.coms; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin
al@kkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8278D (Ol : QBE - TBA} AND SHD11895 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/0BE17023836/K1hb3) on 14.12.2017

be.com>

Hi lenny,

Ploase assist.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [inailto:shupei@lkkaute com)
Sent: Friday, 15 December, 2017 5:48 PM



To: lenny Toh <ienny tohi@gbe com>; Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@gbe.com:>
Cc: Wic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@ikkauto com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto coms; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

<Ashersng@Elkkauto.coms
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8278D (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHD11895 (TP : LKK REF -
€C3/QBRE17023836/K1hb3) on 14.12.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
wWe refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 11898 at M/s Premier Automotive Services
Pte Lid = Changi.

Enclosed [or your perusal is:
« TP GIA report
= Estimated cost of repair
=  Preliminary Advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.
Thank you.

Gest Regards

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phore: 636G-0055 | emall: shupei@kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

11, Pava bibi Industrial Park, Ubl avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



Vehicle Registration Detail Information

Enquire Vehicle Registration Details

Owner Particulars

HE‘.I_CJPESSpWCﬂmpany Cart 200304575H

Owner ID Type: Company

Ownar Name: PREMIER TAXIS PTE. LTD.

Registerad Addrass: 23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #04-03 SINGAPORE 488443
MMailing Address: -

Birth Date; ¥

Vehicle Particulars

\ehicle MNo.: SHD11885

Previous Vehicle No.; -
Effective Date of Cwnership: 28 Feb 2017

Original Regn Date: 28 Feb 2017

Registration Date: 28 Feb 2017

Year of Manufactura: 2018

Vehicle Type: Public Transport Taxi (Mator Car)
Wehicle Scheme; Taxi (Company)

ehicle Attachment 1! Ajr-Con (Taxi)

Vehicle Attachment 2: -

Vehicle Attachment 3. -

Vehicle Make: HYUNDAL

Vehicle Modeal: 130 GDH 1.6 TCI 5DR DCT
Primary Colour; Silver

Secondary Colour: -

Passenger Capacity: 4

Chassis No.: TMAD2B1UNVHIT125043
Engine No.: ' D4FBGZ115762

Egghlnngﬁ Capacity/Power 1589 o -

Maximum Fower Ouipul 100.0 kW (134 bhp)
Propellant: Diesel

Max Unladen Welght: 1496 kg

Maximum Laden VWeight 1840 kg

Open Market Value: £20,951.00

PARF Eligikiity: Yies

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 27 Feb 2025

Minimum PARF Benefit: £8,280.00

Mo. of Transfers: o

IU Label No.: 1050704311

COE No. 2017022801003635N
COE Expiry Data: 27 Feb 2025

COCE Category: A - Car (up to 1600cc & 87kW (130bhp))

COE Registration Category: A - Car (up to 1800cc & 57hW (130ehp))

Lbbaams ol Vom mmes mredTon Bl fantinm foanenhahistaRy Damar?BT INCTION TD=F1R801087 .
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446676 / 65446680 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

14-Dec-17

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR HYUNDAI 130(A) WAGON REGN NO: SHD 1189 D

1pe Rear bumper X" egr 5 447,00
1pc Rear bumper sponge »< 5 78.20
1pc Rear bumper reinforcement X< ] B15.64
1 pc Rear bumper reinforcement centre 4 3 79.20
2 pos Rear bumper n/s & ofs side bracket @ $52.20 \f; 3 104,40
$ 152544
Less 20% % 305.09
§ 122035
SINETT
1 set Rear bumper clips X 5 48.00
1 set Reverse sensor ~ 5 EW 2a0
Sundry $ 55.9( 2=
To dismantle and replace reverse sensor and test system 5 gp-ﬂﬁ" 2=
To labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including to knock-out, straighten, repair,
reshape of end panel, etc. 5 ﬁw e
To putty and spray painting on the rear bumper, end panel 5 458116 ' F 2
To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels ;3 120-00 - )C

Total $ 279835

( ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST )

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.

/Ca o "é/(/f/ o L S ._
% I Q—/"? /6o I_Aiv: ! -.:
D ey it -
/ﬁ’—f-j},. /Z‘f'-""ldld_ﬂ' —




PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

TEL: 63446676 / 63446689 FAX: 02141511
GST REG:200707743D

CO. REG:200707743D

14-Dec-17

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR HYUNDAI 130(A) WAGON REGN NO: SHD 1189 D

SINGAPORE 48643

1pc Rear bumper X7 tp~
[ 4
1pc Rear bumper sponge < e b
1pc Rear bumper reinforcemeant
I

1pc Rear bumper reinforcement centre y‘r
2 pes Hear bumper n/s & of/s side bracket @ $52.20
SINETT
1 set Rear bumper clips an

.x J’M
1 set Reverse sensor  »~~

Sundry  yeu

Jt

To dismantle and replace reverse sensor and lest sysiem

To labour charge for dismantle and renaw the accigent
damaged paris. Including to knock-out, straighten. repair

reshape of end panel, etc

e
To putty and spray painting on the rear bumper, end pang|

To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced pangls

{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO G5T

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES,

I'rc_g /H‘q

/% / @/Lf/;# / bo s’/ﬁn

Ly

2 ﬂ";’;

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUL 2 201-02

Less 20%

Total

s 447.00
3 79.20
s B15.64
S 79.20
$ 104.40

1.525.44

]
S 30508
:

1,220.35

] 48.00

5 zgu.ar'z-m
5 apxu’h
s ;wﬁ" le

s 55000 2e

s 4o (&
5 1zm::i“)‘:‘M

5 278835
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Vic (LKKAuto)

#

From: Gary Shi <gary.shi@premiertaxi.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 5:13 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHD11895 & GBB8278D on 14.12.17 (QBE case) LKK
REF CC3/QBE17023836/K1hb3

Attachments: SHD11895 - DV.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Vic,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client’s part and driver of SHD11895,
our client agreed to direct settle the above claims at $850.00

We enclosed hereby Discharge voucher & ATA for your kind attention, original copies will pass to Mr Kalvin.

Kindly let us have your settlement sum of $5890.00 in our favour — Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd within 14days
from the date hereof.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damage only.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

fAddress: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.5g

Confidentiality Motice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipientis} and may contain confidential ar
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution 15 prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

#4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION
wh

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 4:51 PM

To: Gary 5hi

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHD11855 £ GBB8278D on 14.12.17 (QBE case) LKK REF
CC3/QBE17023836/K1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Gary,

wWe refer further to our below email.



purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’'s mandate and we propose a global sum of $890.00 (all in) to settle your

client's claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and ATA then forward back to us a scan copy for payment
processing.

Thank you.

“Blegse note that our above affer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the gccident. Our affer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resalve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2066 | email: vicalpeh@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

3174 g

Save the Earth Print only when necessery”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August, 2018 1:06 PM

To: 'Gary Shi'

Ce: Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHD11895 & GBB8278D on 14.12.17 (QBE case) LKK REF
CC3/QBE17023836/K1hb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Gary,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that till date, we are yet to receive mandate approval from our principal.

We will continue to follow up on the matter.

Thank you.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref CC3/QBE1T023B36/K1 hb3n2
D o voe [N
Code : QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBB 82780 Veh. Inspected SHD 11898
Policy No. B-VD008225-MVA-RO0D3 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC010993 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 14122017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 130 c.c 1582
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. TMADZ2B1UVHI125042 Colour SILVER
Odometer 104481 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 MAXAIS 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHIGLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/1212017 |Inspection Date 14/1212017
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi indusirial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 11895
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty Pt Workshop ($)) $)
EEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 447.00
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 78.20 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 815.64 =
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT CENTRE SERVICEABLE 79.20 .
2| REAR BUMPER N/S & O/S SIDE BRACKET @$52 20 SERVICEABLE 104 40 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -305.09 "
1.220.35 -
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 48.00 E
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|SUNDRY (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 20.00
378.00 220.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE AND REPLAGE REVERSE SENSOR AND 80.00 20.00
TEST SYSTEM
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE 550.00 200.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS.INCLUDING TO KNOCK-
OUT STRAIGHTEN,REPAIR, RESHAPE OF END
PANEL ETC INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BUMPER
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON THE REAR 450.00 180.00
BUMPER, END PANEL.
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 120.00
REPLACED PAMELS.
1,200.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,798.35 620.00

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS

1

620.00|

Report Ref No. CC3/QBE17023836/K1hb3n2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator
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HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY T0 THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of tha Client named on the front page of this Report.




