Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 February 2018 12:10 PM

To: ‘Janet Tan'

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: <VOICE RECORDING> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7100M (Ol :
EQI - DM17H002820/JT) AND SJS8001B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI17023826/Aka3) on
10/12/2017

Attachments: SJS8001B AUDIO RECORDING.M4A

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Janet,
We refer to your email below.

TP reported he was making a right turn into Farrer Road with green light on his favour when Ol vehicle suddenly
collided onto the right portion of his vehicle. TP further reported that she recorded the tele-conversation between
her and OI PIC (Ms Pearlyn) pertaining to the above accident. Enclosed copy of the voice recording for your perusal.

Ol reported that he was travelling straight within his lane along Farrer Road towards Lornie Road when TP vehicle
collided onto his vehicle. OID further stated that TPD was making a right turn from Empress Road prior to the
collision and no injuries were involved at that material time. No photos / CCTV footage / PIR provided by Ol till date.

We had spoken to Ol PIC where she confirmed that OID was travelling at the said location as reported and was
unaware of any voice recording on the above matter. We confirmed from both parties that there is no PIR from
Traffic Police till date and our insured will revert to us for an update (if any).

For your further instructions.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 January 2018 3:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7100M (Ol : EQI - DM17H002820/JT) AND SJS8001B (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/EQI17023826/Aka3) on 10/12/2017

Dear Mei Kwan/Zaini

Ol report as attached. In the absence of evidence and or final police investigation result, liability down on third
party.

Regards,



