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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
OwneriDType —— " Singapore NRIC - -
" OwnerID LSS T e S
Vehicle Details
VemdeNo T 7 skmssooG -
s T 7 S D BN Be R
Intended De-registration Date 31 Dec 2017
“Vehicle Make T mazpa = o '
| VehideModel - MAZDA3 SP L6L A/T ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR
Primary Colour Blue _1
Manufacturing Year 2012
|- Erginete. Z6A63739 "SR o
" Chassis No. IM&BL10Z2C0343236 B‘,& -
A ] e TR G I X
" Open Market Value T $17.47200 Ji T T ’ﬂ“”j
" Original Registration Date o T 29Nov2012 s
" FistRegistrationDate  29Nov2012 R 1
Transfer Count . = T o ' ' ===
" Actual ARF Paid — T T s1zano0 o |
OPC Cash Rebate Details |
"~ OBCCashRebateENgblty  Ne e ]
OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility Expiry Date e o T e
OPCCahRebateAmoumt - —
Intended PARF Rebate Details
~PARFEmBWY Y e = SR
~ DARF Eligibility Expiry Date © 28Nov2022 —
“TPARFRebateAmount a2
Intended COE Rebate Details
;EDEWWM 28 Nov 2022 | \
COECategory T 7 A-Car(1600cc&below) — 1;_?’{7:*"’
COE Period(Years) 10 .
“QPPad o — seazer00
"~ COERebateAmowt — 2940900
Total Rebate Amount ) —saismoo

htlps:hfwl.lta.gmr.5@1Wacﬁwmmhmﬂywﬂwmmm 14/Dec/2017
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sGCAanMary. Conm
THE ORLY PLACE FOR SMART CAR RUVIAS
Mazda 3 Used Vehicle List (5 vehicles)

Mazda 3 1.6A 5P (0PC) - - 29-MN-2012 1558 ec . Grar] Gromth Avalinbls

Babate Ampued As GF 31/10/2017 15 $40E30, fload Tak TO 28711/ 2017,
Office N, - 62233007
Jaraeny Lim -

Mazda 3 1.6A 58 $60,800 S10.470 fyr 12-Mow-2012  1,59Fcc GEOO0RM  Hue Yong Credit Preltd  Avallable
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Bl Tren TI Api- 18 1009 Aceidpnt Fre. Call N

Office Mo, - 67450825
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Mizda 3 164 5P 355,800 9,740 fyr 02017 58S 99,500 km JetapHid Auto Enarprises  Available

zW.Wmmmmwmwmwmu.wmwrmmm-mm-mnwhmm
Tryopughou, Py With A Pesoe OF Mind Chn Arrange For Qush

Office No. - 684711
Liwson - BFLGAEES | Mr Ho - B77EB4
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Celine Fﬂ !I.Kﬂutu!

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 3:24 PM

To: ‘Bing Xian UM’

Ca ‘Poh Keng TEO'; 'Leng Tat SEE'; "Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM'
Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 14/12

Deaar Bing Xian,

Refer to our tele-conversation, please ignore the previous valuation.

The Valuation of vehicle as below

GrandStand
1. SKH3500G  MV: $48K FS $41.9K

As at Degember 2017

ltest Regards,

Celine Fong

KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

pthone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong @ idauto.co | fix: 6R56-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(40893:1)

From: Bing Xian LIM [mailto:bingxianlim@dbs.com]
Sent; Thursday, 14 December, 2017 3:29 PM

T Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong @lkkauto.com>
Cz: Poh Keng TEO <pohkeng@dbs.com>; Leng Tat SEE <lengtatsee@dbs.com>; Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM

< eremyzhiwellim@dbs.com>
Subject: Valuation Request @ 14/12

Hi Celine,

Co need your assistance to obtain valuation for the following:

CrandStand
1. SKH3500G

Log-cards faxed over

Thank youl

Eing Xlan

CBG/WM Credit Collection
Fisk Management Group
DBS Bank Lid

[ND: +65 8878 2011



Celine Fong (LKKAuto

From: Celine Fong (LKKAUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 11:03 AM

To: 'Bing Xian LIM'

Cc: Poh Keng TEQ; Leng Tat SEE; Jeremy Zhi Wei LIM
Subject: RE: Valuation Request @ 14/12

Dear Bing Xian,

The Valuation of vehicle as below:

GrandStand
1. SKH3500G MV: 853K FS: $41.8K

As at December 2017

Hest Regands,

Celine Fong

1L KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefongeelkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Indistrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oze-25 | 5(408933)

From: Bing Xian LIM [mailto:bingxanlim@dbs.com]

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 3:29 FM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefeng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Poh Keng TEO <pohkeng@dbs.com>; Leng Tat SEE <lengtatsee @dbs.com>; Jeremy Zhi Wel LIM
<jaremyzhiwellim@dbs.com>

Subject: Valuation Request @ 14/12

Hi Caline,
Do need your assistance to obtain valuation for the following:

ndStand
1. SKH3500G

Log-cards faxed over.

Thank youl

Bing Xlan

CBG/MWM Credit Collection
Risk Management Group
DBS Bank Ltd

DiD: +65 6878 BO11

Fax; +65 6878 9010
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