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J LV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

s o 51 Ubl Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park_ Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199807198R GST Reg No 18-9607128-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Autormobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CCAAXAITO23TTOMead
A TOWERSINGAPORE 0691 owe:rwzzor |1V
Code . AXAZ
| Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKV 4738H Veh. Inspected SLL BOS5Y
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 141212017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Stearing
Brakes Modificatian
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 101122017 Inspection Date 181212017
Survey held at ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
25, DEFU LANE 9
SINGAPORE 538266
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NO1 AUTHORISED REPAIRS




Allswell Moto;" Traders

25 Defu Lane 9. Singapore 539266
Tel : +635 6679 1146 email h"ft-"ll'l.wr- Imotor
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- Wilson (LKKAuto)

From: OOL Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 18 December, 2017 1:50 PM
To: Wilson (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: SLLE055Y - Addendum

Wilson,

See correspondences..

Truly

001, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapens $392565
Mol =635 6679 | 146
Mol 68 9147 1545
nad: penipillaweilmator com g

--—-—-- Forwarded message
From: O0I, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Date: Mon, Dec 18, 2017 at 1:49 PM
Subject: Re: SLL6055Y - Addendum

To: "Asher Sng (LKKAuto)" <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Ce: "Admin-D (LKKAuto)" <admin-d@lkkauto.com>, Edmund Ng <edmund@allswellmotor.com.sg>,

Mark Mark <mark@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Hi Asher,
Thank you for your email..

Without Prejudice - Statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear? Please emphasize the word
clear?

As such, we would also love for direct settlements with 3rd party Insurers unless stated otherwise.

Thanks..

Truly

OOI, Ben

Allpwell Motor Traders
2% Defu Lone 9
Singepare 335266

L =k H:EI-I | ig
o A8 SIST R84S



» On Mon, Dec 18, 2017 at 12:32 PM. Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

Thank You.

Besr Regards,
Asher Sng | Coce Handle:

LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; 48414051 | emoll shenng@ikkaulo com | fox: 4741-4108
8k 31, Foya Wi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenye |, BO2-2% | S/408933)



From: OO0I, Ben [mallto; allswellmotor 7
* Sent: Monday, 18 December, 2017 11:56 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@kkauto.com>
'Ce: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; Edmund Ng <edmund @allswellmotor.com.sg>; Mark Mark

<mark@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Subject: SLLEOSSY - Addendum

Dear Asher,

As spoken...

See antached addendum made for SLL6055Y.

Truly

OO01I, Ben

Adlswell Motor Traders

ad Dl Jane 9



Wilson {LKI{A'uth -

From: OO Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 2 April, 2018 6:13 PM

To: Wilson (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLL 6055Y - FINALISATION

noted with thanks..

Will proceed bill to AXA...

Truly

QOI, Ben

Allswell Moter Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapone $39266
Miive +65 6679 | 146
Mabile: +85 9147 BHS

On Mon, Apr 2, 2018 at 6:12 PM, Wilson (LKKAuto) <wilson@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ben,

Finaised the above @$400 / | day repair.

Rdgs.

Wilson



Print Sent Message

This mail Is associated with :

*SLLG05S5Y (C0462842)
[SKV4T38H]
TF
ALLSWELL LEASING & LIMOUSINE PTELTD
Dec 10 2017 1:00PM
[DE, COSTA JOHN ALVIN]
Allswell Motor Traders

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (LKK_HQ), sent on 12/04/2019 16:03 PM.
To sawtheng khor@axa.com.sg

cc AXA_SG; ashersng@ikkauto.com

Subject  Re: New TP Assignment - C0462842/GA136384

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when insured reversed hit third party vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (If any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer at $510.00 (all-in).

For your approval In merimen please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | emall: ashersng@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408%33)

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 13/12/2017 01:30 PM

Subject: New TP Assignment - C0462842/GA136384

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,
Please survey the vehicle and proceed for direct settlement If damages consistent.

Workshop Name: Allswell Motor Traders
Policy Number: GA136384

Vehicle Number: SLL60SSY

Date of Accldent:10/12/2017

Estimated Claim Amount:

Excess: 0.00

Claim Handler Name: Flossie Ang




Print Received Message

This maill is associated with :

*SLLBDSSY (CO462842)
[SKV4TIBH]
T‘P
ALLSWELL LEASING & LIMOUSINE PTE LTD
Dec 10 2017 1:00PM
[DE, COSTA JOHN ALVIN]
Allswall Motor Traders

From
To

Subject

AXA Insurance Pto Lid (HQ) (AXA_SG). sant on 23/04/2019 20:03 PM.

LKK_HQ
Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($$510.00) - SLLE0S5Y - Claim Handler: Khor Saw Theng

;Appruved:Siﬂﬁﬂﬂ,




5 i re Pre Lt
Attm: Motor Claims Dept

LETTER OF DEMAND
Dear Sirf Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLL 6055Y AND SKV 4738H ALONG/AT
PARLIAMENT PLACE ON 117122017

We understand that you are the insurer of SKV 4738H vehicle.
We are instructed by the owner of motor vehicle SLL 6055Y to write, negotiate and setile the

¢laim on their behalf for the abovementioned accident. We therefore propose to claim from
you as follows: -

l. Cost of repair (w/GST) S§ 428.00
2. Loss of Use (1day x $80) S§  80.00
& LTA Search Fee S§ 2.00

TOTAL S§  510.00

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully




-

Asher !‘ma (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 4:39 PM

To: ‘lehnadc@gmail.com’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 4738H AND SLL 6055Y ALONG OLD PARUAMENT PL

ON 10/12/2017

l ’ Aufa
! - -[-, Consultarifs
M B A B Pio Lo

S1 UBIAVE [, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (063) 62564315
22 DEC 2017
DE COSTA JOHN ALVIN

Dear Sirf Mdm

OUR REF  : CC4/AXA17023770/Weal
YOUR REF :SKV 4738H
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV 4738H AND SLL 6055Y ALONG OLD PARLIAMENT PL ON 10/12/2017

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS acting on behalf of the owner of SLL
6055Y against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had reversed and hit
the Third Party vehicle SLL 6055Y. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct
of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7
days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
ashersna@Ilkkauto com within 7 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at our reporting centre.

The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to
keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

- 8 ® ® ® = @8

H



w w

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior
knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at

ashersng@I|kkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersna@|kkauto.com

c.c. AXA Insurance Ple Lid (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)



Allswell Leasing & Limousine Pte Ltd

100, Sultan Plaza. #02-41. Singapore 199001
C/o 25. Defu Lane 9. Singapore 539266

Date: f"fﬂ) }ﬂﬁ

Discharge Voucher / Payment Authorisation

Our Claim reference number: 'DF,RA ->605

Attention:

1/We hereby certify that the repairs to my/our vehicles bearing license

number plate : SlLeoss E/ which was involved in an accident on

w has been completed by Allswell Motor Traders to my/our
satisfaction.

1/We agreed that all 3+ party claim payment to the workshop for

repairs, replace and re-spray works shall be made solely to Allswell

Name: NG Boon Chin, Edmund

SELL
Company Stamp: @
Y=

Motor Traders at 25, Defu Lane 9. S 539266

Signature:

-{‘:f’.*‘.r m‘ﬁt



redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF : CDAE2842
INSURED : DE COSTA JOHN ALVIN

HARGE VOUCHER

We/l LIMOUSINE PTE LTD, NRIC NO. hereby agree to accept
the sum of [FIVE HUNDRED AND TEN ONLY.] [55510.00] to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as
full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind Including damages for personal injuries and
damages to property and all costs and expenses that we/| have or may have against the said AXA
INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver of mator vehicle no. [SKV 4738H] as a result of an

accident at [PARLIAMENT PLACE] on [10/12/2017] of which we/l werefwas the
hirer/owner/driver/pillion/Passenger/ insurer of motor vehicle [SLL 6055Y].

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for all claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l have or may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. [SKV 4738H] in connection directly or
Indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l arefam the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect | this settlement.

it is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. [SKV 4738H]

Dated this >S dayof__ A‘:PI‘TT 2019
CJHJTH&HF'S Signature : wﬁ
NRIC nol/ Company stamp ;2 I 3STHTZ
ﬂccupalllnn.-’ Business :
Address )5, Dedy Lane 4 0) S392¢2
Telephohe No. . bLFa11ub
Witness's Name .G e
Witness's Signature C“(-’Lﬂ‘-*'-:
Witness's NRIC No. . GrssygesP .

AXA, Insurance Fie Lid (Company Reg. No. 198503312M)

8 Shemion|Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore DESH11

Customer Centre #8101

Tol +B5 GBS0 4BBH Fas: +65 6335 2522 Webuits: www.iaa.com sy



A ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
e=gll 25, Defu Lane 9, Singapore 539286
tooe plll GST Reg No.: S3152889) / Co Reg No. 53192889

Email: benfallswelimotor comaeg

BillTo : AXAInsurance Tax Invoice Defu-2605
[Motor claims Department) Date 19/3/2019
Terms C.0.D
Ref: 3rd party claim MT/0973400
Description Oty | Amoont before GS1 G5T Amaunt | Amount indude G5T
Allswall Leasing & Limousine Pte Ltd
Vehicle # : SLLBO55Y
Date of accident: 10.12.2017
Repaired, Replaced and Resprayed 1 5400.00 528.00 S428.00
Towing 0 NA NA NA
TP Insurer Search 1 52.00 NA 52.00
GIARMC - SAS Report 0 NA NA NA
Loss of Use @580.00 / per day 1 S80.00 NA SB0.00
|Pre-Repalr Survey Loss of Use 0 NA NA NA
Replacement vehicle 0 NA NA NA
Survey report fees 0 NA NA NA
Singapore Dallars : Sub Total | Excluding GST ) 5482.00|
EIVE hunidred Len orlly GST payable @7% of 5400.00 m-ﬂﬂl
Total ( Inclusive of GST ) $510.00|

Authorised Signature



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 1

-»-CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Dirett Settlement

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
| Casa  [motifies [Est Submitted  |Ad) Assigned | Adj Rpe Ad] Supmittes | ins Auth'ed | Status
| ] | Pendl
— | 13 Dec 2017 ‘ ‘ s ki 5$400.00 $3400.00 ng for Survey
! | I-HMJMI lﬂl:ml !ﬂn!pll I:-,.cﬁ‘:“‘l |

Main Reference Clalm Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - [[Created by insurer]
Insured. DE, COSTA JOHN ALVIN, 1D: 517040832, Tel- +6593806973

ALLSWELL LEASING & LIMOUSINE PTE LTD, Co. Reg. Mo.: 2014325417

';vehldﬂ:.eu . 130/12/2017 13:00 - .59
Mo SELRT Date of Loss: |14 46 Months and 29 Days From LTA Reg Cate (Man ¥r)]

(Claim Type: | TP / C0462842 :‘f::"’;?_“' GA136384 [Comprehensive)

Main
| Claimant:

Policy Mo,
(Claimant):
S Exess: 550.00
L parer | Allswall Motor Traders (HQ) 25 Cefu Lane §, 535266 Defu Lane - Tel: 86791146

I’:‘;"ﬂr"f AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6318 7288 .. [Handied by Khor Saw Theng - 6880 4754]

Ciimants NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Insurer:
Adpuster LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled by Teo Cheng Ming Wilson| ... [Final Rpt due
. 22/12/2017]
Driwer/Clsto
?Iun ) LAE KWAN HOONG MARCUS (26 / Male) . NRIC: S9122878E. Tel: +6598455433 Emalli
BT i

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All | Compase Case Mail |

* AXA_SG [23/04/2019); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$510.00) - SLLED55Y - Claim Handler: Khor Saw The...
« AXA_SG ([13/12/2017): New TP Assignment - CO4G2842/GA136384

SKVATIEH 5095581315

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ wiew All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | cComplete |

Due Date Priority  Type Tash Group Subjeey Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 6/5/2019



Mernmen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SLL6055Y (C0462842)
[SKV4738H]
T
ALLSWELL LEASING & LIMOUSINE PTE LTD
Dec 10 2017 1:00PM
[DE, COSTA JOHN ALVIN]
Allswell Motor Traders
Uplead Documents | Upload Photos |  Compose bew Letter | Upioad vides |  upkaad Audio | View [Varw i Browser v ]
Letters/ Correspondences [Toerveoe 1¥] B4
[No_[Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
i1 |(Dram) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown 0 Edit
‘.‘_wm h 1 per page :‘ i g-
Nao |Finslred On |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail| Print |
1 |03/04/18 10:26 | Adjuster Immediate Advice @ | cadrM |
‘Photos/Images . Soerpoge [~
N [Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auta Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |03/04/18 10:26 LKK Survey Photo. Load POF
F 03/04/18 10:26 LEK Resurvey Photo, Load POF
Documentation iporpage v} BA
No | Finaleed On AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ} Thumbnail | Print
1 131247 13:22 EMALL_ARS Load PDF
2 1W12/17 1372 |PHOTO_ABS D waiws || A
3 131217 1322 | SLLGOSSY TP GIA_ABS = Load FOF
4 1W12/17 1322 | SKVA73BM INS GIA_ABS ) | Losd POF
|5 131217 13:30 Certificate of Insurance -GA13G384 [« BN
(6 [1311/17 13:30 | Certificats Schedule -GA136384 ) | Loadror
No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 18/12717 12131 TP AMENDED GIA REPORT Lowd POF
3 | 1B/12/17 12:52 Ol AMENDED GIA REPORT Load POF |
3 (221317 16640 | LETTER TO 01 Load POF 1
4 |03/04/18 10:22 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POE |
5 |12/04/19 16:01 Immediate Advice with Mandate Load POF |
6 06/05/19 16:00 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
7 | D6/05/19 16:00 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
§ | 06/05/19 16:00 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
§ |D6/0519 16:00 LOD | Load POF
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Pt ﬂ

Thare are no document checklists configuned.

Show Remarks To: ] Handiing Insurer
BolE RamEsks BhE PrivEli ol e iR 8 D0 el Bee gt e
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

[ Vehicle No: SKV4738H (Insd veh) Model: MW 5201 2.0 (A)
SLLB0S5Y (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |10/12/2017

Global Sum Settement || [ | Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate '3 620.60
Final Repair Cost '8 428.00
Loss of Use 5 BO.OD 1.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) ‘5 0.00 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee ‘5 200
Others: '3 0.00
4
Final Settlement Sum '$ 510.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registerad? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registerad Workshop: Agreed Liahility 100 {96)

B Apphcable: Y N cenano Ma:
B) For GIA Registersd Workshop: ORAARERcabi: Yaa/ o -ROLAS ¢

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea’s Breakdown

1) | Allswell Motor Traders ' § 510.00
2) '8
3 4 -
06 May
JOANME LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docltr... 6/5/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {Co Reg, No: 169807 188R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 8#01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall; sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/AXA1T0237TT0MWEAIQZ

Date: 06/052018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AXA Insurance Ple Lid Policy No: GA136384
Clalmant Vehicle ¢\ sossy Insured Vehicle No : SKV4738H
Date of Loss: 10M 22017 MNature of Claim. P Claim Ma: CD482842
8] RIFTION & IDENTIFICATI
Reg No SLLBOSSY
Make & Model: BMW 5201, 2.0 (A) Engine No HIDDEN
Req. Date 11/03/2008 (Man, Year: 2008) Chassis No: WBANT12020CX209029
Colour Dark Grey Odomater 179081 km
Engine Capacity: 1995 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$) Markel Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable), Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls) Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 245/35Z R19 Rear Tyre Size; 275/30Z R19
Front Left Side Michelin 2 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 2 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 2 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 2 mm
The above viluew represant the mmaining fyre reads deptn
COSTOF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 580.00 400.00 180.00 31.03
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total [S§) 580.00 400.00 180.00 31.03
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 4060 28.00 1260 31.03
Nett Amount (5§) 620.60 428.00 192.60 31.03
+ Loss of Use (1.0 x S$80.00/day) (SS§) 80.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5§5) 200
Nett Liability (S$) 510.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 13122017
Date Inspected 18122017 Inspeciad At Allswell Molor Traders (HQ)
25 Defu Lane 9
Singapore 539266
Estimated Fenod of Repair; 1.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/5/2019
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Adjuster: Teo Cheng Ming Wilson Manager: Asher Sng Rong i

NOTE This reporf reprasentis our findings af the time and pisce of ingpection stefed hermin. Such ingpection has been camied oul to the bes! of our
knowisdge and abiity bul any other lability undar any offer circurmtences (s hemby sxpressly arcluded

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/5/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 08 Apr 2019)

Parts; 143 BMW 5201 2.0 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitled, no print-code for SLLBOSSY)

'?llldlty: Thesa estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimale pages, running page
| numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

(Further Info: tems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts
There are no new paris selected.
[ Reporl was unsubmiited during this prini-out. |

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/5/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING & PUTTY AND SAMA PAPER New 220.00 200.00
{RIGHT REAR FENDER)
2  RESPRAY DAMAGE PART (RIGHT REAR FENDER) New 360.00 200.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 580,00 400.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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