Zaini (LKK Auto)

—_————— —————we— e =
From: Jason Fastech Auto <jason@fastechauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 January, 2018 10:36 AM
To: Zaini (LKK Auto)
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)
Subject: RE: Your Ref: ¥P 5171E_ACCIDENT INVOLVING ¥P 5171B AND SIL 6725X ON
12/12/2017
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Without Prejudice

Dear Zaini,

We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum 55 1,750.00 (all in)

Thank you.

Best Regards

lason Tang

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445
jasonEfastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim {if any) of the owner/
claimant

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, January 3, 2018 5:03 PM

To: jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Your Ref: YP 5171B_ACCIDENT INVOLVING ¥YP 51718 AND SIL 6725 ON 12/12/2017

Your Ref: SIL 6725X% Without Prejudice
Qur Ref: CC4/EQUI17023761/Uka3

Dear Jason,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 5171B AND SJL 6725X ON 12/12/2017

We refer to the above matter.



For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at §51,750.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

“plaase note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should alsa not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant, Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Laini Kusainl | Case Handle

LKK Aute Consultants Ple Lid

DID: 4841-2132 | amail: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fox &741-4108

Blk 51. Payalbi Inclustricl Park, Ubt Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date: 20.12.2017

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SJL 6725X /! YP51T1IB ON  12.12.2017
We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SJL 6725X , which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no; YP 5171B . The vehicle owner has requested and

authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1y Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) s 1,605.00
2} Loss Of Use (3days X 5100} 5 300.00
37 GILA Search Result b3 2.00
_S 1,907.00
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:
a) Final Repair Invoice e) Vehicle Registration Log Card
b} I/C & Driving License 3 Letter of Authorisation, etc...

¢) GIA Report / GIA Search Result
d) Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to

any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you. |I

Yours faithfully, ;

J. I‘*W
Jason Tang (jason(@f: auto.com.sg)
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
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ST UBEAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEI S (GS) h2E6ISHL FAN : (06567414108

Our Ref: CCHEQI1T023761/Ukal
29 DECEMBER 2017

LIBERTY FURNITURE PTE LTD

113 EUNOS AVENLUE 3

#04-05 GORDON INDUSTRIAL BUILDING
SINGAPORE 409838

ATTN: HR / MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 5171B AND SJL 6725X ON 12,12.2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Zaini

(Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Zaini@lkkauto.com

c.c.  EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



Dﬁm 12.42.2017
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TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Tax Invaice ;20032

Daate 2122007
Vehicle No :SIL6T25X
Make/Model HONDA FIT

Chassis/Eng#
Accident Date ;12.12.2017
Claim No 1217- 20032
Aun: Motor Claims Department Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S5 1.500.00
E.&0.E. Total : 5% 1,500.00
GST@ 7% :_S$ 105.00
Amownr Due S8 i 1.605.00

.‘.' 1530

o

FASTECH AUTO PTE LD
All Invoices are subjected to GST




124132007 Involce
GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-187508
Date of Request: 13/12/2017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirlMadam,

Enquiry Date 13/12/2017
Enquiry By KCA USER 1
TP Vehicle No.  YP5171B
Accident Date 12/12/201

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
YP5171B EQ Insurance Company Ltd 20/12/2016-19/12/2017 6223 9433
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https:ifsingapore. marimen comiclaims/index.cim7lusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&refid=16670614CFID=2514662TA&CFTOKEN=217...

i



121372017 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MAN;&.GEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-17-187508
Date of Request: 13/12/2017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 13/12/2017
Enquiry By KCA USER 1
TP Vehicle No. YP5171B
Accident Date  12/12/2047
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque

https:ifsingapore.merimen.comiclaimsindex.cfm ?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&refid=1667061&CFID=2514662T&CFTOKEN=21T7...
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