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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC17023758/Uuald
32334%?#55 ONCOURSESINGAPORE 109555 D2t¢’ 14122017 N“lewmm
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SN 4651C Veh. Inspected SKW 5096F
Policy No. Z17VP05013207 Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. 171171 TVPD5/020273 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 141122017
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Cdometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyree
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre M
R/H Rear Tyre mirm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damagas
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/12/2017 |Inspection Date 14112/2017
Survey held at STYTECH AUTQ PTE LTD :
2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #02-30
KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




7 Vi Auric

f J . Consultants
e WA N Pt Lid Company Registration Mo, 199607 196R
2] UBILAVE 1, #02-25 PAYAL Bl INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08933 FEL : (S 625363361 FAN (S G256AN1S
Yourref:  17/17/17/VP05/020273 Date:  15.12.2017

Our ref: CC4/LPC17023759/Uual

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SKW 5096P
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 14.12.2017
at the premises of M/s Stytech Auto Pte Ltd (Kaki Bukit) have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5§ 7,548.60

Revised Estimate Amount 5% 5,936.50

"Check” Items Amount : 8% -

Market Value 1 S§% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value . S% -

Description of Damage: B

The vehicle sustained damages at the I e g o, =
Rear Portion -___:nm.— o

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 5.0 days

Y ours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

E

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 December, 2017 4:45 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Our Ref: 17/17/17/VP05/020273  Accident involving SJN4651C & SKW5096P
along Mew Upper Changi Rd on 12/12/17

Attachments: FW: SURVEY INVITATION for accident on 012/12/17 Along New Uppr Changi R....

(2.05 MB); 13122017164306.pdf

4-0am O 14l12] 2013

Dear Catherine, vihicle In
pPUEON &) LU!N![O“
Kindly refer to our attachment. ur@ Mt

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SKWS5096P on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

# — — = = == e —TTs.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 December, 2017 2:47 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: SURVEY INVITATION for accident on 012/12/17 Along New Uppr Changi Road
(EXIT 1), invelving vehicle SKWS096F 8 SIN4E51C.

Attachments: SKW5096P_12122017.pdf

Hi Eric,

Kindly do the needful.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd [mai1torsmechent@singnet.cum.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 December, 2017 2:04 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: SURVEY INVITATION for accident on 012/12/17 Along New Uppr Changi Road (EXIT 1), involving vehicle
SKWS096P & SIN4651C.

Dear Claims Officer

We would like to invite your surveyor to our workshop to survey our vehicle
SKW5096P whom involved an accident with your insured SIJN4651C.

Mote: Vehicle in worshop.

Location . 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02

Kaki Bukit Autohub S(4179 21)
(enter via Kaki Bukit Road 2) Heavy Vehicle Workshops

Contact Person :  Mr. Winston Teo
Hp. No. 9685 8843

Kindly reply to this email or contact me at 96858843 to confirm.

Thank You



Bast Regards

Whinston Teo
Hp 96858843

Stytech Auto Pte Ltd

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #02-30

Kaki Bukit Autohub Singapore 417921
TEL : 64448125

Fax : 64453310



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type
Owner D

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Wehicle to be Exported
Intended De-registration Date
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Medel

Primary Caolour
Manufacturing Year
Engine No.

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output
Open Market Value
Original Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
FPARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

COE Category

COE Period(Years)

QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount

oK

Company

2077G

SKW3076P

Mo

14 Dec 2017

MAZDA

MAZDA3 4-DOOR SEDAN 1.5L SP.6EAT
Silver

2015

P52032707%
JMBEBMA2ABG0322548
88.0 kW (118 bhp)
$15,091.00

30 0ct 2015

30 Oct 2015

0

$10,091.00

Yes
29 Oct 2025
%7.568.00

29 Oct 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$57,498.00

$45,271.00

$52,839.00

The information contained herein is correct asat 14 Dec 20 17

Page 1 of 2

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDere glnput?FUNCT... 14/12/2017
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920.70
185.00

55.10

64.20

55.40
959.80
385.00
65.40

68.00
784.60

167.80
385.50

4096.50

5368.60
4096.50
127210

0.00

0.00

0.00
4096.50
340.00
1500.00

564.00 20.00
45.00 40.00
277.60 30.00
385.50 50.00
200.00
340.00
1272.10
400.00
340.00
60.00
0.00

—_—
5936.50 0.00
0.00

0.00
0.00

0.00
0.00
0.00

10.00 30.00
30.00 60.00
20.00 600.00
750.00
60.00
1500.00
60.00
1780.00
1500.00
280.00
CHECK ITEM

50.00
40.00
50.00
100.00
40.00

280.00

4096.50
1272.10
340.00

60.00
1500.00

280.00

7548.60 -

g
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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

— —_ R — #‘
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Maonday, 18 December 2017 8:13 AM
To: Shirley Hiew {LKK Auto}
Cc: MT Claim_5G
Subject: RE: Our Ref- 17/17/17/VP05/020273  Accident involving S/N4651C & SKW5096P
along New Upper Changi Rd on 12/12/17
Attachments: 18122017090919.pdf

Dear Shirley,

We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 15 December, 2017 5:48 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/17/ 17/VP05/020273 Accident involving SIN4651C & SKW5096P along New Upper Changi
Rd on 12/12/17

Your ref: 17/17/17/VP05/020273
LKK ref: CC4/LPC17023759/Uua3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a third party direct settlement case.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKW 5096P
Date of survey: 14/12/2017

Enclosed for your perusal is:

TP's GIA report
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

We have not authorized repairs.

Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured's policy, and let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

1



Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com | fax, 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 9:09 AM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments cassignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/17/17/VP05/020273 Accident involving SIN4651C & SKW5096P along New Upper Changi Rd
on 12/12/17

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Rest Regards,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LLKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: GR41-1972 | email assignments@lkkayto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{q08033)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednasday, 13 December, 2017 4:45 PM

To: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Our Ref; 17/17/17/VP05/020273 Accident involving SIN4B51C & SKWS096P along New Upper Changi Rd on
12/12/17

Dear Catherine,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SKW5096P on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKW 5096F

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL G255 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg No: 189607198 GST Reg. No. 199607 198-R

Fage Mo.:1 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition | EStimate Egn our *;li“'““
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOTLID BADLY DENTED 920,70 820.70
1|BOOTLID INNER LOCK TWISTED 185.00 185.00
11BOOTLID INNER SHIELD CLIPS NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
2|BOOTLID REFLECTORS @$2682.00 NOT MECESSARY 564.00 -
1|BOOTLID MAZDA "3" EMEBLEM MECESSARY £5.10 5510
1|BOOTLID SKYACTIV EMELEM NECESSARY 64.20 6420
1|BOOTLID REAR LOGOD WECESSARY 55.40 55.40
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED G959 B0 655 80
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 385.00 385.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @%32.70 BENT 65.40 65.40
1|REAR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER TORN 68.00 68.00
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED T84 .60 469.70
1|REAR END PANEL STRIKER NOT NECESSARY 45 00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 277.60 -
1|BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 167.80 167.80
2| TAILLAMPS @5$915.00 MN/S CRACKED 1,830.00 915.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD TORN 266.50 266.50
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -919.52
6.714.10 3678.08
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER (SM) BENT 50.00 40.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIFS (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SM) NECESSARY B0.00 50.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN} SHORTED 220.00 200.00
380,00 320.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80,00 30.00
TO) SPRAY ANTI RUST PROCFING. 100.00 60.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS. 650,00 600 .00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 850.00 750.00

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC17023759/Uua3n2
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Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted

Oy i Workshop (S))| _ (5)

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX UPHOLSTERY. 100.00 80.00

1,780.00 1.520.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,874.10 5,518.08
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIR SUM | | 4,800.00]
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC17023759/Uua3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

HSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobely for the use and benafit of the Client namad o iha front page of this Report.

Mo Hability of responsiblity whatsoaver., in MMWMWW
Eepor, in whole o i peart, diich 80 at his or ber dwn fsk.




