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T Ve V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

R S TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC17023710/Khald
B B as T CONGOURBESINGAPORE ipssss Detes 13122017 M““Iumwmum m
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJQ 7484H Veh. Inspected SJv 8370U
Policy No. Z17VP05016331 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17 THTIVPOS/I020262 Excess () 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1311212017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Conrdition
Niake & Model £.6 o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre ' mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre ld
4. Description of Damages
5. 1 General Information
Accident Date  06/12/2017 Inspection Date 18/12/2017

Survey held at  ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD

BLK 7 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-T6
SINGAPORE 575642

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




¥r Auiter
: - Cansultanis

- .:- - Fie Lid Company Registratian No. 199607 106R
31U AVE 1L, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, S1NG APORE 408033 TEL : (0651 62563501 FAX : (65 62564315
Yourref:  17/17/17/VP05/020262 Date: 20.12.2017

Our ref: CC4/LPC17023710/Kha3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SJV 8370U
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 18.12.2017
at the premises of M/s Alan's United Auto Pre Ltd - (Sin Ming) have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§ 2,900.13

Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 1,427.71

"Check" ltems Amount : 5% 792.39

Market Value : 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value 55 3

Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Danage: o r:—:::—;..:—:_:h g
The vehicle sustained damages at the .

Rear O/S Portion M=

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Y ours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e —— — — “
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms»
Sent: Tuesday, 12 December, 2017 12:09 PM
To: assignments@Ikkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; kennychan@alanutd.com
Subject: FW: ATTACHED SJV8370U REPAIR ESTIMATE ,GIA REPORT FOR ARRANGE TP
SURVEY & CHECKING LIABILITY FOR DIRECT SETTLE
Attachments: SKM_284e17121212110 pdf

1a10q G VPPN
mmﬁ\&h ot

Our Ref 1 17/17/17/VP0O5/020266
Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to survey and revert to them on Direct Settlement,

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: kennychan@alanutd.com [ma[ltﬂ:kennychan@aianutd,com]'
Sent: Tuesday, 12 December, 2017 12:03 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: ATTACHED SIVB8370U REPAIR ESTI MATE ,GIA REPORT FOR ARRANGE T.P. SURVEY & CHECKING
LIABILITY FOR DIRECT SETTLE

Hi Gerald

Attached our client vehicle S)V8370U repair estimate & GIA report for arrange 1. p. survey claiming your insured
vehicle SJQ7484H accident on 06-12-2017 , mean time kindly check the liability for direct settle & reply us to confirm
direct settle yet to survey the vehicle & repair thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



Erquire Vehicle Registration Details
Owner Particulars

MNRIC/Passport
/Company Cert
Mo

Owner D Type:
Dwner Name:

Registered
Address:

Mailing Address:
Birth Date:

51132569F

Singapore NRIC
SIOW LEE MEN

and Iransport

7 DAIRY FARM ROAD #07-01 SINGAPORE 679037

07 Jun 1255

Vehicle Particulars

Vehicle No.:

Previous Vehicle
MNo.:

Effective Date of
Cwnership:

Original Regn Date:
Registration Date:

Year of
Manufacture:;

Wehicle Type:
Vehicle Scheme;

Vehicle
Attachment 1

Vehicle
Attachment 2:

Vehicle
Attachment 3:

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Secondary Colour:

Passenger
Capacity:

Chassis No.;
Engine Mo.:

Engine Capacity
/Power Rating:

Maximum Power
Qutput:

Propellant:

SIve37ou

01 Mar 2010

30 Mov 2009
30 Nov 2009

2009

Passenger Motor Car

No Attachment

TOYOTA

LEXUSIS250 AUTOSTD FL

Rea

4

JTHBK2462005113388

4GR0O611432

2500¢cc/-

153.0 kW (205 bhp)

Petrol

Authority



Max Unladen
Weight:

Maximum Laden

1625 kg

Weight: 2045kg

Open Market $38.495.00

Walue;

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility

Expiry Date: 28 Nov 2019
Minimum PARF

Benefit: $19,247.00

Mo. of Transfers: 1

U Label No.: 1123510760

COE No.: 20091001070005032
COE Expiry Date: 29 Nov 2019

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Registration 3

Category: B -Car{1601cc & above)

Quota Premium

{QP) / Prevailing $19 83000/ -
Quota Premium:
Actual QP Paid: $19.830.00
QP (Regn Cat): $19,289.00
OPC Cash Rebate No
Eligibility:
QP during COE
Bidding Exercise: $19.830.00
Additional
Registration Fee 100.00 %4
Rate:
Actual ARF Paid: $38,495.00
Vehicle Lifespan .
Expiry Date: Mo Lifespan
CO2 Emission;
COE rebate, if applicable, will be based on the QP of $19,289.00. This is the |ower of
Message: QP from Category E and the corresponding Category B in the same tender exercise.

To renew the COE, the Prevailing Quaota Premium payable is that of Category B.



Land Transport

Enquire Vehicle Registration Details
Owner Particulars

NRIC/Passport

/Company Cert S1132549F

No.:

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner Mame: SIOW LEE MEN

R 7 DAIRY FARM ROAD #07-01 SINGAPORE 679037
Mailing Address:

Birth Date: 07 Jun 1955

Vehicle Particulars

Vehicle No.: SIVB3T0U

Previous Vehicle

No.:

E)f::]": f;’ig oteof 01 Mar2010
Original Regn Date: 30 Nov 2009
Registration Date: 30 Nov 2009

Eﬂ:ﬂr u?;ctu re: 2007

Vehicle Type: Passenger Motor Car
Vehicle Scheme:

:f::gfmem 1 No Attachment
Vehicle .

Attachment 2:

Vehicle .

Attachment 3:

Wehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: LEXUS IS250 AUTO STD FL
Primary Colour: Red

Secondary Colour: -

Pa ssenger 4

Capacity:

Chassis No.; JTHBK262005113388
Engine No.: 4GR0A11432

e oy astngel:

Do POWET 153,0 kw (205 bhp)
Propellant: Petrol

Authority



Max Unladen 1625 kg
Weight:
Maximum Laden
Weight: 2045 kg
Open Market
Nl $38,495.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility
Expiry Date: 29Nov 2019
Minimum PARF
Benefit: $19,247.00
Mo. of Transfers: 1
IU Label No.: 1123510760
COE No.: 2009100107000503Z
COEExpiry Date: 29 Nov 2019
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Registration
Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
Quota Premium
(QP) / Prevailing $19,83000/-
Quota Premium:
Actual QP Paid: $19,830.00
QP (Regn Cat): $19,289.00
OPC Cash Rebate N
Eligibility: o
QP during COE
Bidding Exercise:  17:830.00
Additional
Registration Fee 100.00 %
Rate:
Actual ARF Paid: $38,495.00
Vehicle Lifespan .
Expiry Date: No Lifespan
CO2 Emission: -
COE rebate, if applicable, will be based on the QP of $19,289.00. This is the lower of
Message: QP from Category E and the corresponding Category B in the same tender exercise.

To renew the COE, the Prevailing Quota Premium payable is that of Category B.



~ ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE.

Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, Singapore 575642,
Tel: 6453 8686 (3 Lines) Fax: 6459 6550

Company Reg. No.: 201113667N
GST Reg. No.: 201113667N

LTD.

No. 05688
Vehicle Insured 5JQ 7484H
Accident Date 06-Dec-2017 Date 12-Dec-2017
Our Ref 217190 (LONPAC) / CHAN PAGE 1
MADAM SIOW LEE MEN ez AT ar 4o
7 DAIRY FARM ROAD (AR o
#07-01 R

7%

Singapore 679038

ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR FOR LEXUS 18250 sJveijou

Wy A Jo

7
1 pec Rear bumper fascia . Yt 841.90 “—/@
1 pc Rear bumper reinforcement [/ 431.60 -2
I pc  Rear bumper sponge Al 115,50 =~
1 pec Rear o/s bumper side retainer I 66,90 4
1 pe Rear o/s bumper reflector S 99.80 X
1,555.70
Less 10% Tah b7
1,400.13
1 pc  Rear bumper lower spoiler #1 350.00 sn X
1 pc Rear bumper reverse sensor({set oL, 300.00 sn ool
To putty and spray replaced parts 500.00 42%?
To remove, cut-out damaged parts,
panel beating, welding, align,
refix and to renew above parts 350.00 E?J}?
Total 5% 2,900.13

Singapore Dollars Two Thousand Nine Hundred and
Cents Thirteen Only




-~ ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE. LTD.

Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, Singapore 575642.

Tel: 6453 8686 (3 Lines) Fax: 6459 6550
Company Reg. No.; 201113667N

GST Reg. No.: 201113667N

Na. 05688
Vehicle Insured : SJQ 7484H
Accident Date : 06-Dec-2017 Date 12-Dec-2017
Our Ref : 217190 (LONPAC) / CHAN PAGE 1
MADAM SIOW LEE MEN AT Aty
7 DAIRY FARM ROAD (s
#07-01 L. &>
Singapore 679038 )

Al S,

=::::':::::'_'::::::::::::::‘.;:::--::::::::.—.:::::::::

pc  Rear bumper fascia

1
1 pc Rear bumper reinforcement 431.60 -
1 pc  Rear bumper sponge 115.50 =
1 pc Rear o/s bumper side retainer /=~ 66.90«
1 pc Rear o/s bumper reflector fo 99.80x
---------- ;’jgdﬁ el
1,555.70 ; ' a0
Less 10% : 155.57 EI Ch
__________ - T W LY
1,400.13
1 pc Rear bumper lower spoiler 350.00 sn X
1 pc Rear bumper reverse sensor(set 300.00 sn vy
To putty and spray replaced parts 500.00 415?
To remove, cut-out damaged parts,
panel beating, welding, align,
refix and to renew above parts 350.00 Z5=

Total : 5% 2,900.13

Singapore Dollars Two Thousand Nine Hundred and
Cents Thirteen Only
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841.90 431.60 420.00 350.00

115.50 250.00  300.00
66.90 80.00
99.80 100.00
0.00
670.00
830.00 0.00
841.90 713.80
1555.70 1500.00 2700.00
841.90 670.00 2380.00
713.80 830.00 320.00
841.90
24.19
757.71
670,00
431.60
1427.71 115.50
CHECK ITEM
547.10
54.71
492.39 Ve
300.00 '

792.39



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: alan khong chin wah <alanauto@gmail.com=

Sent: Friday, 3 August, 2018 12:54 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ATTACHED SJV8370U ¥ MARK PHOTO ,AFTER PHOTO FINAL AMOUN FOR
FINALIZE

Attachments: SKM_284el18080312540 pdf

Dear Vic

Attached duly signed DV for process payment . thank you

Regards

Kenny

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

On Fri, Aug 3, 2018 at 11:41 AM. Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenny,

We refer further to our below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we propose below amount to settle your client’s claim:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 1,605.00
Loss of Rental (5180 x 5 days) 5 900.00
GlA Search Fee 5 2.00

TOTAL s 2,507.00

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back to us the original hard copy for our
Principal to process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD.

1



Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, ond
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any ather related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is mode solely to resplve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-z096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5{408933)

SLERER WU Save the Earthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereofl. Thank you

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April, 2018 3:24 PM

To: 'alan khong chin wah'

Subject: RE: ATTACHED SIVE370U ? MARK PHOTO ,AFTER PHOTO ,FINAL AMOURN FOR FINALIZE

Without Prejudice

Dear Kenny,

Received with thanks.



We are in the midst of seeking mandate approval to our principal.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Caze Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

- i L ok

!- [{! s
SeEmEm e Gape the Earth- Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: alan khong chin wah [mailto:alanauto@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April, 2018 3:01 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: ATTACHED $JV8370U ? MARK PHOTO ,AFTER PHOTO ,FINAL AMOUN FOR FINALIZE

Dear Vic

Forward the finalize as requested .

Regards
Kenny

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd

64538686



---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: alan khong chin wah <alanauto/@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Dec 26, 2017 at 9:59 AM

Subject: ATTACHED SJV8370U ? MARK PHOTO ,AFTER PHOTO .FINAL AMOUN FOR FINALIZE
To: "Kenneth Kong (LKK Auto)" <kennethkongflkkauto.com™

Kenneth , Attached the above photo for yvour inalize total L/SUM
$1500.00 @ 3 days please confirm thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Ref : CC4/LPC17023710/Kha3n2

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 D6+ 16082018 M"“MI"”H""”"“
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJ0 7484H Veh. Inspected SJv 83ToU
Policy No. Z17VPOS016331 Coverage (8) 0.00
Claim No. 171171 7/NVP05/020266 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 13/12/2017
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model LEXUSIS250 (A) c.c 2500
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. JTHBK282005113388 Colour METALLIC RED
Odometer 110776 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R17 GOODYEAR 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R17 GOODYEAR 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45R17 GOODYEAR 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/45 R17 GOODYEAR 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  06/12/2017 Inspection Date 1871212017
Survey held at ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 7 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-76
SINGAPORE 575642
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




I ’d /4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

y-) - ; .' ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Fage Mo, 10f1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5JV 8370U
Estimate B r Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshap l;]'.'l Ou {‘J]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER FASCIA BUCKLED/ 841.90 841.90
DENTED
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DEFORMED 431.60 431.60
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE CRACKED 115.50 115.50
1|REAR O/S BUMPER SIDE RETAINER SERVICEABLE 66.90
1|REAR O/S BUMPER REFLECTOR SERVICEABLE 99.80
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -155.57 -138.90
1,400.13 1,250.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER SPOILER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 350.00
LABOUR
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN} SERVICEABLE 300.00
£50.00
LABOUR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY REPACED PARTS . 500.00 420.00
TO REMOVE, CUT -OUT DAMAGED PARTS ,PANEL 350.00 250.00
BEATING WELDING ,ALIGN ,REFIX AND TO RENEW
ABOVE PARTS .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BUMPER LOWER SPOILER .
850.00 670.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,900.13 1,920.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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