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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo, 1006071098R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Ref : CC3/CTI7023654/K1hb3

Date: 13-12-2017

Code: CTI

JIH

Policy Particulars :- THIRD P/ RTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. ¥l 22154 Veh. Inspected SHC 6083U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (%) 0.00
Assign From Assign Dzie 13/12/2017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modificatian
General !
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre a mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mirm
4. Description of Damanes
5. General Infnrmutlnh
Accident Date  11/12/2017 lnspantinr.- Date 121202007
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 S!NG_APDRE 486443
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CON
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, W

DUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
E HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Congultanis

?’ "»(r !’J?" Auto

M.; 1 1; Pte Lid Company Registration No. 139607198R
31 UBEAVE L, #0225 PAYA L HI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408933 TEL - ((6H3) 62363561 FAX @ (065 62564315
Yourref:  To Be Advised Date: 13.12.2017

Our ref: CC3/CTII7023654/K1hb3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHC6089U
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on_12.12.2017
at the premises of M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd_and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 2,761.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,838.00
"Check" Items Amount : 55 -
Market Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : Sh -
Nett Value S8 -

i Eice
Description of Damage: e
P e e | || |t
The vehicle sustained damages at the i Lo
Front Portion =

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Shu Pei 5LKKAuto} -

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com:=

Sant: ' Wednesday, 20 December, 2017 B:44 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL2215A (Ol : CTI - SNM17D07093C02/5) and
SHCB083U (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3 ) an 11.12.2017

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Shu Pei

Our insured have not reported this accident,
Best Regards

Joel Goh
Claims Executive (Motor Division)
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Co, Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6184

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
{oel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer ¢ This meassage is confidential; its contents de not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte,
Ltd. excapt where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are nat the intended recipient of the
message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 7:09 FM

To: loel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL2215A (Ol : CT1 - SNM17007093C02/5) and SHCE0BIU (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3 J on 11.12.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Joel,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



é MEAL chE A TR (Fimig) B RS

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) FTE LTD:

3 Anson Aoad 81000 Spingheal Tower Smgapore OTIB0E
T G384 6! Fex: 8227 1031

CHINA TAIPING

Wiiknata. weAsY S CPATEENY] DO
Co Rog Mo 200208354E

Our Reference: SNM17D07093/C02/5
Date : 14 DECEMBER 2017 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

TOH KIM BOCK C-E CONTRACTOR PTE LTD
3 PEMIMPIN DRIVE

#05-04 LIP HING INDUSTRIAL BUILDING
SINGAPORE 576147

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL2215A AND SHCG6089U ON 11 DECEMBER 2017
ALONG SEMBAWANG ROAD

Wie refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHCE089U |, is filing a third party property claim
against your vehicle.

\We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf and
they will soon contact you for more information about the accident. Kindly render your assistance
and co-operation accordingly.

We understand that you or your driver has not filed an accident r2port within 24 hours as per Motor Claims
Framework, VWe would urge you to comply with the condition to file your accident report with your vehicle
(whether damaged or not) to us IMMEDIATELY through LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd or any of our

authorized workshops. You may log onto our website www.sg.cntaiping com_for location of the respective

workshops.

We regret to advice that we and/or LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd will not be handling the third party claim

and your NO CLAIM DISCOUNT will be penalized upon renewal of your policy if you fail to comply
with the condition of reporting.

Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letler and no signature is require.}

CC - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Attn : WIC

Raf CC3CTIMT023654/K1hb3
Contact No : 6841 2036

via Email :  vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

CC : Agent - (ANO334A) - GIM'S INSURAMNCE AGENCY PTELTD

FO2/LKKDSANR-2013



To : Traffic Police — Deputy Head, Investigations Department
Fax . 65474883

ONLY FOR ACCIDENTS IN SINGAPORE

NON-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT REPORT SCHEME
FORM ON NON-REPORTING BY INSUREDS

Please be informed that we have yet to receive a motor accident report from our
insured with regard to a non-injury motor accident as follows:-

Date of accident o 111272017

Time of accident : 0730HRS

Place of accident . Along SEMBAWANG ROAD

Third Party’s name © MR K A YASIN (PREMIER TAXI)

Third Party's vehicle number : SHC 6089U

Qur insured’'s name - M/s TOH KIM BOCK C-E CONTRACTOR
PTELTD

Our insured's vehicle number - YL 2215A

Our insured’s NRIC number . TBA

Our insured’s address - 3 PEMIMPIN DRIVE

#03-04 LIP HING INDUSTRIAL BUILDING
SINGAPORE 576147

Our Insured's telephone number : TBA

A letter dated (14/12/2017 and 21/12/2017) was sent to remind our insured to report
the non-injury 5motor accident to us. No report has yet been made.

Please do not hesitate to contact the following for any clarification on the matter.
(Please cite our reference number:( CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3)

Name and address of insurance company: China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road
#15-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079079909120

Name of contact person : Viic Sanghilan
Contact Number - 6256 3561 / Fax: 6741 4108
Date : 15/01/2018



Vehicle Hub

Enquire Transaction History
Transaction History Details

Log DaledTime:
Aszet Type:
Assat 1D

Transaction Type:

Business Transaction
Refarance No..

Wahicle No.:

WVehicle Type:

Wehicle Attachment 1:
Vahicle Attachment 2:
\ahicle Attachment 3.
\iehicle Scheme:

First Registration Date:

Original Fegistration
Date;

Vahicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Chassis No.:

Engine Mo.:

Motar No.:

Trailer Chassis No..
Propeltant.
Passanger Capacity:
Engine Capacity:
Power Rating:

Linlgden Weaight:
Maximum Laden
Weight:

Primary Color.
Secondary Color:
Manufacturing Year:

Open Market Value;

Minimum PARF
Benefit:

PARF Eligibility:
Mo of Transfer:

Effactive Ownership
DatelTime:

COE No.;
COE Expiry Date:

COE Bid Category:

Actual QPIPOP Pald
Amaount:

Lifespan Expiry Date:
Cwrer 10 Type:

a0 Jul 2014 7 10:17:08
Vehicle

SHCE085U

01.02 Register New Vehicle (AA)

20140730101708262188

SHCE088U

Recaipt Mo

Transaction Amaunt:

Channel;

H10 - Public Transport Taxi (Mator Car)

Air-Con (Taxi)

Taxl (Company)

30 Jul 2014

30 Jul 2014

KA

OPTIMA 1.7{A) DIESEL
KNAGM414MES464251
D4FDDH3OT18

Diaseal

1685

1584
2050
Silver

2013

$19,908.00

87 444.00

¥

0

30 Jul 2014 10:17:08
2014073001001 268N
20 Jul 2022

$53,269 00

26 Jul 2022
Company

Page 1 of 2

| Texi size + -

AACCHKDD1-AX238-140730-000018

$65,817.00

A2 Counterless - CYCLE &
CARRIAGE KA PTELTD

hllp:;:ﬂvr].Im.g:w.s;g,“I.la.-‘vrl.-'a'c:linn.-’hub.i'l.ssetﬂmtrTrjﬁoglﬁetail’:’FUNETlDN ID=F... 01/Aug/2014



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 4806443
TEL: 65446676 / 65446689 FAX: 62141511

CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

11-Dec-17

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA REGN NO: SHC 6089 U

. B
| ramprem e \/7%@7"/‘/"4%’

1pc Front bumper emblem ~ $ 44.00
1pc Bonnet grille = 3 386.00
2 pes n/s & ofs head lamp @$102800 < §  2.056.00
§ 248600
Less 10% 5 248.60
$ 124300
SINETT
1 set Front bumper clips X $ 48.00
1pe Front no. plate - $ ;.MU"-?I‘
Sundry S 50087 2o
To labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including knock-out, straighten, repair,
reshape and adjust of the bonnet g W@:
;;::Hp;urt}r and spray painting on front bumper, bonnet, bonnet . . 5 26
To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels. 3 120-60° M
§ 2,761.00
{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)
THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.
}C 1 /-’-"t /Z' {{ {V
/ s2finfia 724
-.—'-u—'—"_'_'_'_"_
____—— | 24



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446676 / 65446689 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG:200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

11-Dec-17

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA REGN NO: SHC 6089 U

e g™ -
1pc Front bumper emblem $ 44.00-
1pe Bonnet grile  ~—— bt Ll s 386.00 ~
2 pcs n/s & o/s head lamp @S51028 .00 ol 3 205600~
k] 2486.00
Less 10% 5 148.60
S 1.243.00
SINETT
-k
1 set Front bumper clips X ﬁqf 48.00
1pc Front no. plate ol 5 ;,Qro(]"' L~
Sundry nLe 5 f,/q_ga'"z o
To labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including knock-out, straighten, repair,
reshape and adjust of the bonnet 5 Wau
To putty and spray painting on front bumper. bonnet, bonnet
grille s 60l sho
To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels 3 ‘IH. )r""
) 2,76+00
{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST | 3155\%
THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.
ft

/ s2 )R 110k
2 /.,

¢
| e Rper 5

r‘/'rol/\—'( g_/f,!{)z



Vic (LKKAuto)

# —
From: Gary Shi <gary.shi@premiertaxi.com>
Sent: Friday, 19 January, 2018 3:09 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuUto)
Ca AccReport; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6089U & YL2215A on 11.12.17 (China Taiping
case) LKK REF CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3
Attachments: SHCG089U - DV.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Vic,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client's part and driver of SHCG089U,
our client agreed to direct settle the above claims at $2670.00

We enclosed hereby Discharge voucher & ATA for your kind attention, original copies will pass to Mr Kalvin

Kindly let us have your settlement sum of $52670.00 in our favour — Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd within
14days from the date hereof.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damage only.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 060 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Motice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

@4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

»h

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 19 January, 2018 11:27 AM

To: Gary 5Shi

Cc: AccReport; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6089U & YL2215A on 11.12.17 (China Taiping case) LKK REF
CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Gary,

We refer to further to our below email.



Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we propose a global sum of $2,670.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the enclosed DV and ATA then forward back to us the original signed copy
together with the LOD and supporting documents for payment processing.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter anly. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any ather related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

y ErEr

" Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 29 December, 2017 12:59 PM

To: Gary Shi

Cc: AccReport; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHC6085U & YL2215A on 11.12.17 (China Taiping case) LKK REF
CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Gary,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

"Wishes yvou a Merry Christmas & Huppy New Year 2018"



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkka m | fax; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

¥ svs

- oA

Eeima®m  WETT Spue the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you recaived this e-mail in error, please do not

read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the

sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Gary Shi [mailto:gary. remiertaxi.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 3:02 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: AccReport; C5 A Team

Subject: LOD / Accident involving SHCE089U & YL2215A on 11.12.17 (China Taiping case)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Asher & Vic,

Your Ref; YL2215A

Our Ref; SHC6089U/GS

Date of accident: 11/12/2017

We refer to the above mentioned accident.

Hereby we would like to append our losses from China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd, as insurers of vehicle number
vL2215A which their insured driver's negligence driving in the above accident.

Enclosed herewith our letter of demand and supporting documents for your kind perusal,
Kindly look into the matter and let us have your favourable reply as soon as possible.

To expedite this claim settlement, please reply to us by email.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-D2 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at; www. premiertaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Motice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient{s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destray all copies of the original message.

g Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION
¥
3
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
59 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607196R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079809

Ref : CC3/CTI17023654/K1hb3n2
owe: 2eane [N
Code: CTI

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. YL 2215A Veh. Inspected SHC 6089U
Policy No. DMCVSN1756211700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim MNo. SNM17D07083/C02/5 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/12/2017
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIAOPTIMA c.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. KNAGM414MES464251 Colour SILVER
Odometer 223481 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/65R16 ACHILLES 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/865 R16 ACHILLES 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/65 R16 ACHILLES 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/65 R18 ACHILLES 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/12/2017 Inspection Date 1211212017
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ATWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 6083U

aty Description of Parts Condition WE::E:I““ ?;}} Qur "‘:J}“‘“‘*
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER EMBLEM HWECESSARY 44 00 44.00
1|BONNET GRILLE CRACKED 386.00 386.00
2IN/S & O/S HEAD LAMP @$1026.00 GRAZED 2,056.00 2.056.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -24B8 .80 -248.60
2,237 40 2,237.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 48.00
1|FRONT NO PLATE (SN) DENTED 50.00 35.00
1|SUNDRY (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 20.00
148.00 55.00
LABQUR
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE B50.00 200.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS.INCLUDING KNOCK-
OUT.STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR . RESHAPE AND ADJUST OF
THE BONNET.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT 500.00 360.00
BUMPER BONNET,BONNET GRILLE.
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 120.00
REPLACED PANELS.
1,370.00 560.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,755.40 2,852.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,250.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI17023654/K 1hb3n2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

ECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report I8 made solely for the use and bernsefit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Repon.
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