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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 2:15 PM

To: 'jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg'

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SCN898S on 08/12/2017

Dear Jen, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 1:52 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Accident Involving SCN898S on 08/12/2017 

 

“WITHOUT PREJUDICE” 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

Attached is the covering letter, Repair Tax Invoice & Discharge voucher signed by client for your perusal.  

 

Thank you very much 

 

Best Regards, 

Jenny Lim 
Admin Assistant 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue Singapore 729648 

Tel:   +65 63633003  DID:  +65 63602444  Fax:  +65 63602899     

  

 

 


