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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199807188R GSTReg. No 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CCA4/AIG17023586/pb3
CHARTISBULONG |ERIBINI
CHARTIS BUILDING Date: 12-12-2017
SINGAPORE 079120
Code AIG
Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. 5GG 2214 Veh. Inspected SKL 1408E

Paolicy No. Coverage (%) 0.00

Claim No. Excess ($) 0,00

Assign From Assign Daly 12122017

Vehicle Particulars & Condition

Make & Model c.c 0

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.

Chassis No. Colour

Odometer - Steering

Brakes Modification

General

Conditions of Tyre:-
Size Make Balance

R/H Front Tyre mm

L/H Front Tyre mm

R/H Rear Tyre mim

L/H Rear Tyre mm

Description of Damages
General Information
Accident Date  09/12/2017 Inspection Date
Survey held at ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD ¥

BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3

#01-80

SINGAPORE 158723

Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




ACCORD AUTO SERVICESPTELTD -

¢
BLOCK (00= BLIKIT MERAH LAMNE 3
il -8l SINGAPDRE 159723
ESTIMATE REFAIR Pel

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid

Date

11.12.2017

Owner's Name © Pek Kang lun Jeffrey

Vehicle No : SKLI409E Claim Tvpe: Third Party Claim

Vehicle Make & Model - Volkswagen Golf 1.4 A7 TS1 A Chassis No: WYWZZZALZDW | 60660

Registration Date - 10 Jul 2013 (YOM 2013) COE Expiry Date: 9 Jul 2023 DOA: 9122017

No Description Uit List (%)

| [FRONT BUMPER Cb il 1 5 |.330.71
2|[FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER A L— | ;/ 5 ‘?E [y 9830
3|FRONT RH FENDER Y r 5 642,53
4|[FRONT RH HEADLAMP ¥ 'V7 | s 864,40
5|FRONT RH HEADLAMP BRACKET ¢ 11\ | 5 70.99

TowmliA):] § 3004 93

Less 10%:] § 300,49

Total :] § 2.704.44




ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

BLOCK 1ivM BUKIT MEEAH LANE 3

=0 SINOAPORE (50T

LELn AV RITIS4 AhlcasT]
ESTIMATE REPAIR Pl
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lud
Date: 11.12.2017
Owner's Mame : Pek Kang Jun JefTrey
Vehigle No : SKL1409E Claim Type: Third Party Claim
Vehicle Make & Model = Volkswagen Gol 1.4 AT TSLA Chassis Mot WVWZZZALZDW 160660
Registration Date : 10 Jul 2003 (Y'OM 2013) COE Expiry Date: 9 Jul 2023 DOA: 9122017
No Description Linit List (%)
Special Nett
[|[FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Pl s 10 s 3500
Labour
| |Spray Painting to All Affected Areas 1 5 {LE‘D 1.000.00
“|Labour Remove © Refix Accident Damages parts to knock |, jack, cut weld ' $ 3“ ° HO
and realign accident affected area
3|Check Winng Svstem & Light | 5 30 100.00
4l Anti Rust Treatment 1 b ?7% 100.00
GPRINGEL [N 2o
L.
USwy’ 29
1 £
o e iy ‘-?J t ; Q ] ’ C;Q _"}b o
e m—sneees - 1 —— -
the Repairer ol the following: [ M (et 1S .47
» To fiapiay demaged (S| QUG TESUNVEY ﬂﬂ“ﬁ "\d—b" b’ﬂ‘fa‘“ i“a fL“D %
» Pus prices A8 BUBpeT 10 onie |~ ¥ ﬁ
o Thitl party survey i .on 8 “Wilhalt Prejutios” D
s Kiohlieal modiicalonis) 5 SRCwET B , Vi
-;r:_; N Cs v _,.Sm vV (_ H,d,lq,-.«ﬁ w
s fuibiect 10 Binal approvan o : ; 0(.0'-\
L S
A fowiadgest ty Hepairn 1’
L
ot
Towl (B):| $ 2.235.00
Grand Toml: | § 4,939.44




Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Accord Claims(AV) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 5:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGG 221J(AIG) & SKL 1409€ ON 09/12/2017 *Our Ref
CC4/AIG17023596/T1pb3

Attachments: VID-20171211-WADD20 mp4

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Kindly refer video footage as attached file.

Thank you!

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email
from your system. Thank you.

On Tue, Dec 26, 2017 at 4:59 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht/@lkkauto.com=> wrote:

Your Ref: SKL 1409E Without Prejudice
Dur Ref: CC4/AIG17023594/TIpb3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGG 221J(AIG) & SKL 1409E ON 09/12/2017

We reter to the obove matter.

Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.

We would ke to request o copy of video toctage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary
action

Appreciate an early reply.



*Wishes vou a Merry Christmuas & Happyv New Year 20087

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Caze Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone; frr42-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Parck, Ubi Avenue 1, so2-25 | S{408933)



Hsiao Tuna !I.I{KAuta!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 8:57 AM

To: "Wui, Shawnkaijye'

Subject: Your Ref: 415336268256 *Our Ref CC4/AIG17023596/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SGG 2211(01) & SKL 1409€(TP) ON 09/12/2017]

Attachments: SKL 1409E vs SGG 221) - TP VIDEOQ.mp4

Your Ref: 41533626825G
Our Rel: CC4/AIG170235%6/T1pb3

Dear Sirs/ Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5GG 221J(0O1) & SKL 1409E(TP) ON 09/12/2017

We refer to the above matier,

Attached here with a copy of video footage from third party for your easy reference,

The video shows that our insured collided onto third party parked vehicle while he was reversing into a
parking lot, Liability is down ogainst our insured.

We will proceed to negotiaote and settle the matter with third party.

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Hondler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: frra2-7107 | emall: chewht@ towcom | fax: f741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz2-25 | S{a08033)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 January 2018 2:57 PM

To: ‘Accord Claims(av)'

Subject: <OFFER>Your Ref: SKL 1409E *Qur Ref CC4/AIG17023596/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SGG 221J(AIG) & SKL 1409E ON 09/12/2017]

Your Ref: SKL 1409E Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/AIG170235946/T1pb3

Dear Sirs/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGG 221J(AIG) & SKL 1409E ON 09/12/2017
We refer to the obove matter.

We propose setlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair|w/G5T) $1.712.00
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00) $ 300.00
3, LTA/GIA search fee $ 5.35

Total $2,017.35

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of [iability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@dauto.com | fax: 6751-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{4080753)

From: Accord Claims(AV) [mailto:avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 10:03 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Photos After Repair SKL1409E

Dear Taufikh,

Accept with thanks.



Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your

system. Thank you.

On Thu, Jan 18, 2018 at 9:32 AM, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh{@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Celia,

COR I/s51600, 3 days.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Accord Claims{AV) [mailto:avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 15 December 2017 6:19 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)
Cc: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: Photos After Repair SKL1409E

Dear Mr Taufkh,

Kindly refer photos after repair as attached file and please finalize.

Thank you!



Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3

#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This en_-rail is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your
system. Thank you.



b

From: Accord Claims(AY) <avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 January 2018 3:22 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: <OFFER> Your Ref: SKL 1409€ *Our Ref: CC4/AIG17023596/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SGG 221J(AIG) & SKL 1409E ON 09/12/2017]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Accept. Kindly let us have your discharge voucher.

Thank you.

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715

This emall is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,

disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your
system. Thank you.

On Wed, Jan 24, 2018 at 2:56 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SKL 1409E Withou! Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/AIG17023576/T1pb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING S$GG 221J(AIG) & SKL 1409E ON 09/12/2017

Wea refer to the above matier,

We propose settliement as follows: -



ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-B0 SINGAPORE 159723
TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715
G5T Regn No: 201113141K

18 January 2018

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
AlG Building

78 Shenton Way #07-16

Singapore 079120

Artn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs.

We are the authonzed repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SKLI409E, which was involved i the
captioned accident with your insured vehicle: SGG221.0. The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us 1o
assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of vour insured driving. we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

01) Cost Of Repair 5 1.600.00
02) 7% GST $ 112.00
03) Car Remal (@ $220 per day 5 660,00
04) LTA Enguiry Fee 8 5.35
5 2.377.35
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the clams:-
al  GIA repont d1 Insured NRIC & Dnving License

bl Letter OfF Authorimw ¢l LTA Enguiry Fee
¢l Repair Statement BM39%6

Kindly look into the marter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank vou
Yours faithfullv

AUTO SERVIEES PTE LTD
Celia Lai
Accord Auto Services Pre Lid
Tel: 6271 7433 / 92740999
Email: avelaimsia mycarworkshop com.sg
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S UBEAVE 1, 200-25 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (105) 62563561 FAX : (b5 62564313

Our Ref: CC4/AIG17023596/T1pb3
27 DECEMBER 2017

LO SHYE RU

23 BALMORAL PARK
#03-04

SINGAPORE 259852

Dear SirMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGG 221J & SKL 1409E ON 09/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance
policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SKL 1409E against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@] to.com

e.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

lo Whom It May Concemn.

Accident Involving Vehicle: Skl WA € ond 26023 g0 413 2013 Alena s Loudd
-8 + (CasVark - =
S e, e LA,

I'We, FH‘. hu,a Jun rluHruj .NRIC No: S Hc ;moa F
of
Owner of motor vehicle no Sk o4 E do hereby appoint Accord Auto Services Pte Lid

—

as my/ours authorised representative and

as my/ours solicitors to write. to negotiate and settle my/our claim against the other party/parties involved

in the above mentioned accident. I'We,  Pet tanj o ]uﬁ'u}

shall have absolute discerption 1o settle the matter at the best term.

I/We also confirm and instruct that any agreed settlement sum in respect my/our claims be paid

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd and such pavment will be constitute a full and final discharge of my claims.

(A5

Signature of owner
(Company Stamp, if Applicable)




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (*the workshop™) hereby confinm that we'l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of survevar) with respect to the amount clamed for
$851.712.00 (Repair Cost), S$300.00 (Loss of BseRental), S§5.358 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SKL 1409E that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 09/12/2017 (date) along
CLUNY COURT BASEMENT CARPARK (location) involving vehicle no/s 8GG 221J. This 15
pursuant to the inspection conducted on 13/12/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are’am authonzed by the owner PEK KANG JUN JEFFREY (the third
party claimant™) of vehicle no. SKL 1409E make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/l have full authority to seule the mater on his'her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AlG Asia Pacific Insurance e Lid for all damages,
loss and'or expense that they will or have alreadv incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertainmg 10 costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage 10 SKL 1409E (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

W/l confirm that the agreement reached above is i full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant 10 the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject 1o the applicanon of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Duted this ___ 35 (day) of 1-“5 (month) 20 1} _ {vear)

LA CORD

AUTO SEHV|EE5 PTE LTD

MTH

Signed by appointed surveyor Sigm.-djhy “the workshop™ (with chop)




ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723
TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715
GST Regn No: 201113141K

Date : 18 January 2018
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Our Ref No : BM396
AlG Building Insured : Pek Kang Jun Jeffrey
78 Shenton Way #07-16 Insured NRIC : S8520214F
Singapore 079120 Make & Model  : Volkswagen Golf 1.4 A7 TSI
DOA : 9.12.2017
Claim Type : Third Party
REPAIR STATEMENT
Re: Vehicle Registration No: SKLI409E
Cost Of Repair 8 1.600.00
7% GST S 112.00

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid

ACCORD




Bk 1009 Bukit Merah
#01-80 Alexandra Village ind'l Esl

Lane 3

Singapore 159723
TEL: BTER0531
FAX: 84819516

Co Reg Nou: 2011301726

wow MyCarWorkshop.com.sp

Pek Kang Jun Jeffrey

Customar Vehicle No, SELT409E (Valk)
Replacement Vehick No. SKTEED1R
Maks & Model Forc Monds:

iU No, 1121687230

Rental Information:

Accord Rent-A-Car Pte.

Ltd.

Invaico #

RCS0818

Enc Aciual Duration | Charped

830 AM

Date | Time

161122017

4:30 AM 3 Days

Rental Cost

Daily Days $220

Waakly
Maonthiy

Mornly

Dthars

Paymeont Details £

Amount Due: SB60.00

Par day S560.00
Far wees

Par month

Per cay

This Is a computer generated Invoice, NO signalure IS required

Thank you for choosing Accord Rent & Car Pla Lid

Main Branch: 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24, 803-11 AMK Autopoini, Singapore 566047, Tel: 5481 8518, Fax: 6481 3516
Branch: Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-80, Singapore 158723, Tal; 8271 5133, Fax: 6274 5715



12M1020T Receqt

EL 1404 E
Land Transport Authornty
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 57571

GET Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print DataTime | 11 Dec 2017 1 11:14:48
Recept DateTime : 11 Dec 2017/ 11:14:48

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. . ITNET-00000-171211-000636

Previous Receipt No.
S/N Itemn Description/ Amount GST
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount
Ne. GST (5%) (S5)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SGG221J
As gl 09 Dec 2017/M14:20:00
Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE FTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enguiry - SGG221J
Enquiry Fee 5.00 0.35
20171211111359640080
Sub-Total 5.00 0.35
Total Before Rounding 5.00 0.35
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
Credit Card!
KRN e S430 Visa/M rCaid
Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amoum
Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount
After GST
(SS)

5.35

5.35
5.356
0.00
5.35

535

535
0.00
535
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
pravider [ financial institution. Otherwise. Lhe transaction and receipl is considered void and late fee

may apply.

nitps./ivrl lta.gov.sg/italvrlaction/completePayment ?FUNCTION_ID=F1301001TT

1"



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane
| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING i
_Coze  |Notified Est Subrmitted Ad) Assigned Adj Rpt | Al Submitted Ins Auth'ed | Status
|12 Dec 2017 11 Dec 2017 ggy 600.00 S$$1,600.00 Senong e
. Edt I | s Eit Estimates IL view fpr |
-t | edn agirae | | = | Eancel Case |

Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

LO SHYE RU, 1D: -

PEK KANG JUN JEFFREY, 10: SESZOZ214F

SKL1409E [ate of Loss: Pa/12/2017 14:00 - :55
(Claim Type: TP / 415336268256 Policy/Cover Note No.: 1100427460 (Comprehensive)
| Vehicle Reg. No. (Insured): | SGGZ21] Policy No. (Claimant): EVPPSBOS4B581700

Exceag:
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd (Bukit Merah) BLE 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-80, 159723 Bukit Marah
- Tel:

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Express) - Tel: 65-5419-3000 ... |Handled by Wul, Shawn-KJ|
Shawnkaijye. Wuilalg.com

Allled World Assurance Company, Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62201188

LKK Autc Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 635£-3561 ., [Handled by MOMD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] ..
[Final Rpt due 21/12/2017]

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Compose Cave Mad |
| AIG_5G (13/12/2017): NO OI GIA REPORT

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group  Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
No results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 30/1/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Upload Documents | Uplond Photos |  Compose New Letter | Upioad vides |  Uplosd audio |

Claim Documents

*SKL1409E (41533626825G)
[5GG221)]
TR
PEK KANG JUN JEFFREY
Dec 9 2017 2:20PM
[LO SHYE RU]
Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

View |view in Browser| » |

Letters/Correspondences |[tperpage v] A

No |PnwigedOn _ |LKK Auto Consultants Pos Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
{1 [{Dram) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown [1] Edit
Photos/Images Grerpege [
No | Relabel/Reorder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |26/12/17 17:00  Odometer Reading | adws A

2 | ZE/M2/17 17:00  Chassis Number 0| icaawe (M
326012117 17:00  General View © e @

|4 [26[12/1717:00  General View O aaws (M

‘s 26/12/1717:00 | Gemeral View B wedirs [F |
l6 [26/12717 17:00 | Genaral View ©| wairs & |
. 26/12/17 17:00  General View ©| wawre &E |
'8 |26/12/1717:00  General View @O odws |

|9 26/12/17 17:00  General View Q! wawrs A

10 |26/12/17 17:00  General View O wawe M
11| 26/1217 17:00 | General View © wews

12 | 26/12/17 17:00 | General View O wwwrs (H

13 |26/12/17 17:00  General View O wedws A

14 |26/12/17 17:00 | General View - O adws (M
15 26/12/17 17:00  General View o Q| eaws B

16 |26/12017 17:00 | General View @ | toadws |M
(17 |26/12/17 17:00  Ganeral View 0O wure B

|18 [26/12/17 17:00 | General View €| tcadirc |

19 |26/12/1717:00 | Genaral View Q| wiws B
20 |26/12/17 17:00 | General View - @O waws B
21 |26/12117 17:00 ‘General View 0| Loed we M
22 26/12/1717:00  General View O waws |2

123 |26/12/17 17:00 | Reinspection Photo - Q| wars |8
24 26/12/17 17:00  Reinspection Photo - @ dws B
25 |26012/1717:00 | Reinspection Photo _ _ﬂ Load PG | b

26 |26/12/17 17:00 | Reinspection Photo. Q| wawe &
27 | 26/12/17 1700 Reinspection Photo © | waows A
Documentation {tperpace  |~|| A
'No_| Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
|1 [12/12/1717:20  EMAIL FROM AIG DD 11122017 [ I

(2 |12/12/17 17:20 TP GIA REPORT = /@ | LosdpoF

3 14/12/17 11112 Nan reporting letter €@ | LoaaroF

hups://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuscaction=dsp_doc... 30/1/2018
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4 |14/12/1719:10 |TP ESTIMATE- MARKED = == _|@ | LleedroF | .
5 30/01/1809:36  WORKSHOP INVOICE @ | Load por |
6 30/01/1505:36  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
7 30/01/18 09:36  Release Voucher ) | LoadPOF
8 30/01/18 09:36  RENTAL RECEIPT @ | Losd pOF
9 30/0171809:36 | LTA SEARCH © | LosdpoF i
|10 |30/01/18 09:36 | LETTER TO OI Load POF
[No_|Finakzed On |AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (56) Thumbnail | Print |
1 26/12/17 13:42 | OI GIA REPORT € | toaaroF |

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

1
meset | save | prnt ||
There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG)

Show Remarks To: | Handling lnsurer
FiotE MEmarks §re privale Jnisss yiu 3how o to other partss
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Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: $GG221J (Insd veh) Model: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF 1.4 A7
SKL1409E (TP veh) TSI (A)
| Date of Accident: | 09/12/2017
Global Sum Settiement || [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 5 5,285.20
Final Repair Caost s 1,712.00
Loss of Use 4 - days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) 4 30000 3 days
LTA/ GIA Search Fee '8 535
Others: 4 0.00
5
Final Settlement Sum 4 ] 2,017.35

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate

below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessad Liability (). %)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collsions and for cases where BOLA does nolt apply
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Accord Auto Services Pte Lid

2)
3)
4]

2017.35

L AR AR LR

30 Jan
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Aute Consullants Ple Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Vaucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)
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Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg no 18807 1ser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408533
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6B844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto com,assignments@ikkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No:  CC4/AIG17023586/T1PB302
Date: 30012018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid Policy No: 2100427460
SIBRIR Va0 sia.sa09e Insured Vehicle No :  SGG221J
Date of Loss 09122017 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 415336268256
| IFICAT F
Reg No. SKL1409E
Make & Model: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF, 1.4 AT TS| (A} Engine No: CMB145799
Reg. Dale: 10/07/2013 (Man, Year; 2013} Chassis No: WWWZZZAUZDW1808580
Colour: Black Odometer:  BO411 km
Engine Capacity: 1385 cc
Market Value/New Car Price NIA
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Geanearal Condition Steering (Serviceabls) Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Left Side: Michelin & mm Rear Left Side: Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 6 mm
The above values repressn! (ha remaseng hre treads daph
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2.739.44 1.275.97 1.463.47 53.42
Miscellanaous llams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,200.00 T60.00 1,440.00 6545
Paintwork Labour 0.00 D.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 D.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 4,939 44 2,035.97 2,903.47 58.78
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%) 1,600.00
(5%) 4083044 1,600.00 333944 67.61
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS) 34578 112.00 233.76 87 61
Nett Amount (S$) 5,285.20 1,712.00 3,573.20 67.51
+ Car Rental (3.0 x $$100.00/day) (S$) 300.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (58) 535
Nett Liability (S5) 2,017.35
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 11122017
Date Inspected. 13272017 Inspecied AL Accord Auto Services Ple Lid (Bukil

Merah)
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Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

BLK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-80
Singapore 159723
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0days

Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE This report represents our fincings af the nme and place of inspection stated hersin, Such inspechon has teen carmed ouf fo fhe best of our
knpwiedge and abiity but sny other lahlity under any other circamstances is heraby sxprassly aociuded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 30/1/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed 1.330.71FL *1.330.71FL

2 1 *FRONT EUMPER SIDE RETAINER MNecessary (1 PCS DNLY) B6.30FL *48 15 FL
(2 PCS)

3 1 “FRONT RH FENDER Repair 642 53 FL “-FL

4 1 “FRONT RH HEADLAMP Mot Necessary 864 40FL “FL

5 1 *FRONT RH HEADLAMP ERACKET Mol Necessary TO99FL *-FL

B 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 35.00FS *35.00F8

F=Franchise part. 5=SpcNett L=_listllamDisc
Sub Total ($§) 3.039.83 1.413.86
= List Item Discount on L ltems 10.00/10.00% (S%) 300.48 137,89

Total Parts (S$)  2,739.44 1,275.97

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are na new miscellansous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 SPRAY PAINTING TO ALL AFFECTED AREAS New 1,000.00 400.00
2 LABOUR REMOVE/REFIX ACCIDENT DAMAGES PARTS TO New 1,000.00 300.00
KNOCK JACK ,CUT WELD AND REALIGN ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREA
3 CHECK WIRING SYSTEM & LIGHT New 100.00 30.00
4 ANTI RUST TREATMENT New 100.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,200.00 760.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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