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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No 18-9807198-R

Affiliated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16
CHARTIS BUILDING
SINGAPORE 0798120

Ref : CCA/AIG17023584/Ghb3

Date 12-12-2017

[N

Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGR 2858T Veh. Inspected SKV 8048P
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12M272017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modificatich
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Informatior
Accident Date  06/12/2017 Inspection Date 111212017
Survey held at ETHICARZ PTELTD
5a, Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




PARF/COE Rebale Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type

Cwner ID

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.

Wehicle to be Exported
Intended De-registration Date
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year

Engine Na.

Chassis No,

Maximum Power Output
Qpen Market Value

Original Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE ;Enp[:;v Date )
COE Category

COE Period(Years)

QP Paid

CCE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount

Singapore NRIC
£912H

SKVBO48P

No

13 Dec 2017
HONDA

VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Red

2015
L1584022755
RU11102746
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$19,709.00
010ct 2015
01Oct 2015

0

$9,709.00

Yes
30 Sep 2025
$7.281.00

30Sep 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW [130bhp)
10

£56,209.00

£43,827.00

$£51,108.00

The information contained hereln is correct as at 13 Dec 2017

hitps-/ivrllta.gov.sg/itafrlaction/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereginpul TFUNCTION_ID=F0304008TT

m
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- Pre repair inspection request - SKVBO48F VS SGRIYIYVL (U] donss s o =

e

. Pre repair inspection request - SKVB048P VS SGR2959T (Ol) DOA: 06/12/2017

From  Chan, Yoke Shi

Tp EssgrmEnts, Admin A

Ce Tan, Lity (AIG], Fong, Andy SY waur Balfil. Chin Lee-Ying. ADU wassm. Hoor Marizsa. Md jshak Mond I, Lim Sheng ¥ang
ant  Mongay, 11 Oecembat. 2017 11 4240 aM

apachments | | S0AZ9ST PALTIE

Hi,
Please refer to the enclosad request from Ethicarz Pte Lid

Kindly carry oul Policy coverage yarificationfirst before conducting the pra-repar inspechon within 48 hours

it you have any Queres/Concerms, please gl us KNOW,
vo piEpge ALsist tO NAVE SUTVEY by today Il possinle Loa m
Y
n
Thank you. '&!\h q%
Regards bﬁ

vaka Sh B Ashbry

AVG
Cim Adjuntet Y Singaptrs FNOL Clierrs Cuparghing = Ato
Sharel Setvices = talsysia | Giconl Busmels Sardiled

Al Shared Sarvices (M) Sein Bhd (887191-D)
frennra Worlidhante Levn 12, 158 iglae Bukit Bintang £5100 Kuala Lumpur My SiE

Tel 44 (13 2718 8000 | Ex 1202
ygkesh chanEiag com iprws E0G SO

Erom: John Ong [mnﬂxmdam@eﬂw:arz.sﬂ

sent: Monday, December 11, 2017 10:46 AM

To: Chan, Yoke Shi

Ce: Tan, Lly (AlG); Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran; Lim, Sheng
Yang

subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLESGR2959T AND SKVBO4EP ON
p6/12/2017

Dear Ashlay,
pleasa have anyone in LKK survey the vehicle.by today if possible.

Best Regards,
lohn Ong

sent from Mall for Windows 10

From: i
Sent: Manday, 11 December 2017 9:07 AM
To: claims@ethicalLig

Yang
Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCI DENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED vE-I'ICLESGH!EIEET AND SXVBDAEP ON 06/12/2017
Dear Switdadam,

Bamindar for pre-repait surney

https: Vsecuremail aig.com/formpostdir/safeformpost.aspy 11/12/2017



Vic (LKKAuto) S —

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 11:43 AM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng

Cec: Chan, Yoke Shi; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Lim, Sheng Yang; Admin A; Vic
{(LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 84758276745G-007, accident involving SGR2959T and SKVB048P on 6 Dec 2017

****| KK REF:CC4/AIG17023594/GHB3

Dear Chee Heng,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Vic,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-005% | emall: shupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Aik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408233)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng |[mailto:Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 B:42 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa AbuKassim@alg.com>; Lim,
Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>

Subject: B4758276745G-007, accident invalving SGR2959T and SKVB048P on & Dec 2017

Dear Sir,
Noted that SHD96B4B hit onto 3 parked vehicles, SLD5333T -> OV -> TPV,

Thus, BOLA 28 does not apply for this accident, Kindly assist to redirect PD claim from SKVB048P to the insurer of
SHD9G34B.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1881 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416



Chee-Heng L oh@aig.com | www.aig com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any altachments) is confidartial if you are not the infended reciplant, you must not use or disseminate the
imfarmation. If you have received this email in emor, please immedialely notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the onginal and any
copies or prinfouts thoreal. Although this email and any attachments are befieved fo be free of any wvirus or olher defect thal might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opaned. It is the responsibilty of the recipient to ensure that it is virus frea and no responsibility s
sccepled by AIG for any logs or damage arising in any veay from its use.

From: Chan, Yoke Shi

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2017 11:43 AM

To: assignments; Admin A

Cc: Tan, Lily (AIG); Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran;
Lim, Sheng Yang

Subject: algencrypt - Pre repair inspection request - SKVB048P VS SGR2959T (OI) DOA: 06/12/2017

Hi,
Please refer to the enclosed request from Ethicarz Pte Ltd.

Kindly carry out Policy coverage verification first before conducting the pre-repair inspection within 48 hours

If you have any queries/concems, please let us know.

** Please assist to have survey by today if possible.**

Thank you.

Regards,

Yoke Shi [@ Ashley

AIG

Claim Adjuster Il, Singapare FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Services — Malaysia | Global Business Services

AIG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (BB7191-D)
Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 198 Jalan Bukit Bintang. 55100 Kuala Lumpur. Malaysia
Tel +6 03 2719 6000 | Ext 1012102

yokeshi.chan@aig com | www.aig.com

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 1:53 PM

To: claims@ethicarz.sg; johnong@ethicarz.sg

Cc Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SKV 8048P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHCILES SGR 2959T AND SKV 8048P
ON 06/12/2017

Attachments: SGR 2959T STATEMENT pdf

Your Ref: SKV 8048P Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/AIG17023594/Ghb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHCILES SGR 2959T AND SKV 8048P ON 06/12/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the scenario, BOLA 28 (chain collision) is not applicable
for this matter. Please refer to our Insured’s stamen (enclosed).

As such, you may redirect the claim to the insurer of the taxi SHD 96848 instead.
We will now close the matter.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

LK = Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenial, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unimended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof. and inform the
sendar that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you



Vic !I.I(I{huto! —— e

From: Vic (LKKALto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 1:55 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Loh, Chee-Heng

Ce: Chan, Yoke Shi: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Lim, Sheng Yang: Admin A; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 84758276745G-007, accident involving SGR2959T and SKVB8048P on & Dec 2017

**** KK REF:CC4/AIG17023594/GHE3

Dear Chee Heng,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will inform TP to redirect claim and submit WP report.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

¥ Ctrn
LKK = Save the Earth- Print only when necessory:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items, Please delels the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 11:43 AM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng

Cc: Chan, Yoke Shi; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Lim, Sheng Yang; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: 84758276745G-007, accident involving SGR2959T and SKVB048P on 6 Dec 2017 ****LKK
REF:CC4/AIG17023594/GHB3

Dear Chee Heng,

Thank you for your email

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Vic,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng [mailto:Chee-Heng.Loh{@aig.com]
Sent: Thursday, 14 December, 2017 8:42 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Lim,

sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>
Subject: 84758276745G-007, accident involving SGR2959T and SKVB048P on 6 Dec 2017

Dear Sir,
Noted that SHD96848B hit onto 3 parked vehicles, SLD5333T -> OIV -> TPV,

Thus, BOLA 28 does not apply for this accident. Kindly assist to redirect PD claim from SKV8048P to the insurer of
SHDO96848B.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton \Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1881 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Chee-Heng.Loh@aig com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are nol the intended reciment, you mis! nol use or dizseminals the
information. If you have recevwed this email in emor, please immediately nofify me by "Raply" command and permarnently delele the angingl and any
coples or printouts thersof. Although this email and any altachments are believed to be free of any virus or other dafect thal might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient fo ensure that it is virus free and no responsibilty (s
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage ansing in any way from its use

From: Chan, Yoke Shi

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2017 11:43 AM

To: assignments; Admin A

Cc: Tan, Lily (AIG); Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran;
Lim, Sheng Yang

Subject: aigencrypt - Pre repair inspection request - SKV8048P VS SGR2959T (OI) DOA: 06/12/2017

Hi,

Please refer to the enclosed request from Ethicarz Pte Ltd.

Kindly carry out Policy coverage verification first before conducting the pre-repair inspection within 4B hours

If you have any queries/concemns, please let us know.

** please assist to have survey by today if possible **



Thank you.
Regards,

Yoke Shi @ Ashley

AIG

Claim Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL. Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Services — Malaysia | Global Business Services

AIG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887191-D)
Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 188 Jalan Bukit Bintang. 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tel +6 03 2719 6000 | Ext 1012102

yokeshi chan@aig.com | www.aig.com

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the onginal and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of ]

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked / Mo settlemant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING .
| Coase INut:rmu |Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Ad) Ryt Ad] Submittes | Ins Auth'ed Status
| 13 Dec 2017 Moer2017  Isg0.00 5$0.00 sy bl
Man | edimeg | - | Edi estimates || view Rpt |
: £an Agy Rpt | Cancel Case |

Main Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Imsured: |
Main Claimant | LIM MENG CHEE o
vehicie Reg. No.: ' SKVB048P 06/12/2017 00:00 - :59
Claim Type: ___|TP/ B4758276745G Policy/Cover Nots No.: (Comprehensive)
Vehicie Reg. No. [Tnsured): SGR2959T Palicy Mo. (Claimant):
Excess:

Ethicarz Pte Ltd {HQ) 56 LOYANG WAY £04-04 LOYANG ENTERPRISE BUILDING, SD8775 Loyang - Tel!
63844404

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Loh, Chee-Heng]
_|Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com |
Adjuster- Il.nuun Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by XING GUO QIANG] .. [Final Rpt
[ |due 21/12/2017]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case Mail |

Repairer:

Handiing Insurer;

There are no mail for this case,

View All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | Compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group Subject Handlar Assigned By Completed On Created On~ Done?
Mo results.
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Claim Documents

=*SKVB048P (B4758276745G)
[SGR2559T]
TP
LIM MENG CHEE
Dec 6 2017 12:00AM
[CHIA SEOW POH KAREN]
Ethicarz Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 4

Upload Documments | Upland Phatos | Compose New Letter |  Upioad vides |  upisad auaie | View [View i Browser| ]
|Photos/Images R - [3perpage (V]| B
No  Relabel/Reorder LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 14/1217 14117 | Odometer Reading ©!| Laars |2
2 14/12/17 14:12 | Chassis Number 0 awrs M
3 14/12/17 14112 | General View O eirc A
4  14/12/17 14112 | General View 0 lirc b
B 14/12/17 14112 | General View 0D edarc [
6 14/13/17 14112 | General View D lmarc
7 1412117 1412 | General View O wowc M
'8 114/12/17 14112 | General View O orc &2
9 1412417 1412 | General View Q| weows B
10 | 14/12/17 14:12 | General View 0D lwdwrce M
11 14/12/17 14112 General View Q idws |
(12 | 14/12/17 14:12 | General View @ icaws M
13 114/12/17 14:12 | General View QO lwws |
14 |14/12/17 14112 General View 0 ildwrc |
15 | 14/12/17 14:12 | Ganeral View O wurs &
16 |14/12/17 14:12 ‘mm Q| wdrs M
17 |14/12/17 14:12 | General View O e B
18 |14/12/17 14:12 | Ganeral View B lwdirs |
16 |14/12/17 14:12 | Ganeral View g Lt P | B
20 [14712/17 14:12 | General View 0| weowrs |
21 |14/12/17 14:12 | General View 0| icadic |
22 |14012117 14:12 | General View O waowrs R
23 |14/12/17 14:12  General View Q| ware @ |
24 (14/12/17 14:17 | General View Q! wars A |
25 1412117 1412 | General View @ | taaws |
26 |14/12/17 14:12 | General View 0| adws A |
27 141217 14:12 | General View Q| wuwrs B
28 14/12/17 14:12 | General View @ wewrs B |
14/12/17 14:12 | General View QO wdws
14/12/17 14:12 | General View Q| weows |2
31 [14/12/17 14:17 | General View Q| e |4
2 141217 1412 | Ganeral View ©! wawe A |
(33 [1412/17 1412 | General View @ | dws M
(34 [14/12/17 14112 Ganeral View @ wedwc |F |
35 |14/12/17 14112 | General View O warc |2 |
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36 Erum 14:12 1mﬂum - ﬂ Load ¥G | B4
37 14/12/17 14:12 | General View | loadirs
38 14/12/17 14:12 | General View O waws B |
38 14/12/17 14112 | Ganaral View @ aews B |
40 18/12/17 14:12 General View @ | weows |G
a1 141217 14:12 | General View ©| weows |
4z 1471217 1412 | General View Q| wors o
a1 14207 14012 Tm;uy @ laws A
44 14/12/17 1412 General View Q| wors B
las 14/12/17 14:12 | Ganerst view 0B wawrc |
46 |14/12/17 14:12  General View ©!| wedrs |
47 |18/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo O wairs &
|48 |14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photn Q| wadws |
|48 | 14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo é ad s | BA
'S0 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo | waowrs &
's1 |14/12/17 14:16 | Rainspection Photo Q| wurs & |
52 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo @ wars |
53 |14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo O o B |
54 14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo 0O wuwre (A |
|55 | 14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo Hﬁ " Load PG = ]
i??. 14/12/17 14:16 _ | Reinspection Photn O ladws M |
fsr 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo O e B |
|58 [14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo @ toacws @ |
55 | 14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo O i |
60 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo O wore |4
1 | 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0 i |F
62 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| wadres A
63 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo O wars B
64 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo QO lodwc &
65 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo Q| s R
66 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| wwawr ¢
|67 |14/12/17 14:15 | Reinspection Pholo ©| wairs A
68 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo O | weows |
69 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| wadirc |4
|T_?_1 14/12/17 14:16 | Relnspection Photo QO wors |2
71 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo O wwows [
72 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo Q| Lediwc |4
173 |14/12/1714:16 | Reinspection Photo © | adws M
74 14/12/17 14:16 |Reinspection Photo @ wors B
175 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0 s &
76 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Phato O wows &
::r:r 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| wadws |4
78 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Phaoto 0| tosews A
79 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 8| tosaws 4
80 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo load ¥G | M
81 |14/13/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo lead pG | A
82 | 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo O wawrs M
83 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| waws &
84 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 1@ waws |2
II 14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo ©| waws A
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86 lunmr 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0| Locadiec 1

87 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo © | Loadrs

B8 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo QO wawre M

B3 |14/12/17 13116 |Reinspection Photo 0 iodws |

a0 |14/12/17 14:16 | Relnspection Photo 0 ilcedwc |BA

91 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Phota 0 leers B

92 14712117 14:16 | Reinspection Photo Q i=owc M

03 |14/12/17 1416 Reinspection Photo QO (locaaws M

94 |14/12/17 14116 Reinspection Photo Q| waws M

las il?uniq-.l; Reinspection Phota 8 lcawre

196 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo - O (eorc H

97 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo D wrs &

98 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Phota Q| wedwc M

9% |14/12/17 14:16 | Rainspection Phota 0 learc B
100 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0 twaws

101 |14/12/17 14:16 | Rainspection Photo 0O lsows M

102 [14/12/17 14116 | Reinspection Phota 0| eaws B

103 [14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0O ladwc M

104 [14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo é Load 7G| B4

105 |14/12/17 14:16  Reinspection Photo @ iowws |

106 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Phote Q| leawc H

107 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Phota 0 lwdwrs B

108 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0 ileiwe M

109 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo —_ D (=dwc |

110 |14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo 0 o ™~ rm

111 14/12/17 14:16 | Reinspection Photo D ledirc (B
Documentation [eecpege 1|62

No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) . Thumbnaill | Print
1 12/12/17 17:08  EMAIL FROM AIG DD 11122017 ' Load BOF

2 [12/12/1717:08  |WKSPNOTICE Lbad POV !
1 14/12/17 09:12 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load PDF
4 14/12/17 05:12 TP GIA REPORT Load PDF
5 14/12/17 12:54  EMAIL FROM AIG 3 Load PDF |
6 | 14/12/17 14:03  EMAIL T AIG Load POF l
7 14/12171%:03  EmAmTOTR o @ | tosapor |
|Ne  [Finahzed On AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print I
't 13/12/17 10:50 | OI GIA REPORT @ | iosdvoF |

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

neset | save | prm |

There are no document checkiists configured.

Show Remarks To: || Handling Insurer
Nt ! fUTIreS Wew Drrne unsEsn you Nhow i)t SENer artes
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg ho 1sss07108m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto com;assignments@lkkauio.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG17023584/GHB30Q2

Date: 26/01/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid Policy No:
Claimant Vehicle skvaosar Insured Vehicle No :  SGR2056T
Date of Loss: 06/12/2017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No. B4758276745G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKVa048P
Make & Modal: ADIVA ADZ00A, 200cc (M) Engine No: L15B4022755
Reg. Date: 011D/2015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No RU11102746
Colour Red Cdometer: 37528 km
Engine Capacity 1486 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condilion: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITICN OF TYRES
From Tyre Size: 215/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60 R18
Front Lefl Side: Dunlop B mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop B mm
Froni Right Side: Dunlop 68 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 6 mm
The above valbes represent the remaining fyre indads ceplh
COSTOF CLAMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous |lems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 0.00 0.00 D.00
Paintwork Labour 000 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (58) 0.00 D.00 0.00
Global Sum Settlament (S5) D.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 11122017
Date Inspacted 111122017 Inspecied At Ethicarz Pla Lid (HQ)

58 LOYANG WAY #04-04 LOYANG

ENTERFRISE BUILDING

Singapore 508775
Estimated Penod of Repair: 7.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUD QIANG Manager: VIC ALPEH
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NOTE This report represents our findings & the time and place of inspection staled hersin. Such nspection has been camed oul to the beat of our
knowledge and abity but any offver Nabildy under any ofher circumsfances il heredy expressly sxchuded
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Recommended Parts
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No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount
1 1 *FRONT HEAD LAMP (R) Cracked 0.00F ~F
2 1 *FRONT HEAD LAMP CLIP (R) Mot Necessary 0.00F ~F
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER Nol Necessary D.0OF *-F
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLIP Mol Necessary D.00F *F
5 2 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (L&R) Nol Necessary D.00F *F
6§ 1 *FRONT BUMPER RETAINER (L&R} 0/S Necessary 0.00F *.F
7 1 ‘FRONT BONNET Mot Necessary D.00F “~F
8 1 *FRONT FENDER (R) Buckled 0.00F *-F
g 1 *FRONT FENDER COWLING CLIP (R) Necessary 0.00F “F
0 1 *FRONT FENDER COWLING GARNISH [R) Deformed 0.00F =~F
1" 1 *FRONT FENDER COWLING GARNISH CLIP (R) Necessary 0.00F “F
12 1 ‘FRONT DOOR (R) Buckled D.00F *F
13 1 *FRONT DOOR POWER MOTOR (R} Not Necessary 0.00F *F
14 1 *FRONT DOOR REGULATOR (R} Bent D00F *F
15 1 *FRONT DOOR WINDOW STICKER (R) WNecessary D.00F *F
16 1 *FRONT DOOR LOCK (R) Not Necessary 0.00F *-F
s [f SR | *FRONT DOOR HANDLE (R) Mot Necessary 0.00F ~F
18 1 *FRONT DOOR OUTER MOULD [R) Mot Necessary D.00F *F
19 1 *FRONT DOOR BOARD (R) Mot Necessary 0.00F ~F
20 1 *FRONT DOOR WEATHER STRIP (R) Necessary D.00F *F
21 1 *FRONT DOOR PILLAR (R) Repair 0.00F “F
2 1 *FRONT DOOR HINGE UP /DOWN (R} Bent 0.00F *-F
23 1 ‘FRONT DOOR CHECKER (R) Bent 0.00F *-F
24 1 *FRONT DORO INNER WEATHER STRIP (R) Not Necessary 0.00F *F
25 1 *FRONT DOOR LOWER RUBBER (R) Mecessary 0.00F ~F
2 1 *FRONT FENDER INNER PANEL (R) Repair 0.00F ~F
27 1 *FRONT ROCKER PANEL (R) Buckled 0.00F ~F
28 1 *FRONT ROCKER PANEL GARNISH (R) Deformed D.00F “F
29 1 *FRONT ROCKER PANEL GARNISH CLIP (R) Necessary D.00F ~F
3 1 *FRONT DOOR STEP GARNISH (R) Not Necessary 0.00F “F
N 1 *FRONT DOOR STEP GARNISH CLIP (R) Not Necessary 0.00F “F
3z 1 ‘FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULD Mot Necessary 0.00F *F
3 1 *FRONT TYRE ABSORBER (R) Mot Necessary D.00F ~F
34 1 *FRONT TYRE KNUCKLE (R) Mol Necessary 0.00F *F
B 1 *FRONT TYRE KNUCKLE BEARING (R) Necessary 0.00F ~-F
8 1 *FRONT TYRE LOWER ARM Mol Necessary 0D.00F *F
v 1 *FRONT RIM (R} Mot Necessary D.00F =
s 1 *FRONT TYRE (R) Scratched 0.00F “F
i\ 1 ‘FRONT DOOR PILLAR SEALANT (R) Mot Necessary D.00F "-F
40 1 *ROCKER PANEL SEALANT (R) Mol Necessary 0.00F *F
41 1 *FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS SEALANT (R) Mot Necessary 0.00F “F
F=Franchise pan

Total Parts (S§) 0.00 0.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
Thare are no new miscollanoous Hems solected.
Recommended Labour
There are no labour itermm selected.
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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