Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd. <Ibaautomotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2018 11:07 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LBA1217-2362_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON
11/12/2017

Importance: High

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Zaini,

We confirmed acceptance your offer of settlement S 2980/- all in.

Thanks & Best Regards

Ms Karen

LBA Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-47 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6509 5521

Fax: 6509 5523

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 2 February, 2018 9:43 AM

To: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd.

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LBA1217-2362_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON 11/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Karen,
We refer to your email below.

For a quick and amicable settlement, we revised our offer to settle global sum at §$ 2,980.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.
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Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd. [mailto:Ibaautomotive@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 5:15 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LBA1217-2362_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON 11/12/2017
Importance: High

Dear Zaini,
We would like to counter propose as below

COR $ 2450.00
LOU $500.00 ( 5 days ) 1.8cc vehicle
LTA/EFILE $34.35

Please look into the matter and revert soon.

Thanks & Best Regards

Ms Karen

LBA Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-47 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6509 5521

Fax: 6509 5523

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 24 January, 2018 9:12 AM

To: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd.

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LBA1217-2362_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON 11/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Karen,
We refer to your email below.

For a quick and amicable settlement, we revised our offer to settle global sum at S$ 2,880.00 (all in)




Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd. [mailto:Ibaautomotive@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 January 2018 2:41 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LBA1217-2362_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON 11/12/2017
Importance: High

Dear Zaini,
We would like to counter propose as below.

COR $2450.00
LOU $500.00
LTA/EFILE $34.35

Our client vehicle is 1.8cc, please look into the matter again.

Thanks & Best Regards

Ms Karen

LBA Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-47 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6509 5521

Fax: 6509 5523

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 January, 2018 9:35 AM

To: LBA Automotive Pte. Ltd.

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: LBA1217-2362_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON 11/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Your Ref: LBA1217-2362
Our Ref: CC6/CT117023581/Uka3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 8153X & GBD 4700S ON 11/12/2017
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$$ 2,730.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)




