Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September, 2018 10:47 AM

To: claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Pegasus Ref: SM347112017; Accident involving SLL9957A

(GAIC) & SLK520R (AIG) on 26.11.2017 LKK REF CC6/AIG17023571/Uhb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sharon,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our principal would like to do Direct Settlement for this matter.

Kindly withdraw lawyer claim and forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with
the settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg [mailto:claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 20 July, 2018 9:18 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Pegasus Ref: SM347112017; Accident involving SLL9957A (GAIC) & SLK520R (AIG) on
26.11.2017 LKK REF CC6/AIG17023571/Uhb3

Dear Vic,

Your insured was compounded so what are we waiting for?
Pls reply to us by today.

Best regards,
Pegasus (p)



From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 5:07 PM

To: Pegasus Engineering

Cec: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) ; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) ; Admin A ; Vic (LKKAuto) ; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) ; Zaini (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Pegasus Ref: SM347112017; Accident involving SLL9957A (GAIC) &
SLK520R (AIG) on 26.11.2017 LKK REF CC6/AIG17023571/Uhb3

Your Ref: SLL 9957A “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”

Our Ref: CC6/AIG17023571/Uhb3

Dear Alvin,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLK 520R AND SLL 9957A ON 26/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. Below screenshot is a copy of our insured's
accident statement for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our
OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal
assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.



Rel+ 2d Vehicle | SLK520R (Car) Contact No,| s
Hospital/Clinic | NIL Class of Class: NIL
Driving Date of Expiry:
Licence &
- Expiry Date
| Date Treatment | NIL Daie Discharge | NIL
| No_ of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL Degree of Injury | NIL
Brief Details.

On the above mentioned date and time, | was driving my vehicle SLK520R along D

Cllty with a passenger. | was driving along the third lane. Near to the Shell PﬂWkaL;TT:gi:i
| intended to change to the second lane. | procesded to merge into the second lane. Suddenly
SLLO957A came from my right and into the second lane in front of me. | drove along as there v
collision. About six minutes later, the same vehicle abruptly cut into my lane again and stoppec
my vehicle. | managed to stop in time. The driver, a male Chinese in his fifties alleged that | kn
his vehicle. | made a check on the front right side of my vehicle and it was slightly damaged. |t
of the accident and bath parties left. | decided not 1o maka a Police report or claim from insurar

sorry that he is a private hire car driver in his fifties. Thinkl i [
et byl s Ng that he is trying to make a living. |

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient.
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe
that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the
e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims @pegasusengrg.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 9 December, 2017 4:56 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cec: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: Check Liability - Pegasus Ref: SM347112017; Accident involving SLL9957A (GAIC) &
SLKS520R (AIG) on 26.11.2017

Dear Zaini,

We refer to the above matter.



Please look into the matter and reply by 13.12.2017 (Wed) whether AIG is agreeable to direct settle with us
at 100% liability for this case.

Thanks & Regards,

Alvin Low

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10

Singapore 539216

Tel : 6858 1846
Fax : 6487 6070
Email : claims @pegasusengre.com.sg




