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Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 5:47 PM
To: 'kaimotor'
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE Toyota Hiace Van No PC 1372 P & SJS 5858 R 

on 28112017
Attachments: ATA form.pdf; RV AIG PC1372P 28112017.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Kym, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
We confirmed the above settlement at $3,244.35 (all in) 
 
Kindly refer to the attachments above and forward your signed DV, ATA form and LTA Search document for our 
necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: kaimotor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 4:38 PM 
To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE Toyota Hiace Van No PC 1372 P & SJS 5858 R on 28112017 
 
LTA $5.35 Are attached.....   
 
 
 
Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone. 
 
-------- Original message -------- 
From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>  
Date: 5/3/18 4:28 PM (GMT+08:00)  
To: "Zaini (LKK Auto)" <Zaini@lkkauto.com>  
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE Toyota Hiace Van No PC 1372 P & SJS 5858 R on 
28112017  
 
 
Hi Zaini, 
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We propose settlement as follows: -  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,889.00 
2. Loss of Use(5days x $670.00) $    350.00 

TOTAL $ 3,189.00 
 
3.  LTA Search Fee                                                                $5.35   incl 
    
Thanks you. 
 
Ms Kym 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

      
 
 
 
 
On 2 March 2018 at 09:43, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Your Ref: PC 1372P 

Our Ref: CC6/AIG17023541/Uka3 

  

Dear Ms Kym, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 5858R & PC 1372P ON 28/11/2017 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,889.00 
2. Loss of Use(5days x $60.00) $    300.00 
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TOTAL $ 3,189.00 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 5:14 PM 
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) 
<Zaini@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE Toyota Hiace Van No PC 1372 P & SJS 5858 R on 28112017 

  

Our Ref :(PC 1372 P)       

        
Date : 01/03/2018   

 
   

        
Attn: The Motor Claims Department   WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Your Insured veh no :  SJS 5858 R      
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.   (By Email Only) 
78 Shenton Way        
# 07-16 Chartis Building      
Singapore 079120       

        
Dear Sir / Madam       

        
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE Toyota Hiace Van No PC 1372 P & SJS 5858 R on 28/11/2017 
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We have been authorised by M/S Foo Hai Buddhish cultural and Welfare Association, the owner of  
vehicle number  PC 1372 P, to claim against the party /parties responsible for the damages arising  
from the above mentioned accident.     

        

        
Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number ( SJS 5858 R) at the material time of the  
accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, ( M/S Foo Hai Buddhish cultural and Welfare Association). 

        

        
As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management of 
your insured’s vehicle number  ( SJS 5858 R), our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have been put  
to loss and damage as follows:      

        

        

 (1) Cost of repair              $           2,889.00  

 (2) Loss of use for 3days at $80.00per day (or rental fees)    $               240.00  

 (3) PIR 2days      $               160.00  

 (4) LTA Search Fee      $                   5.35  

        

        

 A cope of each of the following supporting  documents is enclosed:  
        

 (a) Final repair bill      

 (b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)   

 (c) LTA Search      

        

        

Thank you. 

  

  

Ms Kym 
 
Kai Motor Trading 
 
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  
Singapore 408701  
Telephone: 6747 4006 

  

  

On 27 December 2017 at 16:41, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Zaini , 

  


