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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:

Dear Chin Kiat,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Tuesday, 12 December,2017 8:03 AM
'Ong Chin Kiat'
SUR
RE: Market Value for SJK8535U - Date of Accident: 08.12.2017

The market value for SJK 8535U is S18K-S19K (EST) as at Dec 2OL7.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-43L5

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue L,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat Imailto:chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 3:06 PM

To: Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Ml
<mi@aispl.com.sg>; Vin's Automotive Group <vinsa uto87@ya hoo.com.sg>
Subject: Market Value for SJK8535U - Date of Accident: 08.L2.2077

Hi all,

Can assist to check market value for SJK8535U?

Date of accident: 08.12.2017

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 62257402 | chinkiat one@se.msie-asia.com
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MSIG lnsurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 I Tel +65 6220 9644 I Fax
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CONFIDENTiALITY NOTICE
This e-rnail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person
other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it, If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner lDType

Owner lD

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported

lntended De-registration Date

Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour

Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassis No.

Maximum Power Output

Open Market Value

Original Registration Date

First Registration Date

Transfer Count

ActualARF Paid

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

COE Category

COE Period(Years)

QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount

n.t -\- \ \[qssl 
- \t\'s(\

Singapore NRIC

g2t5D

sJK8535U

No

\7Dec2077

HONDA

crvc l.6lsAr

Brown

2008
'iliear+oor+or

)HMFD462095200g6,2

92.0 kW (123 bhp)

$21,476.OO

06 Nov2008

06 Nov2008

0

$2t,476.OO

Yes

05 Nov 2018 ,t/
$!o,738.oo/>

05 Nov 2018

a- cai (roOOcc & below)

1o

$10,989.00

$eeo.oo

$11,728.OO

The information contained herein is correct as at 7!Dec2O!7
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hftps:l!rl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_lD=F03M009TT 1t1


