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From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Qhen (LKKAuto)

Veron Chen (LKl(Auto)
Monday, 11December,2017 4:01 PM

Sim, Priscilla-LK; SUR
RE:'OC 8013870067SG / SFD60682 Dateof accident 4Dec2017

Dear Ms Sim,

The market value for sFD 6o68lis s76K-s80K (EST) as at Dec 2OL7.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue L,#02-?5 | S(40S933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK Imailto:Priscilla-lf .Sim@aig'com]

Sent: Friday, S December,2OtT 4:t7 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; rogassociates@gmail.com; Alvin Yit (alvinyit@fta.com.sg) <alvinyit@fta.com.sg>

subject: oc 8013870067SG / SFD 60682 Date of accident 4 Dec 2OL7

HiAII

Kindly assist with market value.

Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims I AIG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore A79L2O

Tel +(65) 6479 LTss I Fax +(65) 683574LG

priscilla-lk.sim@a!s.com I www.aie.com.se

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK
Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 3:44 PM

To: SUR (suiOtKkauto.com); rogassociates@qmail.com; Alvin Yit (alvinyit@fta.com.sg)

suu;ect'rw: oo / 8772}O2BL2SG / SJW 793E Date of accident 24 Nov 2017

Lt$'l

HiAII



Kindly assist with market value.

Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims I AIG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079t2O

Tel +(65) 6419 1755| Fax+(55) 683574L6
ofjgcjlla-!h.sim(aaie.com I www.ais'com.ss

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you

must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately

notiry me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof'

Although tttis emlii and any attachmints are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect

any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure

that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries

or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use'

L'



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page I of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner lD Type

Owner ID

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.

Vehicle ro be Exported

I ntended De-registration Date

Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour

Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassis No.

Maximum Power Output

Open Market Value

Original Registration Date

First Registration Dale

Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibiliry Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date

COE Category

COE PeriodlYears)

QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount

Totel Rebate Amounf

The infomration contained herein is correct as at 08 Dec 20 I 7

OK 1['b

Doff I *lr'lr?

SingaporeNRlC 
G\6/

2788C

sFD6068Z

No

29 Dec201'1

NISSAN

NOTE I.2 DIG.S CVT 2WD LED

Red

2016

HRl22t46578

JNITBAEI2ZO982885

72.0 kW (96 bhp)

$ 14,938.00

19 Dec 2016

l9 Dec 2016

0

$5,000.00

Yes

l8 Dec 2026

$3,750.00

I 8 Dec 2026

A - Car up to l600cc & 97kW 1130bhp)

l0

$48,000.00

$43,045.00

$46,795.00

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ltalvrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FuNcTI... 121812017


