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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

35 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref . CS/FCHT023455/Agb

Date: 11-12-2017

A

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA T867U Veh. Inspected SGD 93121
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim Mo. D17011334MFSH Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From  CWS (JOANNE YONG) Assign Date 111212017
2. ‘Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ' c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/12/2017 Inspection Date 12n2r20:7
Survey held at MCS GARAGE
10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2
#03-25 FIRST EAST CENTRE
SINGAPORE 417868
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 625363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D17011334MFSH Date: 19 March 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI17023455/Agb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SGD 9312L .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 13/12/2017 at the premises of M/s MCS GARAGE. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8§  11.632.28 .

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2.,500.00 (Lump Sum) .
“Check” Items Amount ' 5% - .

Market Value : 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value : S8 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



First Capital Insurance Limited

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

og-12-2017 Our Ref No. D17011334MFSH
06-12-2017 Claim Type. Third Party
SHATBETU Third Party Vehicle, SGDS312L

10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #03-25 FIRST EAST CENTRE
MR KENDRICK

Q2To0e 7y e2700a T Fax No. 0
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MNA Fax Mo. 68416315

MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

MCS GARAGE
VISION LAW LLC

Attention. NIL
TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

This is a computer generated letler, no signature required.

Claims Departments & Motor Underwriting Department : 36 Mobinson Road 81601 Cily House Singap
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

f

From: Shiau Chan {LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 March 2018 11:56 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments

Cc: JOANMNEYOMNG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17011334MFSHAN
Attachments: CSFCI17023455Agb.pdf

Dear Joanne,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SGD 9312L.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 December 2017 6:11 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@first-
insurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: JOANNEYONG@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.5G; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17011334MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGD 9312L 13/12/2017
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Denlse Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4085933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 3:.07 FM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: JOANMEYONG@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17011334MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 Decembar, 2017 6:11 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments
Ce: JOANNEYONG@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17011334MFSHN

Dear Sir/Madam

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGD 9312L 13/12/2017
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 3:07 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@first-insurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: JOANNEYONG@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17011334MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: Azs6-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System EmaiIU:J:cw5mc:turclai.ms@first-insurance.cum,sg]
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 2:26 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.5G; JOANNEYONG@FIRST-INSURANCE.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D17011334MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Limited



MCS Garage

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2 #03-25, First East Centre Singapore 471868
Tel:92700917 6538 4322

Vehicle No.:SGD 9312L Model: BMW 420i

QTY List Price:

Rear bumper '

Rear bumper difusser

Rear bumper reflector- R/L @ 89.95

Rear bumper PDC sensor @ 313.75 e
Rear bumper top guide

Rear bumper CTR pad

Rear bumper side guide- R/L @ 89.50
Rear bumper reinforcement ol
Rear bumper side brackets- R/L @ 65.00 '
Rear exhaust insulator ',

Rear exhaust mountings @ 42.50 |

P 7" T ™ S <5 SN S GR N J S S S S Y NG T S G Y

Rear end panel

Less 5%
Subtotal

Special Nett Items:

1 Rear exhaust muffler sport assy 20
1Set Rear bumper matte sticker fpns

Subtotal

Page 1aof 2

Prices §

1583.86 ~
641.23 ~
179.90
1255.00° °'°
145.00 .
131.50

179.00 ~
745.00 1
130.00
160.95

127.50
1018.20 -

6297.14
(314.86)

5982.28

3500.00 7

?BD‘G&' 4/8Y

4100.00



Vehicle No.:SGD 9312L

Labour Charges:

To checking R/electrical wiring 50.00 -
To remove, refix R/interior trims to assist repair 120.00 ~
To remove, refix exhaust silencer o 120.00 -~
To respray undercoating R 60.00
To respray painting and etc 600.00 -
Panel beating, remove and replacing above parts Ej_ifﬂ@'.'ljﬁ »$9

Subtotal 1550.00

ESTIMATE PARTS AND LABOUR GRAND TOTAL $ 11632.28

Page 2 of 2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19.9607193-R

' ’d 74

:J,_C_.

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CSIFCI17023455/Aqbn2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068577 Date 29:03:2018 ” ‘llmlmlml|l‘m
Code: FCIZ2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 7BETU Veh. Inspected SGD9312L
Policy No. D-15072701MFSH Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D17011334MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 1122m7
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW c.C 1997
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WBA4A12010GK0E028 Colour SILVER
Odometer 43900 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |255/35 R20 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |255/35 R20 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/35 R20 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/35 R20 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 06122017 Inspection Date 131272017
Survey held at MCS GARAGE
10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2
#03-25 FIRST EAST CENTRE
SINGAPORE 417868
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Pl Pl 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
/"’_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page No.10f 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGD 9312L
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition || "SUTAC ?;}l ﬁi"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,583.86 1,583.86
1|REAR BUMPER DIFUSSER DEFORMED 641.23 641.23
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR-R/L [@%B89.95 NOT NECESSARY 178.80 -
4|REAR BUMPER FDC SENSOR @3$313.75 DAMAGED (1 PC 1,255.00 313.76
OMNLY)
1|REAR BUMPER TOF GUIDE NOT NECESSARY 145.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER CTR PAD NOT NECESSARY 131.50
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE GUIDE-R/L @%89.50 NOT NECESSARY 179.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 745.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKETS-R/L @$65.00 NOT NECESSARY 130.00
1|REAR EXHAUST INSULATOR NOT NECESSARY 160.95 -
3|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @542 .50 NOT NECESSARY 127.50 -
1|REAR END PANEL NOT NECESSARY 1,018.20 -
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -314 B6 -126.54
508228 2,411.90
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR EXHAUST MUFFLER SPORT ASSY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 3,500.00 d
1|SET REAR BUMPER MATTE STICKER (SN) MECESSARY B00.00 300.00
4,100.00 3a00.00
LABOUR
TO CHECKING R/IELECTRICAL WIRING, 50.00 30.00
TO REMOVE,REFIX RAINTERIOR TRIMS TO ASSIST NOT NECESSARY 120.00 3
REPAIR.
TO REMOVE, REFIX EXHAUST SILENCER NOT NECESSARY 120.00 1
TO RESPRAY UNDERCOATING, NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
TO RESPRAY PAINTING AND ETC. £00.00 250.00
PANEL BEATING,REMOVE AND REPLACING ABOVE 600.00 250,00
PARTS
1,550.00 530.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,632.28 3,241.90

Report Ref No. CS/IFCI17023455/Agbn2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI17023455/Agbn2

%g‘
ADRIAM LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI|

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repert is made sobely for the wse and banalit of the Client named an the front page of this Report.

N liabltty of responsibility whatsoey i whidly or in part. Any third party acting or replying on this
Report in whode or in par, doss o al his or her own risk,




