Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 10:44 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <Seek instruction> Your Ref: 5062096631SG *Our Ref: CC3/AIG17023449/Kpa3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBF 4085Z(0Ol) /SHF 513K(TP)/ OTHERS ON 06/12/2017]

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Please be informed that BOLA 28(l) is applicable for this accident. Furthermore, PIR is only applicable for 2 car
collision.
Hence, we will need to settle claim from both SHF513K & SGU3032U.

You may attempt to redirect the claim to the insurer of SLJ7018J(AXA) for the matter but we will have to settle the
claim eventually if TPI denies the claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, May 05, 2018 2:07 PM

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ

Subject: <Seek instruction> Your Ref: 5062096631SG *QOur Ref: CC3/A1G17023449/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
FBF 4085Z(0I) /SHF 513K(TP)/ OTHERS ON 06/12/2017]

Your Ref: 5062096631SG
Our Ref: CC3/AIG17023449/Kpa3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBF 4085Z(Ol) /SHF 513K(TP)/ OTHERS ON 06/12/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Third party reported that he was sending his passenger along PIR. He looked at the rear mirror, he saw OID
lost control of his bike and collided onto third party taxi.

Our insured rider reported that he was riding on the 2nd lane of PIE towards changi airport. Suddenly SLJ
7018J who was travelling on his right changed lane and resulted the accident. The impact caused our
insured rider to loose balance and thereafter he was thrown out of his motorbike and landed on the 2nd
lane.

There was no video/witness statement from both parties.



We have contacted OID to verify the nature of accident. He was unable to confirm if his motorbike had hit
onto third party taxi as he was unconscious after the collision.

We noted that police investigation result(PIR) shows that SLJ 7018J had been charged by traffic police.

In view of the above, kindly advise if we may re-direct the claim to the insurer of SLJ 7018J or else advise
further instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



