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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapaore 408933

TEL: 6255 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Ref : CS/SMO17023431/Dvb

50 RAFFLES PLACE l
oue rezor | [NHHHNIN
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGG 3535 Veh. Inspected SJL 5668G
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1704428/NSWY Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEQ Assign Date 11122017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre Imim
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5i General Information
Accident Date  08/12/2017 Inspection Date 1122017
Survey held at TEAMWORK GARAGE FTE LTD
53 UBI AVENUE 1
#01-24
SINGAPORE 408934,
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




ek Consultants
SR BE B Pte Ltd

-" !' lj Aulo

Company Registration No. 1936071988

21 URLAVE 1, 202.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (065) 61564315

Your ref’ CMTD1704428/NSW
Our ref: CS/SM0O17023431/Dvb

The Motor Claims Department

M/s Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.S]JL 5669G

We thank you for your instruction on

11/12/2017

Date: 20/12/2017

Without Prejudice

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd  and have

11/12/2017
the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Ttems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

Bryan Ang
Automotive Assessor / [nvestigator

: S5

8,449.00

: 535

3,747.82

+ 53

1 5%

1 5%

: 5%




Policy Type: OD / TP/ TP RES / TL / EVA

Admin (

Case Handler

_5urve§ Department Check List (Case Handler)
Reference No. : CEISle‘b:ﬁ%'.

Typist

}_' Case handler to make sure all Information created by the assignment team are ACCURATE.

(1) Office Assign Form

C

A AOaoanoannnn 0

Surveyor (

_Reference MNo.

Customer Code
Assign From

‘Assign Date

Veh No (Inspected)

‘Veh No (Insured)
D.O.A

Policy No

Claim No

Insurance Authorisation (CA /REV/REP)
Report Type

Weekend Charges

Survey held at/Repairer

Excess

(1) Assignment Form

C

ZHHZNO=2 2 22 0020220

=

Vehicle No

Regn Maonth,/Year
Vehicle Type
Make & Model

(Engine Capacity. (C.C)

Colour
Odometer. [Sp.Reading)
Chassis No

_Generai Condition

Steering

Brake

Modification (Modi)
Tyre Size

‘Tyre Make
Tyre Balance

Date of Inspection
Survey held
Des.of Damages

(2) System - (Views/Merimen)

C

Damaged Vehicle Photographs Uploaded

(3) Workshop Estimate/Assignment Form

M

O o0;m

C

ALL Parts condition

:Market Value for OD cases
Estimate Repair Cost for PRI (RSI, TMI, MSIG)

Days of repair
Finalised Amount

Re-inspection Cases to Finalize within 5 Days

(4) System - (Views/Merimen)

C

Resurvey photo Uploaded

CheckBy: [ VERON  Jotlll4

Case Handler ‘Date

*C: Critical *N: Non-Critical

Y-Date

N-Date

¥-Date

N-Date

L

<SP R

AN

SUSISISINIS] SIS SIS NSNS s ]

AYAS

): Case handler to make sure the surveryor completed all required information.

21/05/2014



_ eron Chen !LKKAutul !

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: VWednesday, 20 December, 2017 8:21 AM

To: 'Teo, Grace'

Ce: 'Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn'; 'Henry, Irene James'; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1704428/NSW - Accident involving SGG3535J & SJL5669G on 06.12.2017
Attachments: S.JL 5669G PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Grace,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIL 5669G
Date of survey: 11/12/2017
Number of days:5 days

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

.
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 11:27 AM
To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn' <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: CMTD1704428/NSW - Accident involving SGG3535] & 5JL5669G on 06.12.2017
E

Dear Grace,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 10:18 AM

To: admin-d@|kkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: TEAMWOREK GARAGE CLAIMS <claims@teamworkgarage.com>; Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn

<Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.hen SOMpPO.COM.SE>
Subject; CMTD1704428/NSW - Accident involving 5GG3535) & 5IL5669G on 06.12.2017



Hi, -

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SJL5669G. .

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

Innovation for Wath?'tn_u A C f T
@ Sovro s

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our
Privacy Paolicy

From: TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2017 10:05 AM

To: Teo, Grace

Cc: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn; Henry, Irene James; claims@teamworkgarage.com

Subject: RE: CMTD1704428/NSW - Accident involving SGG3535] & SIL5669G on 06.12.2017
Importance: High

Dear Sir,
We have agreed and selected the surveyor / surveyor company proposed by you to conduct the pre-repair
inspection as a single joint expert whereby the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by single joint

expert will be bear by you. o

We have selected :

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

as the motor surveyor / surveyor company named in your attached list.

Kindly forward your assignment to them asap so that we can arrange for the survey with them.

*Do get the surveyor | surveyor office to check with us on the availability of the car at the workshop before sending their
surveyor down for PRI survey. We'll not be held responsible for wasted trips made to the workshop.

Darren Ng

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475



Fax: 68442474

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 1:14 PM

To: claims@teamworkgarage.com

Cc: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg=>
Subject: CMTD1704428/NSW - Accident involving SGG3535) & SJL5669G on 06.12.2017

Importance: High

Our Reference: CMTD1704428/NSW
Your Reference: SIL5669G
Without Prejudice

Date: 8" December 2017

Attention:
M/S Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 08/12/2017.

Please be informed that Shawn Ngo the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the
joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
2 | LKK Auto Consultants Kenneth Kong (Narth area)

Marcus Chua (East area)

Mohd Rasul (West area)

Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffery Ong
4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek
5 | In House surveyor Teo See Ling

L1
]
\
Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the

pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Yours faithfully,



Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Innovation for Wellbeing
@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your persanal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our
Privacy Policy

From: Team-.n;lurk Garage Pte Ltd [mailto:claims@ rage.com]
Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 11:58 AM
To: Claims - Motor Survey; claimsreport; Henry, Irene James

Cc: claims@teamworkgarage.com
Subject: CMTD1704428/NSW PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTIFICATION FOR SLG5669G

Importance: High
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

OUR REF: 1712-13
YOUR REF: 5GG3535)

Dear SirfMadam,

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SJL5669G
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIL5669G AND SGG3535J) ON 06.12.17

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client’s GIA report and Notification of Pre-repair inspection
for your attention.

Please let us have your list of surveyors for us to select as stated in the Practice Direction — Amendment No. 1 of 2016;
Pre-action Protocol within 2 working days as of the date of our notice to you.

Please take note: We will not entertain any of your surveyor calling us for the above inspection, without you giving
us your list of surveyors for us to select by the Practice Direction of Pre-repair Inspection.

Thank you.
Regards,

Alison

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-24

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934



Tel: ARA4 2475
_ Fax:6844 2474



Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto) —

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 10:18 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS; Mgo, Sau Wei Shawn; Henry, Irene James
Subject: CMTD1704428,/MNSW - Accident involving SGG3535) & 5JL5669G on 06.12.2017
Hi,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for 5JL5669G.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

e; SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapere Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credil bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS [mailto:claims@teamwarkgarage.com]

Sent: Monday, December 11, 2017 10:05 AM

To: Ten, Grace

Cc: Ngo, 5au Wei Shawn; Henry, Irene James; claims@teamworkgarage.com

Subject: RE: CMTD1704428/NSW - Accident involving SGG3535] & SIL5668G on 06.12.2017
Importance: High

Dear Sir,
We have agreed and selected the surveyor / surveyor company proposed by you to conduct the pre-
repail inspection as a single joint expert whereby the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by single

joint expert will be bear by you.
We have selected :

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

as the motor surveyor / surveyor company named in your attached list.

Kindly forward your assignment to them asap so that we can arrange for the survey with them.



‘Do ger the surveyor | surveyor office to check with us on the availability of the car at the werkshap befare sending their
surveyor down for PRI survey. We'll nat be held respansible for wasted trips made to the workshap.

Darren Ng
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 4038934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace teo@sompo.com.sgl

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 1:14 PM

To: claims@teamworkgarage.com

Cc: Ngo, Sau Wei Shawn <Shawn.Ngo@sompo.cam.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1704428/N5W - Accident involving SGG3535] & SJL5669G on 06.12.2017

Importance: High

Our Reference: CMTD1704428/NSW
Your Reference: SIL5669G
Without Prejudice

Date: 8" December 2017

Attention:
M/S Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 08/12/2017.

Please be informed that Shawn Ngo the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Maotor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1| Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
2 | LKK Auto Consultants Kenneth Kong (Morth area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffery Ong
JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek
5 | In House surveyor Teo See Ling




I | |

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Yours faithfully,

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may coliect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credil bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here far
our Privacy Policy

From:; Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com|]

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 11:58 AM

To: Claims - Motor Survey; claimsreport; Henry, Irene James

Cc: claims@teamworkgarage.com

Subject; CMTD1704428/NSW PRE-REPAIR. INSPECTION NOTIFICATION FOR SLG5669G
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

OUR REF: 1712-13
YOUR REF: 5GG3535)

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SJL5669G
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JL5668G AND 5GG3535) ON 06.12.17

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client’s GlA report and Notification of Pre-repair inspection
for your attention.

Please let us have your list of surveyors for us to select as stated in the Practice Direction — Amendment No. 1 of
2016; Pre-action Protocol within 2 working days as of the date of our notice to you,

Please take note: We will not entertain any of your surveyor calling us for the above inspection, without you
giving us your list of surveyors for us to select by the Practice Direction of Pre-repair Inspection.

Thank you,



Regards,

Alison

Teamwaork Garage Pte Ltd
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1
#HO1-24

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: GB44 2475

Fax:6844 2474



g

Tel : 6844 2475

Pte Lid

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
m Or]{ Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Fax : 6844 2474

rag e E-mail : cfaims@teamworkga;age.com

Register number : 201075366H
ROC number : 201015366H

3RD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

Sompo Insurance Pte Ltd Vehicle number

50 Raffles Place , #05-01/06 Make | Model
Singapore Land Tower Chassis number
Singapore 048623 Accident date

Qty

Reference

: SJL5669G
: HONDA/JAZZ
: JHMGEG685095210033

: 06 December 2017
1512-13

Particulars

Unit Price - 5GD %

_LM_L_z_t..-l_L...lhj—thJN_th..n_.N_l_u

1 SET
1 5ET
15ET

PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
REAR BUMPER =leatmidra_l
REAR BUMPER TOW COVER M 9/,
REAR BUMPER RETAINER Zv-
END PANEL iy dw.
REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH olifwrsah
REAR TAILLAMP =y
REAR EXHAUST SILENCER  +iy
REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING Swvi
REAR FENDER INNER TRIM sy

TAEGATE Dazisis

TAILGATE ABSORBER SvL

TAILGATE EMBLEM - JAZZ “lae

TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE ™~

TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP Sac. _ -8
TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING w1, _ PR
TAILGATE LOCK Sve 138V
TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER vin_— \

TAILGATE HINGE 44

SPARE TRYE TOP BOARD w4

Less 20%

PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
Balance B/F

REAR BUMPER CLIP i
REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP M
REAR REVERSE SENSOR Tewn
REAR NUMBER PLATE i~ 2)35\ ~
JOINT SEALANT *+Lo
WINDSCREEN SEALANT 1,
Subtotal
Balance C/F

628.00 &
20.88 ~
47.52 x
418.95 -
129.37
584.88 x
536.17 X
50.00 »
693.60 #
849,60 -
314,40 =
37.20 -
151.32 X
110,76
98.40
223.70 x
33.60 =
121.20 ¢
337.20

5386.25
1077.25

4309.00

4309.00

5000 321~
50.00 =
ﬂﬂﬂ:ﬂﬁ 235[.—
70.00 =
150.00 Yo (-
150-00 ¥ —

880.00

5189.00




L= TN - R, N P S B

LABOUR AND MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES
Balance B/F 5189.00
CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTHNING S5YSTEM 60.00 -
REMOVE AND REFIT REAR LINING, TRIM AND GARNISH 20066 Eﬂf’
REMOVE AND REMEW REAR REVERSE SENMSOR 150-80 ~foi-
REMOVE AND REMEW REAR EXHAUST ASSY 150-80 bal-
REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN 15000 13e(.
TRANSFER PARTS, ATATCHMENT FROM OLD TAILGATE TO NEW 200.08- Loi-
PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 2 ﬂOl"' 1286-60 ng fq
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS | 1006-60 Boo|-
APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS 150-80 Yof-
Subtotal 3260.00
Grand total 8449.00
LKK Auto Consuitants hence notify g2185.%0
* To resurvey belorainfier spray painting
» To dspiay dameged pants) during resurvey ”{'2-[‘2:‘[.—{ R 1Y: VNS LI-I"‘H}'S?"
= Parts prices am subject ko confvmation
& Third party survey is on & “Withoul Prejudice” basis M“q‘ IA’% s‘FF 5‘-};'_,?)2,2\
* Mo illegal modeication(s] s allowed o ——
* Supplementary ilems) must be resureyed and ¥ 'S‘*M
is subject 10 finél approval from insurance Company 6 o q‘rif-glga
Acknoareciged by Reysairer g T an ‘Z 5
Signisture: J_l -
Dete: Llcte Awndo 2 %5570["

QA'ldc Do ?ﬁu;.



mWork
rage

Pte Ltd

Sompo Insurance Pte Ltd
50 Raffles Place , #05-01/06
Singapore Land Tower
Singapore 048623

Qty Particulars

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Tel : 6844 2475

E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H

ROC number : 201015366H

3RD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

Vehicle number SJL5669G

Make / Model HONDA/JAZZ
Chassis number JHMGE685095210033
Accident date 06 December 2017
Reference 1712-13

Unit Price - SGD §

PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
1 |TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD mmd,..‘ eAnA_ 416.50 L—"|
Less 20% 83.30
333.20
(;;7




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e ) 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6266 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 18-3607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref - CS/SMO17023431/Dvbn2
oo Hhi
#05-01/08 Date : 22-01-201%9
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code : SMO
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. 5GG 3535 Veh. Inspected SJL 5668G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1704428/NSW Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 111272017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA JAZZ c.c 1339
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2008
Chassis No. JHMGEGB5095210033 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 176007 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/50 R15 BRIDGESTOME 5mm
L/H Front Tyre 195/50 R15 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/50 R15 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/50 R15 BRIDGESTONE 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  06/12/2017 Inspection Date 12207
Survey held at TEAMWORK GARAGE PTELTD
53 UBI AVENUE 1
#01-24
SINGAPORE 408934
Sa, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: § Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJL 5669G
Qty Description of Parts Condition ,‘Efr'k“;;?ps{;] Our ‘ﬁ“‘t‘d
REP NT
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 628.00 628.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER SERVICEABLE 20.88 -
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER SERVICEABLE 47.52
1|END PANEL DENTED 418.95 418.95
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 120.37 12937
2|REAR TAILLAMP NOT NECESSARY 584 88 -
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER NOT NECESSARY 536.17 -
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING SERVICEABLE 50.00
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM NOT NECESSARY £93.60 -
1|TAILGATE DENTED 849 .60 849.60
2| TAILGATE ABSORBER SERVICEABLE 314.40 .
1| TAILGATE EMBLEM-JAZZ NECESSARY 3r.20 37.20
1|TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 151.32 -
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP NECESSARY 110.76 110.76
1|TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 98.40 98.40
1| TAILGATE LOCK SERVICEABLE 223.20 ]
1|TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER TO REPAIR SEE 33.60 .
LABOUR
2| TAILGATE HINGE NOT NECESSARY 121.20
1|SPARE TYRE TOP BOARD NOT NECESSARY 337.20 -
1|TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD (ADDITIONAL) MOUNTING 416.50 416.50
CRACKED
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,160.55 -537.76
464220 2,151.02
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 30.00
1|SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 =
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 400.00 220.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70.00 -
1|JOINT SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 40.00
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 40.00
880.00 330.00

Report Ref No. CS/SMO17023431/Dvbn2
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Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::Ln;:?pB{;} Sl Ai:;]]ustad
LABOUR
CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM. NOT NECESSARY 60.00
REMOVE AND REFIT REAR LINING, TRIM AND GARNISH. 200.00 80.00
REMOWVE AND RENEW REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 40.00
REMOVE AND RENEW REAR EXHAUST ASSY. 150.00 60.00
REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120.00
TRANSFER OF PARTS ATTACHMENT FROM OLD 200.00 60.00
TAILGATE TO NEW,
PAMNEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF 1,200.00 800.00
THE REPAIR OF TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER.
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 1,000.00 800.00
APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS. 150.00 40.00

3,260.00 2,000.00

GRAND TOTAL 8,782.20 4,481.02
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,550.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO17023431/Dvbn2

ANG BRYAN TANMI

Automotive Assessor / Investigator

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




