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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*PC4536P (C0461267)

 [SJN7462L]
 TP

 MARITEAM TRANSPORT SERVICES PTE LTD
 Nov 30 2017 10:00AM

 [MAHMOODUL HASAN S/O HAFIZ ABDUL SATTAR]
 New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

  
 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 09/01/2019 09:57 AM.
To   AXA_SG; richard.angbs@axa.com.sg
CC   Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

Subject   <SEEK MANDATE> Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJN7462L (OI : AXA - C0461267) and PC4536P
(TP : LKK REF - CC4/AXA17023389/Aua3) on 30/11/2017

 
Dear Richard,
 
We refer to the subject matter.
 
Please be informed that Mandate IA has been uploaded for your approval and/or further instructions please.
 
PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL AS BELOW:

 COR:    $2,400.00
 LOU:    $   600.00 ($100 x 6 days)

 LTA:     $       5.35
 TOTAL: $3,005.35
 REMARKS: BOLA 15 - OID changed lane

 
Thank you.
 
Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096
 
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; AXA_SG
CC: thinthin@lkkauto.com; cs-a@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; ernest.tay@axa.com.sg
Sent On: 04/08/2018 06:27 PM
Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJN7462L (OI : AXA - C0461267) and PC4536P (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17023389/Aua3) on 30/11/2017
 
HI,
 
WE ARE CONDUCTING FILE REVIEW.
PLEASE LET US HAVE AN UPDATE ON THE ABOVE MATTER.
 
THANK YOU.
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; thinthin@lkkauto.com; cs-a@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 23/03/2018 11:49 AM
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJN7462L (OI : AXA - C0461267) and PC4536P (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17023389/Aua3) on 30/11/2017
 
Dear Ernest,
 
We refer to your below email above matter and contents were duly noted.
 
As per instruction, we will proceed direct settlement for this case.
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Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.
 
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; AXA_SG
Sent On: 23/03/2018 11:10 AM
Subject: Re: TP settlement - C0461267/GA086453
 

 

 
 
Dear LKK team,
 
Please engage insured / driver to confirm liability.
 
Thank you.
 
 
With regards,
Ernest
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG
Sent On: 23/03/2018 11:08 AM
Subject: TP settlement - C0461267/GA086453
 
Dear ADRIAN LING,

  
Please proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

  
Regards,

 Ernest Tay

mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com

