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B:!a" Ana {LKKAuto!

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 27 November 2017 6:36 PM

To: 'Syed Zayid MUHAMMAD (SPF)

Subject: RE: Invitation to Quote - E/20171109/0020
Dear 10 Syed

Our fees for inspecting the damaged property (wall) and thereafter producing a written report on whether
the inner side of the wall could have damaged from the collision will be $400/- (excluding GST)

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang thﬂd ( e
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408833)

From: Syed Zayid MUHAMMAD (SPF) [mailto:Syed_Zayid_MUHAMMAD@spf.gov.sg]
Sent: Monday, 27 November 2017 6:22 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Invitation to Quote - E/20171109/0020

Hi Bryan,

With reference to incident E/20171105/0020.
2. | understand that you have spoken to INSP Neo Chin Loong pertaining to the fee for the assessment of the
damages to the 2 units along Jalan Bahagia which were caused after a collision with a police patrol car. You have

guoted INSP Neo the fee for the assessment to be $400/-.

3. | seek your assistance to send in a formal quotation for the assessment. The pictures of the damages to the
2 units are enclosed in the attachment.

4, The affected units are: Blk 45, unit 192
Blk 46, unit 190

5. If there are enquiries, you may contact me at DID: 6547 6394,
E. Thank you.
Regards,

Syed Zayid Muhammad

Investigation Officer

General Investigation Team ‘A’

Traffic Police

Singapore Police Force

DID: (85) 6547 6394 | FAX: (65) 6547 6259
E-mall: Syed Zayid MUHAMMAD@spf.gov.sq

A member of the Home Team e 0 =2 &9 5 @ N ~ @

IWARNING: "Privieged/Confidantial information may be contasingd in this message. if you are nof the intended addresses, you must not copy
Nistnibute o 1Hke any action in redhancd thereon Communication of any informatan in this @mail o any unauthorized persan is an offence under
e Dfficinl Bocres Act (Cap 213). Pleass notify 1he sender immadiaiely i you receiv this in amor



Celine Funi !LKKAutnI
—

From: Accounts (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 December, 2017 10:31 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); assignments; Norrita (LKKAuto)

Ce: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Accounts (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: GeBIZ: Purchase Order HOMSPFECI17308648 has been issued to your company
Attachments: CI_HOMSPFECI17308648.PDF

Dear Assignment Team [/ Bryan,
FYMA please.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

SuthaShelia (Shelia) | Accounts Dept.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6742 9588 | email: account@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805
Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)

I'hz content of this e-mail message and any atischments are confidentinl and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, of copying of this e-muil 1 strictly prohibited. I vou receive this message in ermor, please notify the sender
imrmedimely by reply email and destroy the messege and its atiachments

From: GeBIZ [malltﬂ:gébiz_apps@geblz.gav.sg]
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 1:52 PM
Subject: GeBIZ: Purchase Order HOMSPFECI17308648 has been issued to your company

Dizar SirfMadam,

The following Purchase Order and its Invoicing Instruction(s) have been issued to your company on 11 Dec 2017.

Purchase Order No./ Issue No. : HOMSPFECI1 7308648/ 1

Description: IDMD_Provision of Damage Cost Assessment Services al Jalan Bahagia.
Supplier: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

Agency: Ministry of Home Affairs-Singapore Police Force

lssuance Date: 11 Dec 2017

List of Invoicing Ins ) Issued:

HOMSPFEPO 17308384 SGD - Singapore Dollar

You may log in to hitps://www.gebiz.gov.sg to view the Purchase Order.

Yours sinceraly,

GeBIZ Service Team



GOVERNMENT OF SINGAPORE
PURCHASE ORDER

ISSUED

GENERAL INFORMATION

Purchase Order No. / Issue No. HOMSPFECI17308648 /1
Purchase Order Reference No.

Purchase Order Description IDMD_Provision of Damage Cost Assessment Services at Jalan Bahagia.
Type of Purchase Services
Purchase Order Date 11 Dec 2017

SUPPLIER INFORMATION
Trading Partner Reference No.  199607198R

Supplier Name LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

GST Registered No. 19-9607198-R

Address 51 UBI AVENUE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE,
408933

CONTACT PERSON'S DETAILS

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Email account@lkkauto.com

Contact No, 62563561

Fax No. 62564315

BUYER INFORMATION

Buyer Name Ministry of Home Affairs-Singapore Police Force

Address Infra Devt & Management Div

CONTACT PERSON'S DETAILS

Goh See Wee

Email Goh_See_Wee@spf.gov.sg

Contact No, 64356341

Fax No, 64356361

DETAILS OF PURCHASE OR

Total Purchase Order Value 400.004SGD - Singapore Dollar)
Payment Terms ays
Billing Location Infra Devt & Management Div

SIGNATORY INFORMATION
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Name

Tan Choong Meng

Designation Assistant Director A&F/PCMD
Purchase Order Signed Date 11 Dec 2017

Item MNo. 1

Provision of Damage Cost Assessment Services at Jalan Bahagia
Unit of Measurement LOT

Quantity 1.0000

Unit Price 400.0000 (SGD)

Total Amount 400.00 (SGD)

Remarks

Instruction to Supplier

EE G R 1.0000{ Local Delivery

ANY OTHER INSTRUCTION(S) _ B >

ATTACHMENT INFORMATION

Mo attachments available.
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