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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 May 2019 11:10 AM

To: Aunteng

Subject: RE: New Assignment! Accident involving SLM894B & GBE7517E on 5/12/2017 *** LKK 

REF - CC6/AIG17023320/ea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 894B AND GBE 7517E ON 05/12/2017 

 

Please be informed that our Principal had repudiated the claim due to our insured breach of policy terms and 

conditions.  

 

Therefore, we will close the matter at our end. 

 

Kindly redirect your client’s claim to the owner of GBE 7517E. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Aunteng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 11:24 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: New Assignment! Accident involving SLM894B & GBE7517E on 5/12/2017 *** LKK REF - 

CC6/AIG17023320/ea3 

 

Hi Asher 

 

Attached LOD for your perusal.  
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Regards 

Aun Teng 

Tel: 6636 9100   Fax: 6636 9113 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

 

From: Aun Teng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, February 2, 2018 12:26:18 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: New Assignment! Accident involving SLM894B & GBE7517E on 5/12/2017 *** LKK REF - 

CC6/AIG17023320/ea3  

  

Hi Asher 

 

Has your insured reported the accident? 

 

 

Regards, 

Aun Teng 

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-90 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

 

On Fri, Dec 22, 2017 at 2:35 PM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Aun Teng, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

Please note that our insured is still non-reporting till date. 

  

Our principal is still verify validity of our insured’s policy. 

  

Please forward us any police investigation result for us to look into the matter. 

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Aun Teng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 21 December, 2017 2:19 PM 

 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: New Assignment! Accident involving SLM894B & GBE7517E on 5/12/2017 *** LKK REF - 

CC6/AIG17023320/ea3 

  

Hi Asher 

  

Has your insured reported the accident? 

 

 

Regards, 

Aun Teng 

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-90 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

  

On Tue, Dec 12, 2017 at 8:58 AM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Aun Teng, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

Please note that our insured is still non-reporting till date. 

  

Our principal is still verify validity of our insured’s policy. 

  

Please forward us any police investigation result for us to look into the matter. 

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Aun Teng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 December, 2017 8:45 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: New Assignment! Accident involving SLM894B & GBE7517E on 5/12/2017 *** LKK REF - 

CC6/AIG17023320/ea3 
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Hi Asher 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please forward us a copy of your insured's report and advise us on the liability. 

 

 

Regards, 

Aun Teng 

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-90 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

  

On Thu, Dec 7, 2017 at 6:38 PM, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Aun, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s GIA report. 

  

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey. 

  

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Aun Teng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 7 December, 2017 1:15 PM 

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: New Assignment! Accident involving SLM894B & GBE7517E on 5/12/2017 

  

Dear Officer-in-charge 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Attached our client accident report for your perusal. 

  

Your insured's vehicle is GBE7517E (AIG).  
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Please forward us a copy of your insured's report and advise us on the liability. 

  

 

 

Regards, 

Aun Teng 

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113 

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-90 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

  

  

 


