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Suwanna (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 2:28 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKQ5152S Our ref: SLN3665X (DOA: 05/12/2017) - Uninsured Losses 

Claims

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Noted on the contents of the below email. 

 

We will proceed to close the file on our end and submit both the survey report and invoice to your good office. 

 

Thank you.  

 
Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 2:09 PM 

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: FW: Your ref: SKQ5152S Our ref: SLN3665X (DOA: 05/12/2017) - Uninsured Losses Claims 

 

 
Dear Zaini, 
 

The third party has reverted his claim under his Motor policy and 
his insurers has now submitted the claim under BOLA to us 

 
Kindly let us have know if there is any bill payable. 
 

 
 

Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February, 2018 4:29 PM 

To: 'Zaini (LKK Auto)' 
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Cc: 'jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg' 
Subject: FW: Your ref: SKQ5152S Our ref: SLN3665X (DOA: 05/12/2017) - Uninsured Losses Claims 

 

 

Our Ref : 17/17/17/VP05/020257 
 
Dear Zaini, 

 
Kindly confirm if the cost of repair had been finalized as the claimant is 

now claiming for loss of use.  
 
 

Aside to Jenny – Please forward your claim for loss of use to 
LKK in order for them to negotiate the 

repair costs collectively together with the loss of use  
 
Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February, 2018 4:20 PM 

To: MT_Claim_SG 

Cc: tommywoon@eurokars.com.sg; jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg 
Subject: Your ref: SKQ5152S Our ref: SLN3665X (DOA: 05/12/2017) - Uninsured Losses Claims 

 

Our Ref: SLN3665X 

Your Ref: SKQ5152S 

 

Uninsured losses claim  

 

Dear Claims Service Team, 

 

Attached herewith are copies each of the SAS statement, Sketch plan, IC & Driving License & your insured noted for your 

perusal.  

 

The breakdown of our client’s claims are as follows: - 

 

• $ 1,440.00 Loss of use for 24 days @ $60/- p/day (period from 06/12/17 to 29/12/17) 

$ 1,440.00 Total 

 

Kindly revert to us on your offer. 

 

Thanks you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Jenny Lim 
Admin Assistant 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

12 Sungei Kadut Avenue Singapore 729648 

Tel: +65 63633003 DID: +65 63602444 Fax: +65 63602899  
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