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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ub Industrial Park, Singapare 408533

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199807188R GST Reg. No. 18-960T188-R

Affillated to Federation Intarnationals Des Experts En Automobile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

Rel . CCALCR17023278/R1za3

oy v IR S L |||
Code: LCR
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM N
Insured Veh.  SLG 5888P Veh. Inspected FT 78210
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 071212017
&N Vehicle Particulars & Condition e " §
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
75 M= eSO ___ Conditions of Tyres = )
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
LiH Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. - Description of Damages _ =
B __ Gonerallnformation
Accident Date  28/11/2017 ||mpﬂnﬁun Date 07122017
Survey held at SG MOTOR ENTERPRISE
BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 569622
5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




4 .

SG 98 MOTOR PTELTD

m.mmmmmm1mm SINGAPCGRE 568622
Tol: 5457 4B9H Fax: GAS2 4868
Email; 3g_motor_snlerprisefyahoo.com.sg

Date: 8 December 2017

To : LEK By Fax. 6256-4315
Attn = Rasul
Tel . 90010068
VEHICLE NO - FT 7921U Yameha RXZ :m;-'f"!':-‘f/ﬂ*"
ACCIDENT DATE: 28 November 2017
Description aty Quotation $
1 Handle Bar 1 <+ 12000 M7
2 Head Cowling 1 2+ 25000 cRy
3 Head Lamp 1 270 ;EO/D'G%/'
4 Signal Lamp 1 < _}E‘.ﬁ’ﬂﬂl""
5 Lamp Stay 1 9015000 7~
6 Fork Tube 1 set Ifv 48000 SR
7 Windshield 1 < 15500 5E 7
8 Front Mudguard 1 bs 176500647
9 Fuel Tank 1 360 00 P
10 Fork Ol Seal 1 Vo 8500 hee
11 Front Rim | 325.00 (ap"’
12 Brake Disc 1 5™ 25000 s~
13 Clutch Lever 1 20 I 9::,‘;
14 Balancer 1 set 306 190008
15 Rear LH Tail Cover 1 75 160700 P ord
16 Meter Assy 1 45000
Less 10% 367.20 |L:1‘
Sub-Total 3,304.80
(€07
//-
LY fd
G 1)




VEHICLE NO : FT 78210
Nett items
1 Towing fee
2 Remove & replace necessary parts,
align & etc
3 Remove & replace fork tube, oil seal,

o

top up fork oil, front rim & brake disc
charges

Repair & press front nm

Front number plate
Supply body decal sticker

NE; This estimate was made from & visual
nspection anly, any oiter dismags pars o
isihour require whien et COmMmences, we
will atvise you and submit supplementery
i to you accondingly.

Kindly revert upon completion
Thank you

SG9 PTE LTD

16

Yamaha RXZ

wese /[
1600 oV
Sub-Total 795.00
Nett Total 4,099.80
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. Juz Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Manday, 10 September 2018 12:20 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc 5g Motor

Subject: Your Insured: SLG 5898P (Our ref: FT 7921G)
Attachments: FT 7921U Claim Status.pdf

Relar to the above claim, we would like to do a direct
settlement for the property damage to our client's bike FT 7921U

Anached plse find the relevant documents for your kind perusal
1) Invoice for Cost of Repairs

2) GIA Report

3) Police Report

4) TP Result

We seek your assistance lo expedite this claim as we wish lo
close the lile.

Thank You

Regards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel 64524898 Fax: 64526898




SG 98 VIOTOR PTE LTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 869822
Toi: 6452 4898 Fax: 5451 4808

Email: sg_motor_anterpriss@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 7 September 2018

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid LETTER OF DEMAND
78 Shenton Way
#07-18
SINGAPORE 078120
Your Insured: SLG 5898P
Date of Accident:  29-Nov-17
Location: Along Yishun Ring Road
FINAL REPAIR COSTS

VEHICLE NO.  FT 7921U (Yamaha RXZ)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.. FT 7921U (lump sum) $1,550.00
Loss of Use: 3 days x $35 §$105.00
Total: $1,655.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED FIFTY-FIVE ONLY
Neles:

1, All chogue payment should be "Crossad” and made payable io 5G 88 MOTOR PTELTD
2. All chogue should have our "Tmwolce Na® willlen on the reverss side of (hs chaques
3. Fol furthar enquiries on this involos, faal frea lo contact us

SG 98 Motor Pte Lid

ia




Jul Irene !LKKAutn'_l

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 3:22 PM

To: ‘insurance@lioncityrentals.com.sg’

Cc Admin A: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 5898P (LCR) & FT 7921U ON 29/11/2017 ALONG BLK
624 YISHUN RING ROAD

Attachments: PIR pdf

26 November 2018

LCRF PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Your Ref: SLG 5898P
Our Ref: CC4/LCR17023276/R1ja3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVO LG 5898P (LCR 21UON 2 ALONG BLK 624 NG ROAD

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from FT 7921U against your insurance policy.

Based on the information on hand, we are of the opinion that we cannot be absolved from liability.
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
infarmation.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender




immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden,
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT * - :

1, Mdhamed Sol \ehia Bia h'ﬁ'k”;'tha third party claimant”)

of Blic 18 Jalen & Han #ol- IS 'r,’:',ﬁt" o R s RS, .

wner of FT 921U (vehicle no.) hezeby authorf¥s
St 98 Motev FPle 4

(“the workshop”) to act for ma with raspect to my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("claim") for my
vehicle no, F7 7921 U that was damaged pursuant to the

accident which occurred on qin {2011 (date) along 11'5]"“-4.&

E.....,i, E.A:c.‘-u_la"' — {location) |
SLg CRI8F

invelving vehicle no/s

{"the accident") .

1 further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
claim in a manner that they deem. £it and the workshop ia further

suthorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment chegue/s baing made in favour of the woxkshop,

1 further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach

on my behalf la on a without prejudice and without admission of
liability basis insofar as the driver/cwner/insurers of the

bther wehicle/s is concerned.

pated this 4 day of De (month) 20 [} tyear)

3

F 4 o
ol [
“{--._-') 5 .
signed by *the third party clalmant® Signed By ke workshop”




“We/l, $G 98 MOTOR PTE LTD (“the warkshop™) hereby confirm that we/I have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Prle Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $$1,550.00
{(Repair Cost), $$75.00 (Loss of Use/Remmt 1880.00 (Disbursement)for vehicle no. T 79210 that
wis damaged pursuant to the sccident which ocenmred on 29/11/2017 (date) along BLK 624
YISHUN RING ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLG S898P. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 07/12/2017 (dnic) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner MOHAMED SOLLEHIN BIN ZULFIKRI
(“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. FT 79210 make the claim as set out in the above paragraph
and we/1 have full authority to settle the matter on hisfher behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit, We/l
encloge herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/T will indemnify AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party clnimant”
aiter the above said agreement lodges a further elaim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to F1T'
7921U (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of linhility basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction aver any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __ U3 idayyof __DEC _ (month) 2018 (year

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the

Provided always that this discharge of my
claim far damopes relating 10 the damege o
myv vehizle sholl not projudice o nffect or
p?L'l.'J-!th: me from making a further claim for
general and special damages for my persomal
injuries sustained in the same wccident,




SG 98 MOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Ma Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 560622
Tek 6452 4890 Fax: B452 485E

Emall sg_molor_snlorprise@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 7 September 2018 Invoice No: SG88-PD-18-083

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd PD - Direcl Settlement
78 Shenton Way

#07-16

SINGAPORE 079120

Your Insurad: SLG 5898P
Date of Accident:  28-Nov-17

Location: Along Yishun Ring Road

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. FT 7821U (Yamaha RXZ)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FT 7921U (lump sum) $1,550.00

Total: $1.550.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FIFTY ONLY

Motes:

1. All cheque payment should be "Croseed” snd made payable o SG 88 MOTOR PTE LTD
2. Ml chegue should have our “inveies Na* writhan on ihe mverse side ol the cheque

3. For lurthar enguires on this Inolcs, please foes) fmo lo contacd un

SG 98 Motar Pte Ltd
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane

Case  |Motitied [Est Submitted | Adj Assigned Aaj Rpt Ag) Submites | Ins Auth'ed Status
vy |J0NavI07 | O0DecI037  |ssy,55000 S31,550.00 cinr by
| i ke | 1 £ Adj Rox | £t Estimates | | view Rpt | cancel Case |

Main Reference Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Insured: LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD, Co. fieg. No.: 20150462%

Main 3
Cla ; MOHAMED SOLLEHIM BIN ZULFIKRI, ID: S§511315%8

Venicle Reg. [39/11/2017 22:00 - 159
No.: Fr7921u Date of Loss! {195 Manths and 9 Days From LTA Rag Date (Man vr)]

Claim Type: | TP / 680388848656 POlCY/COVEr | 1999994979 (Comprehensive)

Vaniche Reg. |
No. SLGSEOEP Policy No.
(Insured): | (Clalmant):

| Excess:
Sg 98 Motor Pre Ltd (HQ) BLE 4001 ANG MO KID INDUSTRIAL PARK 1 #01-21, 569622 Ang Mo Kio - Tel: 64524898

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 55-6418-3000 .., [Handled by Khoo, Key-Eng - £419 1026] Kay-
Eng.Khoaoihaig.com

Great American Insurance Company (HQ) - Tel: GE04 G047

LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 ... [Handied by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 18/12/2017]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All | Compese Case Mail |
There are no majl for this case.

MTI017TTRODAS0

View All | Search Tasks | Creme New Task | _compiete |
Task Group  Subject Mandier  Assigned By  Completed On  Created On  Done?

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 17/12/2018




Mernmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FT7921U (6B03BBB48B65G)
[SLG5898P]

™
MOHAMED SOLLEHIN BIN ZULFIKRI
Nov 29 2017 10:00PM
[LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD]
Sg 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Ugload Documents | _Upload Photos | _Compose New Letier | _upicad vides | _usioad Augio |

Page 1 of 1

View | Viaw in Browser | =

Letters/ Correspondences 1per page | ¥

o |Fralaed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnail | Print

1 [ Draift) qmwmw—-m-wm | Eoi

Assessment Reports M =]

Me |Finalized On AIG Asia Pacifie Insurance Ple. Lid, (5G] Thumbnall | Print
: Accident Statement

1 |OBA2NT09:35 | ponyisc - man Meo: SUGSEDNR, Claimant: LICN CITY RENTALS FTE LTO @ | tosa

Documantation 1 pes page ~«] A

No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print

!,l 07T 14:29 ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG pg_u.u.uu Load PDF

(2 DT/LAAT 14:29 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 06.12.3017 Losd PDF

3 |07/12/17 14:29 NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP Load POF

4 B7/A12/17 14:29 TP GIA REPORT - Load POF

5 26/101/18 15:17 PIR-AGAINST O Load POF

] 17712718 09:59 WORKSHOP TNVOICE Load POF

7 17712418 09:59 AUTHORISATION TOD ACT FORM Load POF

8 |17r12/18 09:59 Release Vouchar Load POF

9 17/12/18 D9:59 PIR Load PDF

10 [17/12/18 09:59 LETTER TO O1 Load POF

Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | save | pomt |

| There are no document checklists configured.
|

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Paute Meenarks arn privibe aniess w2 shos i 10 other perbes

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 17/12/2018




Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLG5898P (Insd veh) Model: YAMAHA RXZ 133CC (M)
FT7921U (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |29/11/2017

Global Sum Settiement | (| [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate %] 4.095.80
Final Repair Cost -] 1.550.00
Loss of Use s 75.00 3.00 days at $25.00 per day
Rental {if any) - 0.00 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee o 1 0,00
Others: ot 0.00
'$
Final Setllement Sum -1 1,625.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicala
below)
A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liabiity 100 (%)
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
BOLA Liability. (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases whers BOLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |SG 88 Motor Pte Lid i 1,625.00
2) ' 8
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN oy
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 17/12/2018



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (cc reg e 1sss0r198m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 mﬂ Paya Ubl Industrial Park

apore 408833

Tel: 5256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/LCR17023276/R1JA302
Date: 171272018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid Palicy No: 05989964579
Claimant Vehicl® Fr7e210 Insured Vehicle No : SLG5898P
Date of Loss: 280112017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: BB038884865G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FT7921U
Make & Model YAMAHA RXZ, 133cc (M) Engine No. 385261284
Reg. Date: 20/08/2001 (Man. Year: 2001) Chassis No: ZMC261284
Colour: Multi-colour Cdometar. 76538 km
Engine Capacity: 133 cc
Market Value/New Car Pnce:  N/A
Sum Insured (5%): Market Value/New Car Price
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: BOVEO-17 Rear Tyre Size: BOMGO-1T
Front Left Side: Dunlop 3 mm Rear Lefl Side: Dunlop 3 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values mprosen! ihe remareng [re reads depin
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 3,319.80 1,518.00 1,801.80 54 27
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 D.00 0.00
Labour 760.00 420.00 360.00 46.15
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 000
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 4,099.80 1,938.00 2,161.80 52.73
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%) 1,550.00
Nett Amount (55) 4,009.80 1,550.00 2,549.80 62.19
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $$25.00/day) (5§) 75.00
Maett Liability {5%) 1,625.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 06/12/2017
Date Inspected: 07/12/2017 Inspected At Sg 98 Motor Pte Lid (HQ)
BLK 4001 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL
PARK 1 #01-21
Singapore 560622

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 17/12/2018




Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Joy lrene Bascao

NOTE: This report represants aur fndings @l e bme and pace of ingpeoton sfaked hamin, Such ingpecion has besn carmed out fo e besl of owr
knowisdge and ahility bul any ather iabiity uwnder any ather creumatances (1 Aered)y expressly sxciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo.  Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *HANDLE BAR Bent 120.00 FL *55.00 FL
2 1 *HEAD COWLING Cracked 250.00 FL *B5.00FL
3 1 *HEAD LAMP Broken 350.00 FL 220,00 FL
4 1 *SIGNAL LAMP Missing 75.00 FL *50.00FL
5 1 *LAMP STAY Bent 150,00 FL *80.00 FL
8 1 *SET FORK TUBE Scraiched 480.00FL *380.00 FL
7 1 *WINDSHIELD Scralched 165.00 FL *5500FL
a8 1 *FRONT MUDGUARD Scraiched 175.00 FL *55,00 FL
e 1 “FUEL TANK Bant 38000 FL *3680.00 FL
10 1 *FORK OIL SEAL Mecessary B5.00FL *40.00 FL
11 9 *FRONT RIM Repair 325.00 FL *FL
12 1 *BRAKE DISC Scratched 250 00 FL *145.00 FL
13 1 *CLUTCH LEVER Cracked 78.00FL *20.00FL
14 1 *SET BALANCER Scralched 190.00 FL *30.00FL
15 1 *REAR LH TAIL COVER Cracked 160.00 FL *75.00 FL
16 1 *METER ASSY Not Necessary 450.00 FL “-FL
17 1 *FRONT NUMBER PLATE Necessary 15.00FS *15.00FS
F=Franchine part S=SpcNeft L=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (S8) 3,687.00 1,685.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 10,00/10.00% (S$) 367.20 167.00
Total Parts (S§) 3,319.80 1,518.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Thare are no new miscellanecus iterms selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour llems

1 TOWING FEE New 40.00 40.00

2 REMOVE & REPLACE NECESSARY PARTS,ALIGN & ETC New 280.00 150.00

3  REMOVE & REPLACE FORK TUBE ,OIL SEAL TOPUP FORK  New 200.00 80.00

OIL FRONT RIM & BRAKE DISC CHARGES

4  REPAIR & PRESS FRONT RIM New 100.00 50.00

5  SUPPLY BODY DECAL STICKER New 160.00 100.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 780.00 420.00

| Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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