Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Ronnie Tan <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 March 2018 11:11 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Suhaimi

Subject: RE: Your ref: SLK 6083X_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLB 7560B AND SLK

6083X ON 01/11/2017

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Hi Zaini

We are please to accept your offer at $1556.85.
Please forward us DV

Thank you

Regard

Ronnie

From: "Zaini (LKK Auto)" <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March, 2018 5:12 PM

To: "ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg" <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Cc: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>, "suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg"
<suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SLK 6083X_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLB 7560B AND SLK 6083X ON 01/11/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLK 6083X
Our Ref: CC6/CT117023227/Uka3

Dear Ronnie,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 7560B & SLK 6083X ON 01/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,342.85
2. Loss of Rental(2days x $100.00)(w/GST) S 214.00

TOTAL $1,556.85

Please confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



