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' Pl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

~- 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No- 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8807198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

Ref . CCB/LCR17023212/pb3

CHARTIS BUILDINGSINGAPORE 079120 D e Illmmmlumlnm
Coda: LCR
- Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLF 4729G Veh. Inspected YN 84577
Paolicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date D6/1212017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model e.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Dama;es
5. General Information
Accident Date 2211172017 Inspection Date
Survey held at LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE
417883
Ba. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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. PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type Company
Owner ID 3585C
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. YNB4STT
Vehicle to be Exported Mo

Intended De-registration Date 05 Dec 2017
Vehicle Make MITSUBISHI
WVehicle Mode CANTER FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU)
Primary Colour White
Manufacturing Year 2015

Engine No. 4P10B72457
Chaszsis Na FEB21EA10215
Maximum Power Output

Open Market Value 32855000
Original Registration Date 08 Jul 2015
First Registration Date 08 Jul 2015
Transfer Count (o]

Actual ARF Paid 142800
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 07 Jul 2025
COE Category - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period{Years) 10

QP Paid $50,502.00
COE Rebate Amount $38.324.00
Total Rebate Amount §38,324.00

The information contained herein is correct asat 05 Dec 2017

https://vrl Ita gov se/lta/vrl/action/en quireRebateBy PublicBefore Dereglnput?’ FUNCTIO

0D5-Dec-17



Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 8 December, 2017 3:42 PM
To: Yong, Ivy-AV (Ivy-AV.Yong@aig.com)
Subject: 10718450725G

Your ref: 10718450725G
Our Rel: CC&/LCR17023212/pb3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G(OI-LCR) & YN BAS7T(TP) ON 22/11/2017
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly assist to upload Ol video in Metrimean for our viewing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Comsultants Pte Lid

Phone: r42-2197 | email: chewhtilkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #nz-25 | 5{408033)



Hsiao an_rg !LKKAutn]

From: Wong, Justin <Justin Wong@aig com>
Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 9:22 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Ce Yong, Ivy-AV
Subject: RE: 107184507256

half of |
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please proceed to reject third-party PD claims as per BOLA scenario 24.

Thank you.

(@ Best Regards,

Justin Wong

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie_Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-18 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) G418 1880 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Justin Wong@aig com | www aig com sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Tl wrforrmmiions in Hss el (and any antschinmenis) (s conficential Y you are nal the nleided reoipsnl pou sl nol use or disssmunss e
infarmabion. f you have recewved this email in anor, pleass arebeciatly nolify me by "Reply” cammignd and parmiagnantly dessfi e orgn B
any copves or prniouts thereod - Althowgh Shis email snd aoy aftschimants ame Beleesd o be fee of ary wires or other gafect ihal might alfect any
computar gyt info which I i@ mesived and openod, iF 75 the respansibility of ihe recyient Ko ansure thal it W wirid free and no responsibiity is
gccopied by AlG for any loss or divmage ansng v any way from iy use

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 21, 2017 5:41 PM
To: Wong, Justin

Cc: Yong, Ivy-AV

Subject: FW: 107184507256

Hi Justin,

Understand that vy is on leave.

Kindly assis!.

fees oo o Wermy € leenstimnas & Happy Sew Vear 20X



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Hondler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 December, 2017 5:39 PM
To: 'Yong, Ivy-AV' <lvy-AV . Yong@aig.com>
Subject: RE: 10718450725G

Hi lvy,

We refer to the above matter.

From our insured car video lootage. it shows that third party reversed and hit onto our insured who was
passing by third party.

We are intending to reject third party claim under BOLA scenario 24,

For your approval/comments please.

Wivhex vou @ Werry Chiristituey & Hoppy New Year 2008

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
. Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408q0:11)

From: Yong, lvy-AV [mailto:lvy-AV Yong @aig.com
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 9:42 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 10718450725G

Hi Hsiao Tong

Uploaded.

Ivy Yong
AIG
Complex Claims Examingr



- Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shanton Way AIG Bullding #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +64191637 | Fax +68357416
lvy-AV Yong@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Tha iformmmion i thes ermad (G any aitachiments) s configential 1 youw are rol the atended ecipient. pou must ol use o serimnpe the
iormation I pouw eve meajeed this small in error, pleasa ursnedistely noffy e by Reniy” cormnisng g parrnanantly deksle the asginal ond
any copies or pantocts hereof  Although this email and any altochmantz are befiaved to be frea of any virug ar ather oefect il mght affect any
complar spiam i wiich § i reoehed and apenid, © 45 the responsitidily of the recyuant io ansure Sal o e frea and no respongihility is

weompbesd by AIG for any loss OF davtace anging in any way from s use
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:ch Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 3:42 PM
To: Yong, Ivy-AV
Subject: 107184507256

Your ret: 10718450725G
Our Rel: CC&/LCR17023212/pb3

.:Jecr Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G(OI-LCR) & YN 8457T(TP) ON 22/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly assist to upload Ol video in Mermen for our viewing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fux: H741-9108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrisl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080:43)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. IT you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof, Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened. it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way [rom its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or

3



* printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened. it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates cither jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Hsiao Tnna SI.I{I{Autn)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 23 December, 2017 3:20 PM

To: ‘Susan Low’

Subject: <REJECTION> Your Ref YN 8457T *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SLF 4729G(AIG) & YN 8457T ON 22/11/2017]

Your Bef: YN B45TT Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G(AIG]) & YN 84577 ON 22/11/2017

We refer o the above matier.

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due fo the entire negligence of your client
who reversed and hit onto our insured vehicle. BOLA scenario 24 Is applicable.
Kindly refer to our insured police report for your easy reference.

Brief Details.

On the 22/11/2017 at about 1640hrs, | was driving my vehicle, SLF4729G, in the carpark of B/53
W1MJumngmel42mpthupmymndw.Aﬁmnwmmm
milorw,‘rNMTT.pﬂ‘koﬂstulonarrutmﬂslduofmamadwhichsuddonlymmmdm
hutnmyhummmm.mmmmmﬂmnwmmthmmum
and nol able to open.

Iwishmmmmnuanm-wmmwhimfmmwlhﬂirﬂdam.Iahuwinhhstﬁnhﬂt
mmmdﬂulonyaudﬁmlymm.labawbhtnatﬁematlalmadyhmapasunwinu
the incident happened but | did not manage to get her particular

In view of this, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look infe your client claim.

Thank you.

iite 10 Mlerry Christnigs X _I'_i'__l--r-': et )

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6742-m97 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Hsiao Tnng !LKKAutu]

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 20 January 2018 6:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Re: <REJECTION> Your Ref: YN 84577 *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G{AIG) & YN BASTT ON 22/11/2017]

We refer to your insured statement.

Kindly assist to let us have the accident photographs showing the vehicles involved and/or VVTV/In-
car camera video footages of the accident , final police investigation result and/or other evidence to
support your client's claim

_ g | o2
Thank. ( I_r WA \ ':*J 1L | "
Best Regards, " [
Susan Low i FTECRRY Ar Arcibed FERIBEIN
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Workshop roe s chiT TD LEAIY TIR e
No. 1 Kakl Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 oy e - PIULED O YER ALONG LEFT SILE OF
AutoBay @ Kakl Bukit T SOREE e SN T S
Singapore 417883 o e o0 Anh SWrreie)) o .--.._-n-.,é -~
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 ATl (oo T B EX TRINING TIATRIC T

i STRRETED TO REVERS 184

o e H B .\.'.:- HT -

W g i Tar e
5, verere AS BeHmd | NeT Keoarnt f

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=> e MERMT FoP FEVESS A, P '3

HARZARD EIGHT

To: Susan Low <liusb mail.com=> Ry ¥ r &y o pe
Sent: Saturday, 23 Decro;ﬂli:bafzﬂﬂ, 15:19 DRIING PRAS ON THE FUATSTE HITBY TIF
Subject: <REJECTION> Your Ref: YN 8457T *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF
4729G(AIG) & YN 8457T ON 22/11/2017) WS REVERLING .

1) uADER Al TR te 8 TATE LAY ' L
Your Ref: YN 8457T Without Prejudice - witni REVERSING imaE DI ATELY namh HACHE
Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3 -; b ’W i i 15 A VEHICLE TFelown

L rgdT WHENEVER N

Dear Sirs/Madam, BEHIND. o E Meulh EPET Mes HASTT HE

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G(AIG) & YN 8457T ON 22/11/2017
We reler to the above matlter,

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client who
reversed and hit onto our Insured vehicle. BOLA scenario 24 |s applicable.
Kindly refer to our insured police report for your easy reference.

Brief Details.

On the 22/11/2017 at about 1840hrs, | was driving my vehicle, SLF4729G, in the carpark of B/53
B/541 along Jurong West St 42 to pick up my second passenger. As | was approaching the shelt
was a lofry, YN8457T, parked stationary at the side of the road which suddenly reverse and side
both my left front and rear door. The impact caused both my doors on the left to be seriously dan
and nol able to open.

| wish to state that | have an in-car camera which recorded the incident. | also wish to state that |
aware and the lorry suddenly reverse | also wish to state that | aiready have a passenger in the
the incident happened but | did not manage to get her particular



In view of this, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable 1o look into your client claim,

Thank you.

hes you o Merry Christmas & Haoppy New Year 2018

Biest Regarids,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Cass Handia

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phona; 6743-3197 | emall; chewht@®@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4106
Bk 51, Paya Lbl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 10 March 2018 4:04 PM

To: ‘Susan Low'

Subject: RE: <REJECTION> Your Ref: YN B457T *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G(AIG) & YN BASTT ON 22/11/2017]

Attachments: YN BASTT vs SLF 47296 - O| VIDED-D.mp4

without prejudice
Hi Susan,
We attached here with a copy of video lootage for your eosy reference.

We are of the apinien that youwr client is liable for couse the accident. Your client should check before he
reversad his lory. Under BOLA scenano 24, vehicle reversing in/ out of parking lot should exarcise graater
caulion.

We regre! 1o inform you that we are unable 1o look into your client claim.

Note: This video lootage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You underiake o preserve
its confidenticlity and will not disclose, provide or make available the video footage in whole or in part, fo
any third party.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sale intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admissian of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being distcovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Benl Resgghindi,

Hsigo Tong, Chew | Cose Flomidle

LEKK Auto Consultants e L1d

Flhihe: firga-4107 | email: chowht@lkkauto.oom | las: 6740-4108

Bl 51, Fuyn Ubi Industrial Parck, Uby Avenue 1, #0225 | S{aoS093)

From: Susan Low [mallto;liushro@ymail.com]

Sent: Saturday, 20 January 2018 6:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: <REJECTION=> Your Ref: YN 84577 *Our Ref: CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3 |ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF
4729G(AIG) & YN BAS7T ON 22/11/2017)

We refer to your Insured statement.

Kindly assist to let us have the accident photographs showing the vehicles involved and/or VWTV/In-
car camera video footages of the accident |, final police investigation result and/or other evidence to
suppoart your client's claim



Thank.
Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Workshop
Mo. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@ilkkauto com>

To: Susan Low <llusbro@ymail com=
Sent: Saturday, 23 December 2017, 1518
Subject: <REJECTION= Your Ref YN 84577 "Our Ref CC6/LCR17023212/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF

4729G(AIG) & YN 8457T ON 22/11/2017]

Your Ref: YN B457T Without Prejudice
Our Ret: CC6AL.CR17023212/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 4729G(AIG) & YN B4ASTT ON 22/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due 1o the entire negligence of your client who
reversed and hit onto our insured vehicle. BOLA scenario 24 is applicable.
Kindly refer to our insured police report for your easy reference.

Brief Details.

On the 22/11/2017 at about 1840hrs, | was driving my vehicle, SLF4729G. in the carpark of B/53
B/541 along Jurong West St 42 to pick up my second passenger. As | was approaching the shelt
was @ lorry, YNB45STT, parked stationary at the side of the road which suddenly reverse and side
both my left front and rear door. The impact caused both my doors on the left to be seriously dan

and not able lo open.

I wish 10 state that | have an in-car camera which recorded the incident | also wish 1o stale thal |
aware and the lorry suddenly reverse. | also wish to state thal | already have a passenger in the
ine incident happened but | did not manage to get her particular

In view of this, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look Inlo your client claim.

Thank you.

Best Regardy,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Hamdies

LKK Auto Consultants ite Ltd

Phon= 5742-2197 | email: chawht@kkautogom | fax 67414108

gl 51 Faya Ubl indusirial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | S[408523)
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Ravoked / No settlemant

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING 1
| Cass |Hm‘.ll'lad .5Est Submitied | Ait] Assigned Ad) Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Staius
' 06 Dec 2017 | *g.‘;;“ W7 lss1,60000  5$1.600.00 Surver Roport
Main - it Estimates J View Rpl
M Ean Adj mpt | E Cancel Case I

Hain

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS — | [Created by adjuster]
| Insured: |LCRF PTELTD, Co.Reg. Mo.: 201624597K
|Main Claimant: |STVE PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 198703585C
| Vehicle Reg. No.: YNB457T Date of Loss: 22/11j2017 16:00 - :59
| Claim Type: TP / 1071845072SG Policy/Cover Note No.: 0999995041
[yehicle Reg. No. {Insured): | SLE4729G Policy No. (Claimant): D-17087422MFCV

i

| | Excess:

F—— | Liw's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop (HQ) BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &, £01-01 AUTO BAY @ KAKI
e | BUKITT, 417883 Kaki Bukit - Tel:

Handling 1 | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, {Iw}-TEi‘rﬁS*ﬁili-m ++ [Handled by Yong, Ivy-AV] lvy-
andiing Insurer VA Yorg@aig.com

Claimant's Insurer: . I_l_IB First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62223311

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 6256-3561 ... [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Flﬁll -.Pt
AU | duie 15/12/2017]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
There are no mall for this case.

MMI Cnﬂ'mmtmlhﬂl

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS- View All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | complete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Craated On  Dona?
No resilts.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 20/3/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*YNB457T (1071B450725G)
[SLF4729G]
TP
STVE PTE LTD
Nov 212 2017 4:00PM
[LCRF PTE LTD]
Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop

Page 1 of 2

Uptond Documents |  Upioad Phatos |  Compose New Letter |  Ugload video |  Uptosd autio | View [View in Browser| v |
video ' [1perpage V]| |
|Nn |Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Tnsurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print
:: [11/12/17 09:44 | Video - Accident Load MP4 !
. l
Assessment Reports {1 per page E [

[No [Finaized on AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (SG) Thumbnail | Print |
N [07n2717 110 | e e 1o v @ | loadHTM 1

Photos/Images 3perpage  [V] M
Mo | RelabelfReorder | LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |08/12/17 18:03 | General View B weaws H
2 (081217 18:03 | General View O larc B
3 08/12/17 18:03  General View 6 Load PG | BA
4 [0812/17 18:03 | Ganeral View @ e (B
S 0812/1718:03 | General View O wedare |
6 Equ,-s;u:? 18:03 | General View 0| toaaws M
L |08/12/17 18:03 | General View 0| toadwrs [

§ |08/12/17 18:03  Genaral View @ idawc (B2
|5 |DB/12/17 16:03 | General View @ waawrs |F
10 |08/12/17 18:03  General View 0 teaswe & |
11 |08/12/17 18:03 | General View Q oo B
12 | 0B/12/17 18:03  General View @O wadwe [F |
113 |08/12/17 18:03 | General View Q| wadws B
14 |0B/12/17 18:03  General View Q| coaws A
115 |08/12/17 18:01  General View O! waiwrs A
16 |0B/12/17 18:03 | General View 0| tcaaws |
17 |08/12/17 18:01 |General View Q| wuws B |
1B | DB/12/17 18:03 | General View 0 worc |4
119 |08/12/17 18:03 | General View Q| wurs &

20 |08/12/17 18:03 | General View @ lads M

21 |0B/12/17 18:03  General View O wedrs [

22 |08/12/17 18:0]  General View 0 wurs H

23 08/12/17 18:03  Odometer Reading @ e B |
24 lor12/17 18:03 _El-;nunum O wows |M
'Documentation [1perpoge [~ |
No | Relabel/Reorder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
't |D6/12/17 18:06 | TP GIA REPORT Load FOF

2 11/12/17 18:57 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED 2 Load POF

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 20/3/2018
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3 !13112!1?15:211 Email from AIG dd 221217 Load POF

4 [Z3/13/17 15:20  Email to TP_REJECT dd 231217 Load POF
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST MI SMI Pﬂﬂtl}

There are no document checklists configured.

Show Remarks To: || Handling Insurer
Mote: Remari are privete eniess you Bhow it (o other Dertees

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 20/3/2018



Adjuster Repont

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coresne 19ss0718sr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fac: 6844-8805 Email: surf@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCH&ILCR17023212/UPB302

Date: 20/03/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid Policy No: 0999295041
piaimant Vehicle yngas7T Insured Vehicle No :  SLF4729G
Date of Loss: 2112017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 10718450725G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: YNB4STT
Make & Model: MITSUBISHI CANTER, 3.0 D FEB21ER4SDEB (CBL) (M) Engine No: 4P10B72457
Reg. Date: 08/07/2015 (Man. Year; 2015) Chassis No: FEB21EA10215
Colour; White Odometer: 100762 km
Engine Capacity: 26098 cc
Markel Value/MNew Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Valua/New Car Price
N ICLE
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Ne Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION QOF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/85 R15 (D)
Front Lefi Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side Bridgestone 6/6 mm
Front Right Side Bridgesione 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 8/6 mm
The above valies represan! the remaining hre freads depif
COST OF CLAIMS o Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %]
Paris 1,245.00 1,000.00 245.00 1968
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.550.00 1,020.00 530.00 3419
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing D.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 2,795.00 2,020.00 T75.00 27.73
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,600.00
Nett Amount (S$) 2,795.00 1,600.00 1,195.00 42.75
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 081272017
Date Inspected: 08/12/2017 Inspected At: Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
(HQ)

Estimated Period of

BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6, #01-01 AUTO

BAY @ KAKI BUKIT
Singapore 417883

Repair. 3.0days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 20/3/2018



Adjuster Repornt Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE. This report represents our findings ef the fime and place of inspection siated herein. Such inspeciion has besn camed aul fo the besl of our
knowledge and abilily but any athar babilty under any ather circumstances s hermby sxpressly ercluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 20/3/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty ::” Particulars Condition Repairers Amount

¢ 1 *REAR RH TAILGATE OUTER FIBERS Cracked 600.00FS *600.00FS
PANEL

2 1 *REAR RH PILLAR OUTER FIBERS Cracked 400.00FS *400.00FS

3 1 *REAR RH TAIL LAMP (CRACKED) Mot Consistent With The 245.00F *-F

Impact

F=Franchise part S=SpcNef
Total Parts (5%) 1,245.00 1,000.00

1 Repori was unsubmitted during this print-out. i

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 20/3/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscallanecus lems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour tems

1 REMOVE AND REFIX REAR TAILGATE COMPONENTS & New 120.00 0.00
WIPER MECHANISM

2 TOCHECK ALL WIRING & ELECTRICAL COMPONENT FOR New 30.00 20.00
PROPER FUNCTION

3 LABOR FOR PANEL BEATING .CUT,WELD ,STRAIGHTEN & Mew B00.00 600.00
REPLACING PARTS ETCS

4  TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TOUCH UP New B600.00 400.00
PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,550.00 1,020.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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