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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:

Dear Eliza,

Veron Chen (LKl(Auto)
Wednesday, 6 December,2017 2:36 PM
'Eliza Ho'
SUR
RE: Market Value - SJJ9639C / DOA: 4.12.17

The market value for SJJ 9639C is S'15K-S16K (EST) as at Dec 2OL7.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

IKK Auto Consultants Pte ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue t,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Eliza Ho [mailto:Eliza_Ho@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 December,AOLT 10:30 AM
Subject: Market Value - SJJ9639C / DOA:4.12.17

Hi,

Pls advise on market value, thank you.



Eliza Ho
Assistant Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
D: +65 6594 2554 | F: +65 6225 7402 | etiza_ho@ss. msie-asia.com

MSIG
lnsurer Ctaims
Team of the Year

,r li. 2016

MSIG fnsurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #74-01 Hong Leong Buitding, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

O*n"r lDType

Owner lD

Singapore NRIC

7530A

DoA: +\;"ln

(vrsrg

Primary Colour Blue

Manufacturing Year 2OO8

EngineNo. 3224823t52

Chassis No. MR053ZEE106I27O37

Maximum PowerOutput 80.0 kW (107 bhp)

Open MarketValue $15,084.00

Original Registration Date 30 Sep 2008

First Registration Date 30 Sep 2008

TransferCount O

ActualARF Paid $16,084.00

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility Yes

PARF Eligibility Expil Date 29 Sep2QIS

' PARF Rebate Amount $8,042.00

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date 29 Sep2OtS

COE Category A - Car (1600cc & below)

COE Period(Years) 10

: QP Paid $14,100.00

COE RebateAmount gt,!47.OO

Total Rebate Amount $9,189.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Dec2OtT
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