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Veron Chen (LKMuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Gc:
Subject:

Dear Chin Kiat,

Veron Chen (LKl(Auto)
Wednesday, 6 December,2017 10:14 AM
'Ong Chin Kiat'
SUR
RE: Market Value for SKH9558B - Date of Accident: 04.12.2017

The market value for SKH 95588 is S55K-S56K (EST) as at Dec 2O!7.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

IKK Auto Consultants Pte ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue !,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Tuesday,5 December,2017 6:26 PM
To: Vin's Automotive Group <vinsautoST@yahoo.com.sg>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Veron Chen
( LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; M I <mi@aispl.com.sg>
Subject: Market Value for SKH9558B - Date of Accident: O4.I2.20t7

Hi all,

Can assist to check market value for SKH9558B?

Date of Accid ent: 04.!2.20t7

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 622574O2 | chinkiat one(ase.msis-asia.com
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12t5t2017 PARF/COE trobate Enquiry
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particu lars

Owner lDType 
l

Owner lD

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported

- 
Vetriae Mate

Vehicle Model

PrimaryColour

Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

chasiis No.

Maximum PowerOutput

I Open Market Value

Original Registration Date

first Cegistration Oate

Transfer Count

ActualARF Paid

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Elieibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF RebateAmount

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

COE Category

COE Period(Years)

QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount

Total RebateAmount


