Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Categories:

Dear Chris,

Noted.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Friday, 11 May, 2018 8:28 AM

chan pick yuen

RE: Re: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17023105/ua3

HMK

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 10 May, 2018 8:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Re: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17023105/ua3

Dear Mei Kwan,

cancel claim & no survey . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 December, 2017 10:30 AM
To: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17023105/ua3

Dear Chris,

We refer to the above matter.

Attached here with Ol’s sketch plan and statement for your perusal.



Sketch Plan
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Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Thin Thin at 6841 2360.

AMK dustral Bk 2

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741418
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com=

Sent: Monday, December 04, 2017 4:36 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA 5GP - Motor Survey

Ce: TAN Wancong

Subject: SFY3133C & 5LP4406K DOA 01.12.2017

Attachments: IMG-20171204-WAQ037 jpg; IMG-20171204-WAOD036,jpg; IMG-20171204-

WA0035,jpg; IMG-20171204-WA0034.jpg

Categories: Shekhar

Dear Sir,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report .

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to surveyor our client’s car no : SFY3133C.

We request your insured GIA report & your confirmation of liability . Please let us have your revert asa)
Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP: 92712214



