15152010

INS. CASE OWNER:

( ke ‘CC[HAXM?O W08, ual

ASSIGNMENT ,g\ \1‘9‘
Surveyor: DOI: Date / Time : 4
S e 3 w4 [
egis!
Pre-assign / CCU / FTE 0 @ é ( q 9
Insured Vehicle No. CLP (4, Uo é ,( Claim No. C - [
Name of Insured Policy No. , ‘ 14 3 q 4-S‘0
Insured Tel No. HP: Make / Model
Excess Sec IT :S$ D.OA: ' -1 "'3’ Place of Accident :
Is driver the owner? ( YES / NO ) Nature of Accident :
IfNO, Driver Name / Age : Ol GIA REPORT: YES / NO ; TP GIA REPORT: YES / NO
Driver Tel No. : (V/L: YES/NO) Insured Liability : % Final ? Yes/No
\Z 2T — ¥y -
INSRS: INSRS: INSRS: INSRS:
WSP: H’b “""‘5 . WSP: WSP: ! WSP:
Tel : Tl Tel : i Tel :
Liability : Liability : Liability : Liability :
RMKS: O\MW\W RMKS: RMKS: : RMKS:
Date/ Time
N N12f . olp Wl lr X STAGE DaiRa
M FILUT 7 \ Wl (T B Non-Reporting Itr (Ist):
R Non-Reporting Itr (2nd):
AL XN At vy Vo awpwened - Non-Reporting Itr (Final):
Notification ltr (if non-pickup):
ik 1 2 Call OL:
WTW Dwnlad C(w & Tavymy Ay, After call Itr to OL:
Y Documentation Check List: Handler  Typist
27-0lr- | 5| o Cawti / TCC( . No 9\/""""1 olpe ) Notification Itr (if non-pickup) [
A i U After call Itr to OL
’ Authorisation To Act: [
. Release Voucher:
Final Repair Bill: ]
Car Rental Invoice: |
Towing Invoice I_I L__l
LTA/GIA :
Medical Bill: L1
L I P e
Mandate/Reject Instruction: ;[_
LOD o
Payment Breakdown Form:
PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Sent By: Post-Repair Photos: =] el
lothers: o R
FINALIZATION Date/Time: Confirm with: Confirm by:
Repair Cost: S$ ( days) Reduction: % Email [ Jcall [ |
FINAL SETTLEMENT  Date/Time: Confirm with Bamill_ Jcal |
Final Liability: % (Agreed / Assessed) BOLA S/N No. : If NO or B 28, Ass. Lia :
Repair Cost: S$
Loss of Rental (LOR): S$ ( days)
Loss of Use (LOU): S$ (3 X days)
Loss of Income (LOI): S$ ($ X days)
LORonly [ | LOUonly [ |LOR+LOU[__] LOR+LOI[___| [Tick only one]
GIA/LTA Search S$
Medical: S$ 1) Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Disburs®ment: S$ (e.g. Tow/ Independent ) 2) Report Format:
Legal Cost S$ 3) Survey fee:
Total: SS Global Sum S§:
FINAL PAYMENT Date/Time: Confirm with: Email | canl |
Payee 1: S$ " Name 1: - —
Payee 2: (Strike if N.A.) S$ Name 2: . = -l
Payee 3: (Strike if N.A)  |S$ Name 3: B
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

PRI
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING I - - . —
Case Notified Est Submirted Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status |
05 Dec 2017 05 Dec 2017 . \
Main S Cancel Case I
Assign | | | - e = ==l NN

Reference | Claim Details Documents

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS T | [Created by insurer]
Insured: | LAM, NGOH LOONG, Co. Reg. No.: S7620341E, Tel: +6597875808, Email: ARIC.LAM013@YAHOO.COM
'Main Claimant: | YAP KIN LOON, ID: S0210403B

Vehicle Reg. No.: SFY3133C | Date of Loss: 101/12/2017 00:00 - :59

| Claim Type: TP / C0461597 Policy/Cover Note No.: P1939950 (Comprehensive)

|
Vehicle Reg, No. | SLP4406K Policy No. (Claimant):
|

(Insured): ! 4

S | o = i _Excess: 15$0.00

Repairer: - Not Applicable - (-)

Handling Insurer:  AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288 ... [Handled by Tan Kwee May]

Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 14/12/2017]

‘ ?{,"‘;f.:ég')‘f'“'“ |LAM NGOH LOONG (41 / Male), NRIC: S7620341E, Tel: +6597875808

|Adj Asg. Remarks: _

; ARC - No Please come back on !iébllfty

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al Compose Case Mall
o AXA_SG (05/12/2017): WP/ PRI Assignment - C0461597/P1939950 ) -

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View All |  Search Tasks |  Create New Task | complete |

i Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
||| No results.

050+ C 25

Chric Viq NN
chak Vit

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 5/12/2017



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Categories:

Dear Chris,
Noted.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Friday, 11 May, 2018 8:28 AM

chan pick yuen
RE: Re: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17023105/ua3

HMK

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 10 May, 2018 8:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Re: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17023105/ua3

Dear Mei Kwan,

cancel claim & no survey . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 December, 2017 10:30 AM
To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/AXA17023105/ua3

Dear Chris,

We refer to the above matter.

Attached here with Ol’s sketch plan and statement for your perusal.



From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 04, 2017 4:36 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Cc: TAN Wancong

Subject: SFY3133C & SLP4406K DOA 01.12.2017

Attachments: IMG-20171204-WA0037.jpg; IMG-20171204-WA0036.jpg; IMG-20171204-
WA0035.jpg; IMG-20171204-WA0034.jpg

Categories: Shekhar

Dear Sir,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report .

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to surveyor our client's car no : SFY3133C.

We request your insured GIA report & your confirmation of liability . Please let us have your revert asaj
Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP: 92712214



