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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ub| Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL 6256 3567 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg No 199607168R GST Reg No. 12-9607196-R

Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

Ref : CCHR/AIGITO23080/Uua3

BmesionG M
CHARTIS BUILDING Date - 05-12-2017
SINGAPORE 079120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
insured Veh.  SJE 9842 Veh. Inspected SGE 74352
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05122017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Meodificatic
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
8. General Informatior’
Accident Date  03/12/2017 Inspection Jate 08/122017
Survey held at JIN AUTO SERVICES FTELTD
BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10
#01-412
SINGAPORE 539195
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




I\

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10 #01-412

Singapore 5391595
Tel:62808126 Fax :62870590 Vor W

Company Reg No:200704370C GST Reg No ::200704370C

$112/2017 S (§ __‘3_,_.?.'_"”"--":--’D/‘L

M/S AIG J%W‘

ESTIMATE REPAIR COST FOR SGE 74352

SN QTY DESCRIPTION

1 | PC  REAR BUMPER L 47070 . —
2 IPC REAR BUMPER CLIPS A § 30.00—
3 1PC REAR BUMPER RETAINER 4o S 57.10 —
4 | PC REAR RH LAMP S g 472.60—""_
5 1PC  REARRH DOOR Wfsesfs  1.12280
$ 215320
LESS 25% § (538.30)
5 L.614 90
6 REAR RH RIM A S 42480 XA
7 SPRAY PAINT $ 400,00 ¢~
8 TRANSFER OF REVERSE SENSOR s 12000 {o
9 WHEEL ALIGNMENT $ 120,00 £ o
10 TUFF KOTE 3 8000 25
I LABOUR CHARGE 5 680.00 ¢
12 WIRING CHECK § 25.00 5+
§ 346470
___,....-""‘
A )

LEK Auto Congultanty hence nobify

Ihe Repairar of the lollowing;

* Ty remurvey helore! s Saray panfiing

« To displey Samaged san|y) dureg rmeurvey

= Pars prices ane 4y lsect o comfirnabion

® Third party duneey & 00 & “Wilhoul Frejudics” bass
® Mo ilegal modrdicatiniy] @ Aowed

® Supfiementyry (T8 el De r=4ireryed ang
B sl im0 T apaTnvl PO CRTETE LOTTGRTy
Acknowsenped by Repsaer
Sgnatiee:
Dater
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Asher Sna EI.I{I{Autu!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 12:19 PM

To: 'Syed-Yusoff, Saliha’; Olivia Lau (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 40B46734085G-003

Attachments: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SJE964Z ( AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017
Hi Saliha,

We refer to the email below.

Enclosed the confirmation from the repairer.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Cose Hondier
LEK Auto Consultonts Ple Lid

phone: &84 1-603] | emoil; gsheang@kkawio.com | foo 6741-4108
Bl 51, Poya Ubl industrol FPark, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Sallha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 February 2019 11:57 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: AlG ref: 40B46734085G-003

Dear Asher,
Please let us have the date of the tele-conversation with repairer.

Thank you,

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd



AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1917 |

wiww.aig sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 26, 2019 3:11 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <gliviala kauto.com>
Subject: RE: AlG ref: A0B46734085G-003

Hi Saliha,

We refer to the email below.

According to the tele-conversation with the repairer recently mention that claimant did not come back for repair.

Therefore we are pending confirmation email from the repairer and we shall submit our w/p and close of the case.

Thank You,

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Case Handier

LKK Auto Consullonts Ple Lid

phone; 6841-6051 | emal; gshersng@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payo Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408%33)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 2:09 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: AIG ref: 40846734085G-003

Importance: High

Dear Asher,



Any development on this matter? It's been more than 1 year since DOA. Please advise when was the last
correspondence with repairer.

FYl- We have settled the related Bl claim at 50% global sum.
Thank you

Kind Regards,
Sallha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building,78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1917 |

Www.AIE.SE

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



Asher Sna SLKKAutn!

From: Jjouis <jous@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 3:15 PM

Teo: Asher 5ng (LKKAUtD)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGET435Z AND SJE964Z ( AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017
Dear Asher,

We have close file on our ends.

Thank you B Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Lid

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195

Tel :|65) 62898126
Fax (65) 62870590

Emall :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mallto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 3:08 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SJE964Z | AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017 ;

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Hi Jouis,

We refer to the above matter,

Please kindly advise on the status.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ashet Sng | Casa Hondber
LEK Aulo Consullents Ple Lid

phona: 48414051 | emait sshennadkkauto.com | fax 6741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubl Industial Park, Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408%33)



From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 February 2018 5:03 PM

To: jouis <jouis@{inauto.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-ailkkauto.coms; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
<jaskhine @Ikkauto.com>; Thin Thin [LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SIE964Z | AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017 :

WITHOUT PREJIUDICE
Dear Jouis,
We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate
either party's version. Please refer to the below copy of our insured's accident repart for your perusal,
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We are in a course of investigating Into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard
further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.



Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler (on behalf of Thin Thin)
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phane: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubl Industrial Park, UThi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LKK = Save bhe Sarth: Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contaln conlidential and privileged material, and are lor the sole use of the intended recipient. Lise or dislribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you recenved this @-mail in emor, please do not read
this e-mall or any attached itams. Please delete tha e-mall and all aftachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mall, all attachmants and any copies thereol. Thank you.

From: jouis [mailto:iouis@jinauto.com.sg|

Sent: Friday, 23 February, 2018 4:59 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SJE964Z ( AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017 :

Without Prejudice

Dear Thin Thin

Your insured have reported .

Please establish the liability .

Thank you & Best Regards,
louis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel : [65) H2898126
Fax  :(65) 62870590

Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuta) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com)|
Sent: Tuesday, 19 December 2017 4:48 PM

To: jouis <jouis@|inauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SJED64Z  AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017 :
Dear Jouis,

Yes, handle by me,

Meantime, we are still pending for our insured report from our principal.

|



Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | emall: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: jouls [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 4:46 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kk ms
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SIE964Z [ AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017 :

Dear Thin Thin,

Refer to the below mentioned .
Is this case handle by you ?

Able to establish liability .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouls Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel : [65) 62898126
Fax  :[B65) 628705590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Tuesday, 5 December 2017 11:10 AM
To: jouis <jouis@jinauto. com.sg>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments{@ lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SIE964Z ( AIG INSURED ) ON 03/12/2017 :

Hi Jouis,

Thank you for your email.
By copy to Shirley.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin



LKEK Aute Consultants Pie Lid
Phone: 6366 voss | email: MeilRwan@|kkawto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinsuto.com.sgl

Sent: Tuesday, 5 December, 2017 10:13 AM

To: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) <Mesikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE7435Z AND SJE964Z | AIG INSURED ) OM 03/12/2017 :

Dear SirtfMadam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE74357 AND SJE964Z | AIG INSURED ) ON03/12/2017

Please appoint Marcus 's to conduct SGE7435Z inspection at :

Place : Blk 14 #01-412

Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

We would be appreciate if could revert to us on the liability urgently .

Thank you & Best Regards,
lauis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195,

Tel : (65) 2898126
Fax :(65) G2B70590
Emall : jouis@jinauto.com.sg



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked / Ne ssttlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Notified Est Submited | Al Amsigred Adj Rpt ] 'A_nj_s-u_ﬁﬁ;u | Ins Auth'ed | Status e
'I 1
05 Dee 2017 Feodiratady $$2.050.00  |5$2,050.00 ("'""“"' for Susrvay
tows | I Eait Ay &t | et extimates | | _view Rot | | o Cancel Case |

]I-.IH KENG LONG, 1D S3802442]

r “To%/12/2017 2100 - 58
|Wo.: l““"“ Date of LosS! || 140 Months and ® Days From LTA Reg Date (Man r]]

Claim Type: | TP / 40B46734085G Y over | 2100406474-02000 (Comprehensive)

Wehiclke Reg
Policy Mo,
Mo SIEFEATL {Claimant}:

|DMPCITS019526

— — e ——— —— aa E:m:
T ;lh'l Auto Services Pie Ltd (Defu) Blk 14 Cefu Lane 10, #01-410/412, 539195 Defu Lane - Tel: 6285 8126
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel B5-6419-3000  [Handled by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Saliha Syed-
Yusoff@aig.com
| ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: BE2D 9195

| LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6255-3561  |randled by MARCUS CHUA] . | Final Rpt due 14/12/2017] |

Wiew All I Compose Case Mail I

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Senrch Tasks | Create vew Task | Complets |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Hondler Assigned By Completed On Created Dn ~ Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 14/3/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SGET7435Z (40B467340B5G)
[SIE964Z]
TP
LIM KENG LONG
Dec 3 2017 9:30PM
[LAU HOW TIANG]
Jin Auto Services Ple Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Assesament Reports B Loerpooe V]| M
|Na | Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thumibnail| Print
:' :1muu 10:28 mm::——-mmm © | Lasd M

Photos/Images - 3perpoge | v]| &
\Wo | Relabel/Aeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 06/12/17 14112 | Odometer Reading 0O v | 4
2 08/12/17 14112 | General View 0! adws | B
1 |o8/12/17 14112 Chassis Number 0 | adivs |
@ |08712/17 14112 | Genarsl View D | osows | B
5 (06/12/17 14:12 | General View 0O ldwrs | &
6 0612/17 14:12 | General View © | ladws | A
17 |D6/12/17 14:12 | Ganeral View 0| odivcg | A
I8 |06/12/17 1412 | General View D | lcadawrs | A
8 |06/12/17 14:12 | Ganeral View D | loadis | A
10 |06/12/17 14112 | General View - © | s | &
11 06(12/17 14:17 | General View - © | oaws | &
12 (D617 14112 | Genersl View D | losdwes | A |
|13 |06/12/17 14:12 | Genersl View 0 | wedws | A
114 [06/12/17 14112 | Genaral View 0 | oows | HA |
(15 (06/12/17 14112 | Genaral View o O eiic | A
16 |06/12/17 14112 Ganeral View 0D | Load s E-3
17 |B6/12/17 14:12 | General View 0 | iloaawrs | B
1B 06/12/17 14112 | General View 0 | tcaaws | B4
19 [06/12/17 14:12 | General View 0 | toadirs | A
20 |06/12/17 14:12 | General View | @ | tosdres | B4
21 (D117 14117 | Genersl View "ﬂ Load PG | A
22 (06121714112 | General View O | siws |
23 |08/12/17 14:12 | General View D | Lmsws | BA
(28 06/12/17 14:12 | General View 0O | wmiws | 4
35 [06/12/17 1812 | General View O | s | &4
16 |06/12/17 14112 | Genarsl View - 0 | Lsdirs | B2
27 |06/12/17 14:12 | General View D | aws | A
28 (08/12/17 1412 | Ganeral View O | aowc |
20 |06/12/17 1412 | Ganeral View D | tasws | A
30 |06/12/17 14:12 | General View - O | edwc | A
31 |0612/17 14:12 | General View i Lowd PG ]
Documentation ] Jflw!rn!. EI E ;

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/3/2019



Mernimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

(Assessment Reports S iperpage  [v] A
(Mo | Finzized On | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G] Thumbinall  Print
[No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) N B | Thumbnail | Print
|1 |0S/12/1717:42 | TP GIA REPORT N ) | LoeaFoF
|2 |07/12/1709:51 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load PDF
3 ;ﬂ_?gllfl.? o951 S5JE 964Z - NON REPORTING LETTER Load POF
[4 O 12f 1T 09:-5% POLICE REPORT ! Laad PDF
Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Seve | ont ||

iﬂ!mlmmdmmmmwnﬂmm
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co regno 1essorissr;

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubil Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall sur@ikkauto.com;assignmentsi@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG1T023080/UEA3Q2
Date: 14/03/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. Policy No: 21004064 74-02000
Faumant Vehicle saE743sz Insured Vehicle No : SJES64Z
Date of Loss: 0322017 Nature of Claim: P Claim No: 408467340856
D RIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF Hi
Reg No: SGET4352
Make & Model TOYOTA WISH, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 1222489933
Reg. Dale. 24/03/2008 (Man. Year. 2008) Chassis No: ZNE100290216
Colaur. Grey Odometer 264245 km
Engine Capacity 1784 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S%). Marketl Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable) Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215M45Z R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215452 R17
Front Left Side: Landsall 6 mm Rear Left Side Landsail 6 mm
Front Right Side: Landsail & mm Rear Right Side: Landsail & mm
The above vibes represent the rermaining fyre reads death
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 2,030.70 1.614.80 424 80 20.83
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0,00
Labour 1.425.00 960.00 465.00 3263
Faintwaork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 3.464.70 2,574.90 B89.80 25.68
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,050.00
(S5) 3.484.70 2,050.00 141470 4083
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 24253 143.50 89.03 40.83
Nett Amount (S§) 3,707.23 2,193.50 1,513.73 40,83
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment. 06122017
Date Inspecled: 06122017  Inspected Al Jin Auto Services Ple Lid (Defu)
Blk 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412
Singapore 539185
Eslimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: Thig repart represants our fingings af ihe fime and place of inspechon siated heren. Such mapection has been camed out fo (e bear of our
knowiedoe and abiity but any cther fability under any other cicumatances s heraby expressly axcluded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 ‘REAR BUMPER Dented 470.70FL *47T0.70FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 30.00FL *30.00 FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER RETAINER Benl 57.10FL *57.10FL
4 1 *REAR RH LAMP Scralched 472 BOFL *4T72 BOFL
5 1 ‘REAR RH DOOR Dented / Bent 1,122 80FL *1,122.80FL
8 1 ‘REAR RH RIM Repair 424 BOFS *-FS
F=Franchias part S=5pcNelt L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (5%) 2,578.00 2,153.20
- List Item Discount en L tems 25.00/25.00% (S$) 538.30 538 30
Total Parts (S§) 2,039.70 1,614.90
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairar's Amount
Labour ltems

1 SPRAY PAINT Mew 400.00 400.00
2 TRANSFER OF REVERSE SENSOR New 120.00 50.00
3 WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 120.00 60.00
4 TUFF KDOTE New 80.00 30.00
- LABOUR CHARGE New 680.00 400.00
6 WIRING CHECK MNew 25.00 20.00

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,425.00 960.00
I Report was unsubmitted during this print-out ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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