e ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

ABWIN I}% 8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2

#07-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Your Ref:
Qur Ref: AC17110037

15/12/2017

ECICS LIMITED

7 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE
SINGAPORE 0389837

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear 3irs,

ACCIDENT ON 30/11/2017 INVOLVING SLN-6519-R & SIM-8666-P SLE

We are authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle, SLN-6519-R, which was involved in the captioned accident
with your insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist him/her in presenting his claim

against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, SIM-8666-P, we are submitting these claims for your
cansideration on behalf of the owner/driver/claimant.

1. Cost of Repair £3,340.03
2. 0 days Car Rental x 50.00 -
3. Loss of Use (7 x 5200.00) $1,400.00
4, Survey Fees
5. LTA Fees 52.00
6. TP/GIA Fees
7. Medical Feas =
8. Others

(E&OE) $4,742.03

We enclose the following documents to support the claims:-

[E/Hepair,-’Excess Rill D GlA/Police Repart(s) D Power of Attorney I:l Medical Bill
D Surveyor Report E/GIMTP Search D Car Rental Bill D Witness Statermnent

|:l Coloured Photographs D Insurance Certificate |:| Others:

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client's claim as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim
(if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

Yours faithfully,
ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD .

7

LINDA LIAC

Claims Department

E-mail: lindaliao@abwin.com.sg
DID: 67139417

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD, 8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2, #07-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, SINGAPORE 413875
Company Registration No. 2013186856



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 January 2018 10:30 AM

To: 'COLLINKHOO1988@GMAILCOM’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM 8666P & SIP 7064S AT / ALONG SLE TOWARDS CTE ON
30/11/2017.

Dear KHOO KENG TECK,
[Without Prejudice]
By Email Only

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM 8666P & SJP 70645 AT / ALONG SLE TOWARDS CTE ON 30/11/2017.

We refer to the above accident matter.

As spoken, we are the loss adjusters acting on behalf of M/s ECICS Limited, the Motor Insurer of SIM B8666P on the
reported accident on 30/11/2017.

Our Principal has received a Third Party property damage claim from the owner of SJP 70645 with regards to the above
accident.

We will try our best to negotiate for an amicable settlement on best possible terms with Third Party under the terms
and conditions of your motor policy. In this respect, the vehicle’s premium/NCD may be affected as a result of the above
claim.

In the event that you receive any letters/ court documents regards to the above accident matter, please do not reply or
respond, you may forward to us directly for further handling and we will reply on your behalf.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auta Consultants

phone: 4841-6051 | emall; gshersng@lkkauto.com | fox 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payo Ubi industial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408733)



ABWIN i

Date: iﬂwlr’i

i
flonstriactran Pe Lif
From: " (@neral . (Name of Policyholder)

My Vehicle No.: Sinv f ) 7R Other Vehicles: {144 J}Z"ﬁ ’;‘?

Accident Date: ‘% ;-;f M ,f / ? Locatian; f Z f.:
LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
To: EL"C 5 L‘lm i "Jr (Third Party and/or Third Party Insurer)

| have authorised ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD to proceed with the repairs to my accident damaged vehicle and to proceed with
3rd Party Insurance Claims against Third Party and / or its Insurer on my behalf for property damages, costs, and expenses,
including loss of use, loss of rental, medical fees and legal costs.

To have absolete discretion to agree to any settlement of compensation amount in respect of my/our claim against third
party {except persanal injuries and medical claims).

As ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will be handling the entire 3rd Party Claims, which includes signing / submission of all

relevant documents and negotiation of my claims on my behalf, kindly forward and make payable all proceeds of my claims
to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

| confirm that the payment of any negotiated settlement with and accepted by ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will serve as an
effectual discharge of my claims against the Third Party and / or its Insurer for the damage caused.

= 2

Palicyholder's Signature / Company's Stamp (if applicable). Witness's Signature
S ¥ o F s 1 [
Name: kaé"”?ﬁ Lff&.m!? ?:'.f' z Mame: J_,.ﬂ{,{'g:.,
- B : =3 2
NRICNo./ROCNo.: (/1 /[ §¢ 2/ NRICNo: S § 5434 i
Designation: P ? £l
/

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD, B KAK| BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2, #07-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, SINGAPORE 415875

Company Registration No. 20131868506



EC/CS

nsurance

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

CLAIM NO:

In consideration of the payment of the sum of DOLLAR THREE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED

TWO AND CENTS THREE ONLY. (5$3,702.03), I/We, hereby accept such sum in full and final

settlement of all claims, present or future, that I/We have or may have against ECICS

Limited, KHOO KENG TECK as insurers, owner and driver of Vehicle no. SJM 8666P in

connection with or in any way arising from the accident involving the said vehicle which

occurred on 30/11/2017 at SLE with SLN 6519R.

I/We further agree that this payment is made without any admission of liability on the part
of the said insurers, owner and driver of the vehicle no. SJM 8666P and this settlement does
not in any way prejudice or prevent any party from making any claim whatsoever which may
arise from the damage caused to the vehicle no. SLN _6519R in the above mentioned
accident. |/We further undertake not to make any reference to the settlement herein

mentioned in respect of such claim.

*1/We authorize you to pay the above settlement sum to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

*DATEDTHIS ' ' DAY OF P 20,20
Signature &/or Signature ' :'.‘.- \
Co Stamp: &/or Co N>
Stamp: e
MName of f D | 2
Claimant : Wy Thiny [ 72 Name of dindo [ lov
Witness:
Address: Wized st 17 £¥ Y
o - Address:
PESES i ‘ "
SALFFSS P Kok, g,nkrf Aveé ¢
Occupation: i F G'F - £ Pre bbb faks fuif
e Occupation: ,g'ﬂ._f, 3
. (z 4y 840 PLPE 3R e -
NRIC No: Wb dd NN,
NRIC No:

* Delete if not applicable
* Please ensure the date is duly filled in OV TPD {Ver Jan 16]

T TEMASEHK BOULEVARD #10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE SINGAPORE 038987 TEL: 63374779 FAX: 63389267
COMPANY REGISTRATION NO: 198901301C WEBSITE: http:iiwww.ecics.com.sg

}



ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

o
=AY 8 KAKI BUKIT AVEMUE 4 - GATE 2
.;-';:F #O7-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT

.

SINGAPORE 415875

Tel: 67139400, Fax: 67138415

|NVGICE Co. Reg. No.; 2013186856, G5T No.- 2013186855
To:  ANMANI GENERAL COMSTRUCTION PTE LTD Invoice No.: PAC17110037
11 WOOLANDS CLOSE Invoice Date: 15/12/2017
#04-44 WOODLANDS 11 Our Ref.: AC17110037
SINGAPORE 737853 Date of Accident: 30/11/2017
Vehicle No.: 5LN-6519-R
Make: HONDA
Model: VEZEL 1.5X &
S/N |DESCRIPTION ary AMOUNT (S$)
1 |BEING COST OF REPAIR TO ABOVEMENTIONED VEHICLE FOR ACCIDENT ON 1 $3,121.52
30/11/2017 AT SLE
Remarks:
SUB TOTAL $3,121.52
7% GST $218.51
TOTAL $3,340.03

Payment by cheque should be crossed and made payable to ABWIN
SERVICE PTE LTD.

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

-

A
/"

Authorised Signature

Pagelofl

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD, B KAKI BUKIT AVENLUE 4 - GATE I, 807-48 PREMIER & KAKI BUKIT, SINGAPDRE 15875

Company Registration No, 2013186856




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am ta 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Mo: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-178445
Date of Request; 30112017 Your Ref No: COnline Purchase

Abwin Service Pte Ltd
MNo. 8 Kaki Bukil Avenue 4
#07-45 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2

Singapore 415875

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 30M2017

Enguiry By Linda Liao

TP Vehicle Mo. SJIMBEEER

Accident Date 30M12017

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJIMBBGEF ECICS Limited 06/02/2017-06/02/2018 63374778 /6303 0178
Thank You,

The images providad to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever far any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports aor their images.

This is a computer generated document and reguires no signature,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp ... 30/11/2017



Invoice

GENERAL

ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-17-179445
Date of Reguest: 301102017

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

Mo. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premien@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

Dear Sirfviadam,

INSURANCE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Mo: Cnline Purchase

Enguiry Date M eoT

Enguiry By Linda Liao

TP Vehicle Mo, SJIMBEEEP

Accident Date 30112017

DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (5%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 187
EST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_... 30/11/2017



