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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 January 2018 2:59 PM

To: Sebastian Yeang (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalization SHB463S

Hi Sebastian and Shiau Chan, 

 

The repair cost confirm at $1050/- (2 days) as per your recommendation. 

 

Regards 

Poh Suan 

 

From: Sebastian Yeang (LKK Auto) [mailto:SebastianYeang@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 09 January 2018 10:16 
To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC) 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Finalization SHB463S 

 

Dear Poh Suan 

 

Please refer to updated attachment for the finalization. 

 

 

Dear Shiau Chan 

 

Please proceed to edit the report upon Poh Suan’s confirmation. 

 

 

Thank You 

 
Best Regards, 

Sebastian | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561  email: sebastianyeang@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


