Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 5:14 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 26397247855G-003, accident involving SKD6777B and SHD914Y on 28
Nov 2017

Dear Poh Kin,

Note that the witness statement stated OIV cut into the lane. However, the statement did not state whether the taxi
was travelling along the the 2" lane or changing lane. There is no dispute to OIV changing lane as Ol has reported
Sso.

The witness statement is inconclusive and did not support TP’s version.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1881
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 3:38 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Cec: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG ref: 2639724785SG-003, accident involving SKD6777B and SHD914Y
on 28 Nov 2017

Importance: High

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Your Ref: TP / 2639724785S5G
Our Ref: CC3/AIG17023033/Kfa3



Dear Chee Heng,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SKD 6777B (Ol) AND SHD 914Y (TP) ON 28/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Apologies for the delay on this matter.

Ol reported that she was driven along Jalan Bukit Merah and changing lane from third lane from right to
second lane from right and side swipe with TP while TP also changing lane from extreme right lane to
second lane from right. We did clarify with Ol (Ms Patricia) the nature of the accident and she have no
evidence to support her version, she agree to let Insurance company settle the matter at best and aware
that NCD (if any) would be affected.

Third party reported that he driven along second lane from right of Jalan Bukit Merah, suddenly our Insured
swerved into his lane and collided into his taxi left side front portion.

Both party have no scene photo and video footage, however TP submitted witness statement to
us.(passenger on board/not SD)

In view of TP witness statement is not statutory declaration, passenger on board of the taxi, Trans-Cab, we
seek your comments/instruction in advance for us to proceed further.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F ESES

ReERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 9:46 AM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 2639724785SG-003, accident involving SKD6777B and SHD914Y on 28 Nov 2017

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
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