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Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Focus Auto <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 9:51 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref:     SGA 5935 G      Our Ref:    SLP  7464  Y_  DOA: 01/12/2017 ALONG 

TPE/SLE EXITTING TWDS SLIP RD SERANGOON PUNGGOL AT ABOUT 2200 HOURS 

*** LKK REF - CC6/AIG17023025/Uka3

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear OIC, 

 

Thanks for your email. 

 

We agreed to the offer $1,416.00 as state in your email. 

 

Please sent us the DV. 

 

Thank You 

 

Best Regards 

Laura 

  

 

Focus Auto Pte Ltd  

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6  

 #02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883  

Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095  

   

 

On Thursday, 28 December 2017, 9:16, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Laura, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGA 5935G / SLP 7464Y / OTHERS ON 01/12/2017 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We revised our settlement as follows: - 
  
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $    856.00 
2. Loss of Use (7days x $80.00) $    560.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ (WRONG DOA) 

TOTAL $  1,416.00 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
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Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Focus Auto [mailto:focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 3:44 PM 
To: Zaini (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGA 5935 G Our Ref: SLP 7464 Y_ DOA: 01/12/2017 ALONG TPE/SLE EXITTING TWDS 
SLIP RD SERANGOON PUNGGOL AT ABOUT 2200 HOURS *** LKK REF - CC6/AIG17023025/Uka3 
  
Dear OIC, 
  
WRT email dated on 21/12/2017, please advise what the status - Revise Offer 
  
Thank You 
  
Best Regards 
Laura 
  
  
Focus Auto Pte Ltd  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6  
 #02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095  
   
  

On Thursday, 21 December 2017, 14:41, Focus Auto <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> wrote: 
  

Dear Zaini, 
  
Thanks for the offer. 
  
We regret to inform you our client rejected the offer. 
  
Our counter offer 
  
COR $856.00 w/GST 
LOU $700 ( 7 x $100 base on benchmark 1600cc above $100 - $120 ) 
  
Appreciate you may revise the offer. 
  
Thank You 
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Best Regards 
Laura 
  
  
Focus Auto Pte Ltd  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6  
 #02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095  
   
  

On Thursday, 21 December 2017, 14:06, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
  

Your Ref: SLP 7464Y                                          Without Prejudice 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG17023025/Uka3 
  
Dear Laura, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGA 5935G / SLP 7464Y / OTHERS ON 01/12/2017 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $    856.00 
2. Loss of Use (7days x $60.00) $    420.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ (WRONG DOA) 

TOTAL $  1,276.00 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 4:13 PM 
To: Focus Auto; Admin A 
Cc: Zaini (LKK Auto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGA 5935 G Our Ref: SLP 7464 Y_ DOA: 01/12/2017 ALONG TPE/SLE EXITTING TWDS 
SLIP RD SERANGOON PUNGGOL AT ABOUT 2200 HOURS *** LKK REF - CC6/AIG17023025/Uka3 
  
Dear Laura, 
  
Thanks for your email. 
  
Our respective case handler, Zaini will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 
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Hi Zaini, 
  
For your information and necessary action please. 
  
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Focus Auto [mailto:focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 2:22 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: SGA 5935 G Our Ref: SLP 7464 Y_ DOA: 01/12/2017 ALONG TPE/SLE EXITTING 
TWDS SLIP RD SERANGOON PUNGGOL AT ABOUT 2200 HOURS 
  

Dear office In-charges, 
 
Kindly refer to the attached LOD, Repair Claim & Relevant Document. 
 
Our client's claim breakdown as follow: 
1. Cost of repair($800 + 7% GST)  $856.00  
2. Loss of Used (7 days×  $120)  $840.00  
3. LTA search        $29.00  
4. Incidentals         $88.00  

Total Amount:  $1,786.00  

Please revert with an offer asap. 
Thank you. 
 
Laura 

  
  
Focus Auto Pte Ltd  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6  
 #02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883  
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095  
   
  

  

 


