Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 18 December, 2017 3:19 PM

To: Ms Chong

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Notification of Accident & Pre-repair Inspection GBB4456H *** LKK REF -
CC6/11117022965/ha3

Attachments: IMG-20171201-WAO0025.jpg

Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Chong,

Received with thanks.

We are still pending for our principal’s instruction.
We will check and will get back for an update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F EFE” =

RERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ms Chong [mailto:mschong@millionauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 18 December, 2017 2:49 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Notification of Accident & Pre-repair Inspection GBB4456H *** LKK REF - CC6/11117022965/ha3

Dear Vic,

Please refer to the attachment for scene photo.
We look forward on your favorable reply.
Thanks !

Best chards,

Ms Chong

Million Auto Service

No.4 Penjuru Place #01-12,



Singapore 608782
62649091/82285020

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2017 3:33 PM

To: Ms Chong <mschong@millionauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assighnments@lkkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Notification of Accident & Pre-repair Inspection GBB4456H *** LKK REF - CC6/11117022965/ha3

Your Ref:GBB 4456H “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
Our Ref: CC6/11117022965/ha3

Dear Ms Chong,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SH 8352P AND GBB 4456H ON 30/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is not clear. Our Insured Driver reported that your client had encroached into his
lane and resulted in this accident. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your
perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Insured
Driver we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal
assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 4:59 PM

To: Ms Chong

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: Notification of Accident & Pre-repair Inspection GBB4456H *** LKK REF - CC6/11117022965/ha3
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Dear Ms Chong,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured'’s GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ms Chong [mailto:mschong@millionauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 11:26 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ref: Notification of Accident & Pre-repair Inspection GBB4456H

Dear,
Please refer to attachments & arrange surveyor.
Thanks !

Best Regards,

Ms Chong

Million Auto Service

No.4 Penjuru Place #01-12,
Singapore 608782
62649091/82285020



