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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubl Ave 1 801-25 Paya Libl Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 8258 3561 FAX: 6258 4215

Rag. No: 1BBG07198R GST Reg. No. 19-BEOT188-R

Affilisted to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automablle

ECICSLTD

7 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE

SINGAPORE 038387

Raf CC4NCS17022952/K18ad

Date : 04-12-2017

T

Code . ICS
1. Pollcy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGD 4011M Veh. Inspected SHB 4734)
Policy No. MPU1TADOO52000 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DMPL1700640H/JG Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date D4anz22m7
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/12/2017 |inspection Date 04112/2017
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508569
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WWITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




L 2 e

Sim ma ™ Pl Company Registration No. 199607 198R

51 UHIAVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Yourrel: TBA Date: 05.12.2017
Our ref: CCHICS17022952/K lead

The Motor Claims Department

M/s ECICS L TD
Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHB 4734]

We refer 10 the above matter.

Please be informed thar we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 04-12-2017
at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pie Lid (Loyang) have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 994 .40
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% -
"Check" lItems Amount : 53 -
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nen Value 1 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
*** NO DAMAGE FOUND =*=#

Commenis/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: - day

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser
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COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 7010070

ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTE LTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717

65551188
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Asher Sr_ra !I.l{l(Autnz

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 9:33 AM

To: 'Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims)’

Cc: ECICS Claims; Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims),
Admin A

Subject: RE: SHBA734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF: LKK ref:
CC4/1CS17022952/K1ea3

Hi Janice,

We refer to the above matter.

We were informed by TP workshop that claimant do not come back to their workshop for repair up to date as there is
no damage found to third party vehicle at the time of survey.

In view of the above, We will proceed to close file and submit our without prejudice report to your office.

Thank You.

Besl Regards.

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; 6841-6051 | emal: asherngikkauto.cam | fox: £741-4108
Bik 51, Poya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Janice_Goh@ecics.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2018 2:20 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Cc: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Carrie Tan Chi Hui (ECICS, Claims) <Carrie_Tan@ecics.com.sg>; Phoebe lay Xie
(ECICS, Claims) <Phoebelay_Xie@ecics.com.sg>; Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims) <Lionel_Chua@ecics.com.sg>;
Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SHB4734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF: LKK ref: CC4/1C517022952/K1ea3

OUR CLAIM NO. DMPU1700640H/)G
Dear Mei Kwan

Please see attachment.
Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 5267

ECICS Limited



+ Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WiTH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR E-R N/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg
directly.

**please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of claims.
Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.”*

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) :

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February, 2018 10:49 AM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims); motorsurvey

Ce: ECICS Claims; Carrie Tan Chi Hul (ECICS, Claims); Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS,
Claims); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SHB4734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF: LKK ref: CC4/1CS17022952/K1ea3

URGENT
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report
for our necessary action.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 19 January, 2018 2:03 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) <Janice Goh@ecics.com.sg>; motorsurvey <motorsurvey{@ecics.com.sg>

Cc: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Carrie Tan Chi Hui (ECICS, Claims) <Carrie_Tan@ecics.com.sg>; Phoebe lay Xie
(ECICS, Claims) <Phoebelay Xie@ecics.com.sg>; Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims) <Lionel Chua@ecics.com.sg>;
Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng®|kkauto.com>; Admin A <adm Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SHB4734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF: LKK ref: CC4/IC517022952/K1ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report
for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Bost Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | emall: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
2



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent; Monday, 18 December, 2017 9:20 AM
To: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) <Janice Goh@ecics.com.sg>; motorsurvey <motorsurvey @ecics.com.sg>

Ce: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Carrie Tan Chi Hui (ECICS, Claims) <Carrie_Tan@ecics.com.sg>; Phoebe Jay Xie
(ECICS, Claims) <Phoebelay Xie@ecics.com.sg>; Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims) <Lionel Chua@ecics.com.sg>;

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHB4734) VS SGDAD11M THIRD PARTY CLAIM *** LKK REF: LKK ref: CC4/1C517022952/K1ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report
for our necessary action.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwin@l|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S{408933)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Janice Goh@ecics.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 5 December, 2017 3:57 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <sMeikwan@lkkauto.com=; motorsurvey <motorsury £s.cOM.SE>
Cc: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Carrie Tan Chi Hui (ECICS, Claims) <Carrie_Tan@ecics.com.sg>; Phoebe Jay Xie
(ECICS, Claims) <Phoebelay Xie@ecics.com.sg>; Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims) <Lionel Chua@ecics.com.sg>;

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHB4734) V5 SGDA011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Dear Mei Kwan

Our insured has not reported the accident to us yet.
We will forward to you once our insured reported.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 63238 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.5g
directly.



**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of claims.
Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan®@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 December, 2017 9:37 AM

To: motorsurvey

Ce: ECICS Claims; Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims); Carrie Tan Chi Hui (ECICS, Claims); Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS,
Claims); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SHB4734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Your ref: TBA
LKK rel: CC4/1C517022952 /K1ea3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SHE 4734)
Date of survey: 04.12.2017

Number of days: - days

We have not authorized repairs.

*** Please take note that no damage found 6n TP vehicle: RH wing mifror ***
Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 3:21 PM
To: 'motorsurvey’ <mot >

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SHB4734) V5 SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM



Dear lanice,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments @ lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408913)

From: motorsurvey ImaIitg:matgguwe!@ggig.cumggl
Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 3:18 PM

To: Chiang Liat Choon <chianglc@cdge.com.sg>; 'assignments' <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Ce: motorsurvey <mot ec om.

Subject: RE: SHB4734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLaIm

Without Prejudice
Dear Lial Choon

Thank you for your email,
We will assign LKK for the PRI

Aside to LKK

Please assist and arrange TP's survey.
Our Insured has nol reported the accident yet

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +85 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurveyi@ecics.com.sq

directly.

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of claims.
Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.**

From: Chiang Liat Choon :

Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 3:06 PM

To: motorsurvey

Subject: Fw: SHB4734) VS SGD4011M THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Dear Sir,

Attached herewith repair estimate.



Best Regards

Chiang Liat Choon

Taxl Crash Repair ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

Off- 62148314 Fax: 65468156

—— Farwarded by Chiang Liat Cheon/cdge/deigronotes on 04/12/2017 03:02 PM —

From:  “ApeosPon.|V C5570 * <sbe-sinonallinoi®sbetransi. com.so>
To.  chisnolcfficdge com.ag

Date:  OAM22017 02:58 PM

Subject:  Scan Data fram CDG_LO_AW_ASSTO

Number of Images: 11
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Mame: ApecsPort-IV CS570
Device Location:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary
information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
measage and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying,
distributing or disclesing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for
discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any
term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is
committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if
necessary,

§B5 Transit Ltd [Registration No. 1953%206653M)

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are
not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please
be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements
pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are
subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party
shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly
authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We
encourage you to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]
6
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This message may contain privileged and confidentlal Information and ks enly intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantes or

undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or oploions
contained in this message. Any unsuthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part s prohihitod, If you are not the addressee indicated in
his message [or responsibile for delivery of the message to such person), you may nol copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy
this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinlons contained hereln are the personal opinfons of the sender and do not necessarily represent
the views ol ECICS Limited.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6258 35681 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 1909607108R GST Reg No. 18-88071898-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Expaerts En Automobila

ECICS LTD Ref | CCANCS17022052/K1ealq2
o) SINTEG TowER INNER
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE Date - 15-03-2018
SINGAPORE 038887
Code . ICS
1s Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SGD 4011M Veh. Inspected SHE 47344
Policy No. MPLU17A00052000 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DMPU1700B40HIIG Excess (§) D.00
Assign From  JANICE Assign Date 04/1212017
2 Vehicle Particulars & Conditic
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMHUOS7896 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 90972 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres i
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 WEST LAKE T mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S WING MIRROR
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. ‘General Information
Accident Date 021272017 |Inspm:tlun Date Danz2017
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508960
5a. Remaris]
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl Ba = 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199807108R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Paga No.'1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 4734J
Qty Description of Parts a3l
REELACEMENT OF PARTS
1|MIRROR ASSY -RR VIEW SERVICEABLE 88050 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 19610 3
784 40 I
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING NOT NECESSARY 120,00 .
SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA. NOT NECESSARY 80.00
210.00
GRAND TOTAL 994.40
RECOMMENDEDCOSTOFREPAIRS | [ T 8|

Report Ref No, CC4/ICS17022852/K1eal3q2
AT THE TIME OF INSPECTION ,NO DAMAGE FOUND TO THE RIGHT WING MIRROR.

1

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

MNSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD RARTIES - This Report is made sobely for the vss and banei of e Clienl naomed sn the imnl pege of this Repon.




