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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 10:19 AM

To: 'Derrick Quok’

Cc: 'Charandeep Singh'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); 'Aaron Wang'; 'Kenneth Lim'; 'Juliana Wee";
SUR

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Survey assignment: 73939 /CH/WP/ Ding Automotive PTE LTD /OD:

SLF3638S /TP:SHB3949M / DOA: 24.11.2017 / Est:$00.00

Dear Derrick,

Please ignore the previous attachment.
Nett Value as below.

Sorry for the inconvenience caused.

(Summary) Estimated Nett Value

Estimated Book Value 12,620.37
Less Adjusted LTA Rebate 10,943.55
Estimated Nett Value ' 1,676.82

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i
%

ir Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 10:03 AM «
To: Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>
Cc: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Aaron Wang <aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth@directasia.com>;
Juliana Wee <juliana.wee@directasia.com> '
Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Survey assignment: 73939 /CH/WP/ Ding Automotive PTE LTD /OD: SLF3638S /TP:SHB3949M /
DOA: 24.11.2017 / Est:$00.00

Dear Derrick,

Please refer to attached.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Pa}k, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Derrick Quok [mailto:derrick@directasia.com]

Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 3:29 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Aaron Wang <aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth@directasia.com>;
Juliana Wee <juliana.wee@directasia.com> :

Subject: Re: [EXT] RE: Survey assignment: 73939 /CH/WP/ Ding Automotive PTE LTD /OD: SLF3638S /TP:SHB3949M /
DOA: 24.11.2017 / Est:$00.00

Hi Veron,

The taxi’s COE has about Smonths left.
The Nett value should be quite low, kindly request your surveyor to re-check.
Thank you.

Best regards,
Derrick Quok
Direct Asia Insurance

On 30 Nov 2017, at 1:46 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Charan,
We refer to the mentioned vehicle.

Book Value $59,379.34
LTA Rebate $10,949.00

Nett Value $48,430.34



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 29 November, 2017 10:07 AM

To: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Aaron Wang <aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth@directasia.com>; Juliana
Wee <juliana.wee@directasia.com>; Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>

Subject: RE: Survey assignment: 73939 /CH/WP/ Ding Automotive PTE LTD /OD: SLF3638S
JTP:SHB3949M / DOA: 24.11.2017 / Est:$00.00

Dear LKK,

Kindly assist to check market value and economical limit of the taxi.
Attached is the book value.

Regards
Charan Singh / Claims Specialist
Direct: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 6665 5555
Retail: 88 South Bridge Road, ${058716)
www.directasia.com
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email (and any attachment) is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally
privileged and/or confidential information. its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended
recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail reply to this
address may be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business practices. Direct Asia Insurance
{Singapore) Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 200822611G)



-Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 3:29 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Charandeep Singh; SUR; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Aaron Wang; Kenneth Lim; Juliana Wee
Subject: Re: [EXT] RE: Survey assignment: 73939 /CH/WP/ Ding Automotive PTE LTD /OD:

SLF3638S /TP:SHB3949M / DOA: 24.11.2017 / Est:$00.00

Hi Veron,

The taxi’s COE has about Smonths left.
The Nett value should be quite fow, kindly request your surveyor to re-check.
Thank you.

Best regards,
Derrick Quok
Direct Asia Insurance

On 30 Nov 2017, at 1:46 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Charan,
We refer to the mentioned vehicle.

Book Value $59,379.34
LTA Rebate $10,949.00

Nett Value $48,430.34

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 29 November, 2017 10:07 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Aaron Wang <aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth@directasia.com>; Juliana
Wee <juliana.wee@directasia.com>; Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>

Subject: RE: Survey assignment: 73939 /CH/WP/ Ding Automotive PTE LTD /OD: SLF3638S
/TP:SHB3949M / DOA: 24.11.2017 / Est:$00.00




Dear LKK,

Kindly assist to check market value and economical limit of the taxi.
Attached is the book value.

Regards ]
Charan Singh / Claims Specialist
Direct: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 6665 5555
Retail: 88 South Bridge Road, ${058716)
www.directasia.com
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email (and any attachment) is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally
privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended
recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail reply to this
address may be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business practices. Direct Asia Insurance
{Singapore) Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 200822611G)



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

PoA: Jet{u |y
CoAT)

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type
Owner D

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported
Intended De-registration Date
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year
Engine No.

Chassis No.

Maximum Power Qutput
Open Market Value
Original Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date
COE Category

COE Period(Years)
PQP Paid

COE Rebate Amount
Total Rebate Amount

Message

Company
2839G

SHB3949M
Yes

28 Nov 2017
HYUNDAI

. SONATANF 2.0 CRDI AT ABS 2WD 4DR TURBO

Yellow

2010

DAEABS93629
KMHET41VMAA782299
110.0 KW (147 bhp)
$16,752.00

30 Apr 2010

30 Apr 2010

0

$16,752.00

Yes
2% Apr2018
$10,051.00

29 Apr2018

A - Car (1600cc & below}
8

$17,137.00

$898.00

$10,949.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle ¢cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered
upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan {if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Nov 2017

h{tps#/erHa.gov.sglltaMVactionlenquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCT!ON,_!D=F03040091T 12



I4
{ {
PA 0070
00°0 00°0 000 00°0 00°0 299SUPRL
60°2S0°0T ~%E° LLE'6Y ~%L TEG'Y ~09°F6E‘FY ¥E 6LE 65 FOD WATH ‘F/L 0TI ¢ STOTUIA 00°0 GTOTEA
00°250°0T “$E 08T ‘TE -50°§TZ € ~0€" TLE ‘BT ¥€° LT LY 00 ¥ W/L IO ¢ ITOTPA 00°0 500
00250701 -3€°LEE6Y ~BL"ZE6Y ~09° Y6E‘5Y YE°BLE’6S 00°0
00°0 a0°o ~00° 0%t -00" %1 -00°92% 00° 6% I3 £G4 HIA 0T0Z°5070C NS KEV6EEHS 00°0 000 8 SIELOGOT
00°0 00°0 00°0 0o'a 00°0 0070 T4 YYETOIA MILBNIXCL 0T0Z' 0 0€ NSH WeH6EEHS 0070 000 L SIELOODT
00°0 60°8 00°0 00°0 000 009 THAREHL XELIOTA BEINISd 0102 b0°0E NSH W6F6EaHS 0070 000 9 S9€L000T
00°0 60°0 80°0 000 60’0 000 UINROLLIANOD IV 0T0Z° V00 KSH VSvEEaHS 0070 600 s S9ELOOOY
600 00°0 00'0 00°0 00°'0 0g°¢ 4l GOL 500 0T0Z'¥0°0E NSH KSYeEtHS 00°0 000 12 SYELO00T
00°0 00°0 -00°LET LY -GL EIL’T -0€7€2%'ST 00°LET LT %08 S0D 0T0Z'¥0°0€ KRSH WSVEEEHS 00°0 000 € S9ELO00T
00° 15001 00°150°0% ~00°T0L'9 -01-0L9 -0670F0°9 00°2SL ‘9T ZSLOTSAMOI00T IWY 0102 ¥O°OF ISR WSHGEE@S 0070 000 z SIELOOOE
00°0 vo'o ~pC 0SE'E -0 GEE ~0E°ST0'E $ET0SE'E IO DEOMI 0T0Z 60°0€ NSH (GH6EEHS 0070 00D |4 S9EL00OL
00°1 00°% -00°666°1Z -06°661°T -0T 66L 61 00°000 T IS0O DISWR QTO0Z' ¥0°0€ NSH WSYEEES 0070 000 o S9£L000T
"¢ $ $ $ $ $ $ :
wIged Juvd anTeA Noom daN. dsg Cunooy deq xe9gx00  daqraow do 1603 1 woyadrosea 13sSY  snrea‘ded YeR CANCaad S dedT (e oN'vs OoN 3258y
palewrasy/antes dexos :
e * o yPA
LTOT TT ¥T ¢ SIUL JUAPYON
0T0Z°50°0€ ¢ eRwul deD
0T0Z°b0°0€ * ajeq-Bay
vleuss TepunAy < TODHEE USA
Q-S9ELODOT = ON ISV PIO
KEHGELAS * ON’ {2 SouUsd¥l
| 2 00D
T3 NS LI0T 0T TE IV SY BPTLGI60 * HUL
COXENILD ¢ O ¥RSA TOTETATA AIDJRS J99Y4 IO ASN STOTHEA LTOZ TE'BE ava
P 923 qwolaw 2e11AI0rag ¢ ar 3aedey




