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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 3:11 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: LOD - SJE 8498A DOA 30.11.2017

Attachments: 8498-12072018110759.pdf; 8498-12072018110831.pdf

CS/CTI17022873/M1vbe2 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1autopteltd@gmail.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 12 July, 2018 11:22 AM 

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: LOD - SJE 8498A DOA 30.11.2017 

 

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear All, 
 

Please find the attached LOD. 
 

COR    $ 5,778.00 

LTA     $ 5.35 

LOR     $ 720.00 

Total : $ 6,503.35 

 

Kindly arrange for settlement. 
 

Thanks & Best Regards, 
Nicole, on behalf of, 
Chia Sin Muk (Mr) 

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776 

  

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Rd Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643 
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R 
Important: This email is confidential and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us immediately; you should not 
copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you. 


