157572010

LKK:
' NS.CASEOWNER: _ Jo&L. CC3/CTM702 2223 | z2az - i

- _ASSIGNMENT

Surveyor: DOL: Date / Time : 21 / 1213
Registered in Merimen: =

Pre-assign / CCU / FTE
Insured Vehicle No. 9kE 94220 Claim No. WM 17008268 02 / 2P
Name of Insured P HIWEIx Car RENTAL Policy No. DMHC SN /F4F 7/ oo
Insured Tel No. HP: @ 972€& 4949 Make / Model ToYoTA AXTO
Excess Sec I1 :S$ D.OA: 22 /n Z/ t Place of Accident: _ AN RO ZowARDS LORNIZE Ry
Is driver the owner? ( YES 1P) Nature of Accident :
IfNO, Driver Name / Age : TAN/ YZFAWG |, ﬂMtINE OI GIA REPOR' /NO ;TP GIA REPORT@ /NO

Driver Tel No. : (V/L@ /NO) Insured Liability : % Final ? Yes/No
GRG 204T —F —_— _
INSRS: INSRS: INSRS: INSRS:
J WSP: Gyete & Grrage | WSP: WSP: WSP:
4 Tel: Tel : Tel: Tel :
{§ Liability : Liability : Liability : Liability :
RMKS: RMKS: RMKS: RMKS:
_' Date/ Time
GBG 04T - X ; Ckz 9422p - X [sTace DATE/ PIC
<h Z T 7 T/Er on-Reporting ltr (1st):
{4 on-Reporting Itr (2nd):
£ 4 Non-Reporting ltr (Final):
= Notification Itr (if non-pickup):
- =18 FILE KECEIVE) FROM 2a7ER Call OF:
L After call ltr to O
X N0 SJRV 'y | Dong — ¢ Documentation Check List: Handler  Typist
" Notification ltr (if non-pickup)
2-63-1§ | ASK TJp To PRADUCE CCTV TD DETERMINE [UHO 1S LIABIE 7  |After call Itr to O
OTHERWS C EVUAL SHARE S A JPEALABLE SOLWTION - Authorisation To Act:
: Release Voucher:
U] T O TANCL L CAIC ~NQ Final Repair Bill: ]
_— QURSNLY pONE . TP AOVVILD Car Rental Invoice:
I L ole. Towing Invoice L1 L
/ LTA/GIA : ]
Medical Bill: O [l EA
PR 1 1|
j Mandate/Reject Instruction: L] ;_
LOD [ ] [ ]
Payment Breakdown Form:
PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Sent By: Post-Repair Photos: £ |
Others: [ ]
FINALIZATION Date/Time: Confirm with: Confirm by:
Repair Cost: S$ ( days) Reduction: % Email [ |Call [ |
FINAL SETTLEMENT  Date/Time: Confirm with Emaill__J Ccal 1
Final Liability: % (Agreed / Assessed) BOLA S/N No. : If NO or B 28, Ass. Lia :
Repair Cost: S$
Loss of Rental (LOR): S$ ( days)
Loss of Use (LOU): S$ ($ X days)
Loss of Income (LOI): S$ ($ X days)
LORonly [ | LOUenly [ JLOR+LOU[ ] LOR+LOI[__] [Tick only one]
GIA/LTA Search S$
Medical: S$ 1) Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Disbursement: S$ (e.g. Tow/ Independent ) 2) Report Format: :
Legal Cost S$ 3) Survey fee:
Total: S$ Global Sum S§$:
FINAL PAYMENT Date/Time: Confirm with: Emaill | call |
Payee 1: S$ Name 1:
Payee 2: (Strike if N.A.) S$ Name 2:
Payee 3: (Strike if N.A.) S$ Name 3:




Joy Irene (LKKAuto) _
From: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 4:47 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Mars Ler

Subject: RE: GBC 3553L ON 22.11.2017

HiJoy,

Please close the case in your end.
Thank you,
Best Regards,

Christopher L. Bulaclac

Senior Executive- Service Operations

H/P 96552177 D/D 65949160

email : chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650

Tel : 67461000

Fax : 64875857

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 16:45

To: Chris Bulaclac

Cc: Admin A; Mars Ler

Subject: RE: GBC 3553L ON 22.11.2017

Hi Chris,
Liability is unclear. Pending evidence.

In the absence of evidence from both, we are looking into an equal apportionment, subject to insured’s
agreement/approval.

Let me know if you are to proceed with TP claim or to cancel , no survey done in our record.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



From: Chris Bulaclac [mailto:chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 4:41 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Mars Ler <mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg>
Subject: RE: GBC 3553L ON 22.11.2017

Hi Joy,

How’s the liability?
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Christopher L. Bulaclac

Senior Executive- Service Operations

H/P 96552177 D/D 65949160

email : chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sgq
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650

Tel : 67461000

Fax : 64875857

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 15:11

To: Chris Bulaclac

Cc: Admin A

Subject: GBC 3553L ON 22.11.2017

Importance: High

Good afternoon Chris,
Kindly assist to confirm is your client is pursuing Third-Party claim against M/s China Taiping.
Please advise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ilkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.
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-“’ CYCLE & CARIVAGE +FULCO
N

{E)ﬁai‘a of Report: 24/ 1\ (2017 -

MOTOR ACCIDENT REPORT FORM

ata of Accident: 22/l(20 (7 .

| =xcast Location of Acejdent:

|Vehicte Registration Number:

Fulce

NRIG/Passport No./FIN:

’.'&';a.-sufacturer A

Name of Reglstered Owner :
Compa 3

lEXﬁct Purpose for which vehicle was being use at time of Accident Jz’@ormm Usage D Others

I rs Vnu Claiming Under Your Own Insurance ?

D YES J _NO Reporting Only ZI NO 3rd Party

! *u i of Insurance: ALG

] Commercial Vehicle
INSURURANCE DETAILS

F
{7yne of Coverage: ,[ZT Comprehensive L] Third Party

C oo

) Bia
Nars of Driver:

§20. (cover note)

NRIC/PassportFinNo: S €92 G H 24 A .

| Dats, of Birth: ICHQQJ/I 904

Occupation : D,—'lver

L__araof Driving Pass: [7 /1D /quq

Gender : /E] Male D Female

Home No.: 6% U ?O‘S

m'-n-.le No.: C] 134 N
lacicrass: | RLK 6‘*215 s Chy

chv. Cleg wkfosta%odi 682692

l:—.m :il Address :

[Was ha Driver an Employes of the Insured's Company :

] Yes E’ No State the relationship of the driver to insured LQQ sel-.

;\/rhlr

e Re glstratlon Number of driver's Own Vehicle: -

OTHER INFORIMATION OF THE:ACCIDENT

{Tyne of Accident : S Swipe .

ITv'erz'.’\er Conditlon: [ clear Z/Ralnlng = Others, please specify |

:aot T surtace [ Dry A wet L] Others, please specify

Wa-‘ p.nybodylnlured JZ No ] Yes

..»'p Any other material or Property Damaged: [ Yes [ | No Number of Fassengers(including Driver) : |

..bm Accident Photo.In the Scene of Accident: JZ’ Yes || No Was there any video captured by your Camera? : Y‘QS.'
“the Accident reported to police: [1Yes [ANo Was thers any audio recording? : A/

Police Station:

otice of Intended Prosecution

“Ala Registration Number: S kF ‘]‘-F? 2 ﬂ

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE (Please fill Annex A if mare ve

- Name of Registered Owner :

o «"Passport No./FIN:

Company Reg. No(for Company Veh):

.2\ of Driver :

NRIC/Passport/Fin No :

,i' :‘q Home No.:

jadc s J Postal Code

f;_rg;‘ Address :

inssrace Company : 3
’ U 0 v

Iviitness Name:

’L'i?o:-'!act Number:

Details of Injured Person

Age :

Injured Person In which vehicle:

Liiirad Sustained :

$Wally Seatbelts worn: ] ves ] no

e Kiv

VNS S

—




‘EDDIES - Status of Driving License Page 1 of 1

Status of Driving
Licence

QUALIFIED DRIVING LICENCE

Qualified Driving Licence No. : S8738822J
Status of Qualified Driving Licence :  Valid
Class of Qualified Driving Licence : 3A

Expiry Date : Valid for life unless revoked,
suspended or disqualified.

PROVISIONAL DRIVING LICENCE

You (S8738822J) are not a valid Provisional Driving Licence Holder.

The above information is accurate as at 15/12/2017 12:01 AM.

https://eddies.police.gov.sg/licencestatus/xhtml/layout/F rame xhtml 15/12/2017



