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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD ~ -
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883
Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No : 20-0006262-1)
Estimate : 20007
T
= Date - 30.11.2017
7 nds & Vehicle Num - SLN38TT
Make/Model : HONDA CIVIC
Chassisbngime no
Accident Date - 30.11.2017
Claim No = 1117-20007
Oty Particular Amount 55
List Item :
I pc Rear w/s glass moulding ©7 § 87.30 » .
| pc Rearfender LH 1" S 862.00~
I pc Reartail lamp LH #8 vw $ 365.20
| pc ReardoorLH S 764.00
I pe Rear door protector LH “F $ 62.70 ©
I pc Rear wheel bearing LH / $ 286.20 7
| pe Rear shock absorber LH | 40 $ 296.00 -
| pc Rear top arm LH | e $ 196.00°
I pc Rearlowerarm LH $ 212.007
| pc Rear bumper ar $ 638.00
| pc Rear mudflap . o S $ 47507
| pe Rear bumper side retainer LH ** 165" $ 18.307
List ltem Total : 1220 $ 9.488.40
Discount 20 % : $ 1.897.68
$ 7,590.72
Nett Item :
| pc Rear sport rim 1 A0 § RS0t
| set Rear windscreen sealant ™ $ 100.00 ¢
| set Rear bumper clips ™ 5 560007
Special Nett Item : $ 1,000.00
Labour Charge :
Remove and refix rear w/s glass § 150,007
Remove and refix upholtery and cushion seat > e S 150.00
Remove and renew LH sfiSpéasion - ' S 250,00 ’-P{_
Check wheel alignment | 1w 5e0s S 80.00 °
Apply anti rust chemical | *° $ 60.00 7
To transfer reversing & Wiring. . $ 150:00 £
Remove and replace spaj: part'and panel beating y S L5000 =77
To spray paintingandetd ..~ : Talal:) $ 1556000 -0
Labour Charge Total 83,206 Py s 650 § 3,840.00
e D 20w



ivitha (LKK Auto)

From: clarali@fwd.com

Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 2:01 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com; admin-
d@Ikkauto.com

Cc: AsherSng@lkkauto.com; motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: Reguest for PRS SLN387T

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement.

We will forward you a copy of O1 GIA report upon receipt.

9.»{'4‘.“ e EY (H’ Hl':l'
Vehiele In

Thank you. prﬁﬂﬁ@ ﬂﬂl“%

Please create the case in Merimen.

Kind Regards
Clara Li
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Lid,
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four. Singapore 038986

T (65) 67275722
E clarali@fwd.com
W fwd.comsg

Fwo fif

insuranca

Endowment Plan

FWD Gt thas biageen! Gomrnisedd polim $9 5 3

PRI fles aspiable orfine
Limited time offer]

Insurance

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 1:49 PM

To: Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Nancy,

1. Please arrange LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to survey the car.



Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte [
Tel: 6746 3405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: clara.lli@fwd.com ilto:clara.li d.com
Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 1:49 PM

To: nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg
Ce: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com
Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Nancy,
We refer to your letter dated 30 November 2017 of the PRI Notice of your client’s vehicle SLN387T.

Please find our panel surveyors as follows: -
1. LKKAUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
2. INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE
3. AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we reserve our rights to request for pre-repair inspection of your
client's vehicle,

We look forward to receiving your reply.
Thank you.

Kind Regards

Clara Ui
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5722

E cdara.li@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

Endnwmant Plan 202

Fwa' it Disbtunlied retln fors 3 ! + F P .
i | RS Py Ervieeblde CrvlETeR ~ - ™~ wil.COMm.eg
Limited time offer! w 08 I (1 1Y) 9

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy lam@fastechauto.cam sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 1:37 PM




Te: Motor Claims 5G - G Comman
Subject: Request for PRS SLN387T

Hi Sir,

My client claiming your insured SKC 3485T.
Please kindly arrange PRS for SLN 387T.
Date of accident 30.11.2017

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE DIRECTIONS
AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, you are require to provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within
2 days of the notice.

Regards,

Nuncy Lam

Fastech Auto Pre Lid
lel: 6746 3405

Fax: 6745 8520

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments,

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from vour system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that YOu open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Asher Snﬂ (Ll{lm.utn!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 December, 2017 11:10 AM

To: ‘clara.li@fwd.com’

Cc Shu Pei [LKKAuUtD)

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T  Our Ref: 1201700008408
Hi Clara,

We refer to the email below,

We had clarified with repairer that the correct vehicle number should be SKV 3485T.

Therefore we will process to close off merimen and third party repairer will purchase our report.
Thank You.

Best Regards.

Asher 3ng | Case Handler
LKK Aulo Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | emall ashesma@ikkouto.com | fax &6741-4108
#ik 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: clara.li@fwd.com [mallto:clara.li@fwd.com]

Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 5:15 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T Our Ref: 1201700008408

Hi Asher,

The third party reported the vehicle number involved in this accident SKV3485T was not insured with FWD at the
time of accident.

Please clarify with the third party repairer M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd on the correct vehicle number.

Thank you.



VS UETE EIY S | UL U v
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Ragistration Number SKV3485T
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Mame ol Driver NA
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

5 %

Agddress

Poslcode

Insurance Company Name

HNature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Kind Regards

Clara Li
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5722

E clara.li@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

Fwo fff

Endowment P]anl

at tha Ligogett guarantesd retyin

FWD
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Limitad time offer!

nsurance

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 11 December, 2017 3:59 PM

To: Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Cc: Motor Claims 5G - SG Common

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T

Dear Clara,
Kindly lets us have a copy of Ol GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 3:07 PM

To: clara.li@fwd.com; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lk m>; motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto. b
Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN3B7T

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: clara.li@fwd.com [mallto:clara.li@fwd.com]
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 2:01 PM

To: assignments@Ikkauto.com; sur@Ikkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-d@Ikkauto.com
Cc: AsherSng@|kkauto.com; motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: Request for PRS SLN387T

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement.

We will forward you a copy of Ol GIA report upon receipt.

Please create the case in Merimen.

Thank you.

Kind Regards

Clara LI
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)67275722
E clara.li@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

Fwo fff



Endnwment Plan 202

Imurance

Limited time uﬁer’

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 1:49 PM

To: Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Nancy,

1. Please arrange LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to survey the car.

Regards,

MNancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: clara.li@fwd.com [mailto:clara.li@fwd.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 1:49 PM

To: nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg

Cc: matorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Nancy,
We refer to your letter dated 30 November 2017 of the PRI Notice of your client’s vehicle SLN387T.
Please find our panel surveyors as follows: -
1. LKK AUTD CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
2. INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE
3. AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we reserve our rights to request for pre-repair inspection of your
client's vehicle.

We look forward to receiving your reply.
Thank you.

Kind Regards

Claralli
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte, Ltd.



& Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65) 6727 5722

E clarali@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

FwD fff

Endowment Plan 202%

Limited time offer!

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 1:37 PM

To: Motor Claims 5G - G Common

Subject: Request for PRS SLN387T

Hi Sir,

My client claiming your insured SKC 3485T.
Please kindly arrange PRS for SLN 387T.
Daote of accident 30.11.2017

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE DIRECTIONS
AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, you are require to provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within
2 days of the notice.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
antachments.

ATTENTION:



The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at vour own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Asher Sna (LKKAuto) S

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 December, 2017 11:22 AM
To: ‘Nancy Lam’; jason@fastechauto.comsg
Cc ‘motorclaims sqg@fwd.com’

Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN387T

Without Prejudice
Hi Nancy,
Woe refer to our tele-conversation.

Your client reported the vehicle number involved in this accident SKV3485T was not insured with our principal
(FWD) at the time of accident.

We will process to submit our independent report to you upon repair cost is finalized with our surveyor {Mr Adrian).

Thank You.

Besl Regards.

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; 8841-4051 | emaoil: gshersng@lkkouto.com | fax: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Payo Ubl Indusiral Park, Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | S{406923)

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 1:49 PM

To: Clara Li Zirong - SGUser
Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN38TT

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Nancy,

1. Please arrange LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to survey the car.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: clara.li@fwd.com mailto:clara.li@fwd.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2017 1:49 PM
To: nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.s



Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com
Subject: RE: Request for PRS SLN3B7T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Nancy,
We refer to your letter dated 30 November 2017 of the PRI Notice of your client’s vehicle SLN387T.
Please find our panel surveyors as follows: -
1. LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
2. INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE
3. AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we reserve our rights to request for pre-repair inspection of your
client’s vehicle.

We look forward to receiving your reply.
Thank you.

Kind Regards

Clara Li
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65) 67275722

E cdlarali@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

Fwo fff

Enduwmant Plan 2 2 %

gl BV LG B

leltﬁd time ﬂHur‘

From: Nancy Lam [mallto:nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 1:37 PM

To: Motor Claims 5G - 5G Common

Subject: Request for PRS SLN3B7T

Hi Sir,

My client claiming your insured SKC 3485T.

Please kindly arrange PRS for 5LN 387T.

Date of accident 30.11.2017



In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE DIRECTIONS
AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, you are require to provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within
2 days of the notice.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments,

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments,

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



_’ ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

m’_’!ﬁ—l 51 Uibi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8258 3561 FAX: B258 4315

Reg. No: 190807198R GST Reg. No. 18-0607188-R

= Raf : CCAMTP1T022814/Aab3g2

XA LT AVENGE S | ICARN
AR PSR oon. 3201
SINGAFORE 417883
Coda: TP130
T el
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SLN 387T
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 30112017
2 i s el v s & e
Make & Model HONDA CIVIC
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JHMFD 163095200970 Colour BLACK
Odometer 137867 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
Gl_ll:rll GOOD
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI |6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI |6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear T]rm 205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS. _
[ Sr o= _win. SR :  General Information
Accident Diltn 30.-'11@1?
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-48/48/50 AUTOBAY
SIHGAPDHE 417883

o207

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS EDNDUGTED DH ﬁ"’n‘ﬂTHDIJT PREJUDIGE' BASIS.
BjIN AGCORMHGE TO ‘HJUR IHSTF!UE“DHS WE I-I.FN'E HOT F-LITHORISED HEPAIRS

ESTIMATED HDRHA.L PERIDD FOR REPAIR




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199807188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 387T

N —————————

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR W/'S GLASS MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 8730
1|REAR FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE BG2.00
LABOUR
1|REAR TAIL LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 36520
1|REAR DOOR LH TO REPAIR SEE 764 .00
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR PROTECTOR LH curT 62.70 8270
1|REAR WHEEL BEARING LH NOT NECESSARY 2B86.20 -
1|REAR SHOCK ABSORBER LH NOT NECESSARY 296.00
1|REAR TOP ARM LH NOT NECESSARY 166 .00
1|REAR LOWER ARM LH NOT NECESSARY 212.00
1|REAR BUMPER TORN 638.00 63800
1|REAR MUDFLAP CcuT 47.50 47.50
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINE LH NECESSARY 18.30 18.30
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -TET.04 -153.30
3,068.16 61320
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR SPORT RIM (SN} cuT 850.00 400.00
1|SET REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1,000.00 430.00
LABOUR
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR W/G GLASS NOT NECESSARY 150,00
REMOVE AND REFIX UPHOLSTERY AND CUSHION SEAT, INOT NECESSARY 150.00
REMOVE AND RENEW LH SUSPENSION NOT NECESSARY 250.00
CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT 80.00 80.00
APPLY ANTI RUST CHEMICAL NOT NECESSARY 60.00
TO TRANSFER REVERSING & WIRING . 150.00 £0.00
REMOVE AND REPLACE SPARE PART AND PANEL 1,500.00 300.00
BEATING .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FENDER
LH AND REAR DOOR LH
TO SPRAY PAINTING AND ETC 1,500.00 600.00
3,840.00 1,030.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,908.16 2,073.20
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