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ection D - Details of Repair Estimates
‘art 1 - Labour Works

ob Scope

Quotation from ARC

Adjusted by Surveyor. if applicable

'0 REMOVE & INSTALL ALL ABOVE ITEMS AND
IEPAIR OTHERS DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS.

1,3256.00

795.00

‘otal Labour

1,325.00

795.00

‘art 2 - Spray Painting & Panel Beating Related Works

ob Scope

Quotation from ARC

Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable

'‘ROVIDE LABOUR AMD MATERIAL TO PUTTY
\ND RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS

B16.00

528.00

‘otal Spray Painting & Panel Beating

6516.00

528.00

'art 3 - Other Costs - Accident and Accident Repair Related Expenses

ob Scope

Quotation from ARC

Adjusted by Surveyor, i applicable

“otal Other Costs

3US/11/17/5039
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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah Tee@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 1:55 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc Joy Irene (LKKAuUto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref B0D354798B55G,0ur Ref CC3/LCR17022808/5Swb3 ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND SG 5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNOS RD 5

Dear Vivian,

Based on the screen shot the liability is against OID. Please settle TP claim at best.
Thank you.

Regards,

Tee Chee Wah

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-18 Singapore 079120
Tel +64191086 | Fax +68357416

Chee-Wah. Tee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sq
IMPORTANT NOTICE

The mformabon in this emad (and any attschments) is confidential. If you are nof the intended recipien. you must nof use or disseminale the
information, If you have received this amail in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently deiete the onginal and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this emad and any altachments are believed fo be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
compuler system info which it is received and apened, Il is the responsibilty of the recipient fo ensure that it is virus free and no responsihility (s
sccapted by AIG for any loss or damage arsing in any way from i3 use

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com])

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2018 11:35 AM

To: Tee, Chee-Wah

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 80354798855G,0ur Ref: CC3/LCR17022808/Swb3, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND 5G
5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNOS RD 5

Dear Mr Tee

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND SG 5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNOS RD 5

We refer to the above matter

Enclosed is the screen shot accident photo

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/mstruction for this claim.



* Thank you
Best Regards,
Vivian Lau| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6841-B625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408943)

From: Tee, Chee-Wah [mailto:Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 11:25 AM

To: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 80354798855G,0ur Ref: CC3/LCR17022808/5wb3,ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND 5G
5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNDS RD 5

Dear Vivian,
Kindly try to obtain screenshot showing the collision point and the final position of OIV.
Thank you.

Regards,

Tee Chee Wah

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid.

78 Shenton Way AlG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +64101088 | Fax +68357416

Chee-Wah Tee@aia com | www aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential If you are nol the infended recipient, you must nol use or disseminate the
infarmation. if you have received this email in ermor, please immeciately nofify me by "Reply” command and parmanently delete the anginal and
any copies or printouls thereof  Although this email and any atachments are balleved ta be free of any virus or other defect thil might alsct any
computer system inta which it is received and apaned, It (s the responsibility of tha recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no msponsibility is
accepted by AIG for any logs or damage ansing in any way from ity ugse.

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, September 10, 2018 9:21 AM

To: Tee, Chee-Wah

Ce: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 80354798855G,0ur Ref: CC3/LCR17022808/Swb3,ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND SG
5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNOSRD 5

Your rel: 803547988556
Our Ref: CC3/LCR17022808/Swh3

Dear Mr Tee
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND SG 5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG FEUNOSRD S



“We refer to the above matter
Enclosed is the screen shot accident photo

Based on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand. Base on TP photos, O1D change lane .
OID reported that wanted to turn left to Eunos Rd 5, signalled and slowed down before reaching the junction, while
turning OID heard a sound from the back.

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/instruction for this claim.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: YVivianlau@ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 9:36 AM

To: Tee, Chee-Wah' < -Wah.Tee@aig.com>

Cc: Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref: 80354798855G,0ur Ref: CC3/LCR17022808/Swb3,ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND 5G 5573C
ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNOS RD 5

Your ref: 803547988556
Our Ref: CCI/LCR17022808/Swh3

Dear Mr Tee

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND SG 5579C ON 25/11/2017 ALONG EUNOS RD 5

We refer to the above matter

Enclosed is the screen shot accident photo

Based on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand. Base on TP photos, O1D change 1a|_1r. '
OID reported that wanted to turn left to Eunos Rd 3, signalled and slowed down before reaching the junction, while
turning OID heard a sound from the back.

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/instruction for this claim.

"IWishey vou a Happr New Year 2008%



* Thank you
Best Regards,
Vivian Lau| Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phome: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@|kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened. it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
vou must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, § December, 2017 12:00 PM

To: ‘eyap@lioncityrentals.comsg’

Cc: Zayyer (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 5372U AND SG 5579C ON 27/11/2017

Our Refl: CCILCR17022656/K1wal

035 December 2017

LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 3372U AND SG 5579C ON 29/11/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
vou and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us
vour version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for
an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within 7 days i.e. by 14/12/2017, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the
without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other
party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



UWE, SMRT BUSES LTD _(the third party claimant) of 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140__ (address),
owner of SG 5579C (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD  (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“clnim"”) for my vehicle no. _
%8 SCHC that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on __25{11/2017 _ (date) along EUNOS AVE

5 (location) involving vehicle no/s _SLF 53720 (“the accidenmt”).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my ahove mentioned claim in & manner that they deem fit and the workshop
is further suthorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour
of the SMRT BUSES LTD

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without

admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/fowner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Datedthis |3 (day)of _E:QV_ (month) 20 | & (year)

Signed by “the third party claiman!” Signed by “the workshop"
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG ASIA PACIFIC-EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

“We/l, _SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS

PTELTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $ 3,500.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no.
SG 5579C_ that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 25/11/2017(date) along EUNOS RD 5

{location) involving vehicle no/s SLF 33720,

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 29/11/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT BUSES LTD (the third party claimant™) of vehicle no.
SG 5579C make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on hisher

behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l encloss herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense
that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant” after the sbove said agreement lodges
a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or

loss of use pursuant to the damage SG S579C _ (vehicle no.) as & result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement resched above is in full and final settlement of any ¢laim of “the third party claimant”

pursuant to the sccident and that further this sentlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of

liability basis.

This agrecment is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over

any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this _,r_}_ {day) ul"_‘g_'e?_. {month) Z'D.IB_ (year)

% m:r,,%
vt 2\ S

—

Signed by A1G nppninmd_suncynr Chopped & Signed by “the workshop™
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AUTOMOTIVE
Customaer Code: 3000066
SMRT BUSES LTD

Block OUnit
STREET 62

SMRT Automative Services Pts Ltd

251 Morth Bridge Road Singapazs 173102
Tel: 85 63311000 Fax: €5 53340247

Tax Invoice
GST Reg Ne. : ME-B500001-7

CRN : 199004290%
Invoice No. : IViIT1200247
Dare s 12.12.2017

Vehicles Ho, s SGR5T9C
Your Ref Ho. : BUS/11/17/5039

Hake/Model : ENVIRD 500
Accident Dace : 2%.11.2017

H.B. Paymant by chegue should be crossed and

mads payshls to "SMAT Aukcentive Sssvices Tte Led*

Ho receipt will be Lssusd unless ceguested,

Page 1/1

& ANG MO0 KID Our Baf Ho. : 240%3344
SINGAFORE 503140 Terms + 30 Days
Description Oty Unit Add / (Discount) Ancunt
Cast & Ampunt
Parta
N/G5 CORRER DUMPFER CL# .00 8§ 947 8% (10.00 ) 8 .74 -] BoJd. b
LOWER FRONT DOME CL2 i.00 58325.8E {100.001 56325.88 ] 0,00
M/5 CORNER DEFLECTOR 1,00 5 329.13 (10.00 | 8 32.9 & 296. 22
 FRT W/S LIGHT BEZEL L2 g £ 29.03 tL00.00) g 290.03 3 g. 00
sup-—intal > 149,28

Labour
TO BREMOVE & LIHSTALL ALL ABDUVE [TEMS .00 2 795.40 0.00 8 0. 00 ] 195 _ 00
AMD» REPATR OTHERS DAMACED AFFECSTED
ADEAS .
Others
FROVIDE LABOUR AMD HayEil[al 0 3 52, B0 A 3 3 F 1
FIITTY AND RESPRAY AULOVE HEOLKTR
ITENS

AHAND PR 4 2. 472 98
Remack

/{U‘

Authorised S¥gnature
Eor SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E- &4 O.E



Enquire Transaction History
Transaction History Details

Log Date/Time: 28 Nov 2017/ 10:02:57

« a Transaction
Asset Type: Vehicle B
Asset 1D: SLF5372U
Transaction 18.32 Insurance Enquiry )
Type: (GIRO Payment) Snne:
Business
_ ESASBAHO - BALQISH
Ho: BINTEABDULHALIL |ransaction
Reference No.:
SearchDate/ ) Nov 2017 22:25:00
Time:
|
iy AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Company:
Information displayed is correct as at the log date and time.
Enquire Related Logs Back to List

$5.35

External Agency

20171128100257477451



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Eapress
'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING o
Cave | Nuotified Est Submitea | Ay Assignena | Ad) Apt Ad] Submirted ins Auth'ed Status
30 Mov 2017 29 Nov 2017 |ss2,472.28 $42,472.28 Pending for Survey
Main L | D000 Soa I I Report

Main Reference Clalm Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS = | [Created by adjuster]
'_ln.l.u.rud: LCRF Pte Ltd, Co. Reg, Mo.: 201624557, Tel +B5995599095

Fmani. | SMRY BUSESLYD, Co Reg No.: 1982022920

Vehicie Reg. . [25/11/2017 22:00- :59
M. SRR Pate of LOSS: {43 Months and 26 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Clam Type: | TP / 028073113556 ot TCEveT | 0999995083 (Comprehensive)

Wehicle Reg. |
| Palicy Mo. |
No. SLF53I72U (Clairmant): lmmz#mm

.| Excess: I B
| SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) 60 Woodiands Industnal Park B4, 757705 Woodlanas - Tel: GE562628

(AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: £5-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Tes, Ches-Wah] Cliee-Wah. Tee@aig.com

| MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 62222711

|ﬁ?:.vu?u?;rnmm Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 .. [Handied by Sebastian Yeang Wal Keen] . |Final Rpt due
o T

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case mail |

s AIG_SG (04/17/2017): Rat Conflicting DOA
+ AIG_SG (01/12/2017): Conflicting DOA

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Ail | Search Tasks | Creote Now Task | cComplets |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Campleted On Created On Done?
No results.

https:/sigapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 28/9/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SG5579C (0D2B07311355G)
[SLF5372U]
™
SMRT BUSES LTD
Nov 25 2017 10:00PM
[LCRF Pte Ltd]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Letters/Correspondences ' Loerpoge L] M
!Nn | Finalized On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
(1 [(Deafr) Third Party Express Settlement = Paymant Breakdown Edit
(Phossarioongns dperpege V| O |
o Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
I 1601/18 1742 | General View O | weows | B
12 16/01/18 17:42 | Genaral View D | toadws | A |
1 18/01/18 17:42 ‘ﬂ-nlﬂl'll‘II: o - 0 | adws | A |
4 1801718 17:42 | General View 0 | ssrs | &
5 1601181742 General View 0| wews &
& 1B01/1817:42  Genersl View - O | aaws | @B
7 1601181742 Genersl View © | weorc | A
41601181742 | Genersl View . © | wows | @ |
9 16/01/18 17:42 | General View O | s | & |
10 16/01/1817:42 | Genersl View 0O | were | 4
m 6/01/1817:42 | General View - — O | taaws | B
12 1601181742 | Genersl View 0 | wdrs | M
(33 18/01/18 17:42 General View E Load PG | B
14 16/01/1817:42 | Ganaral View - ©  wws | (A
15 |18/m1/18 17:42 | General View @ | aawc | BA
16 1601181742 General View Q  weaws | B
17 18/01/1817:47 | General View - O i | B
18 160118 17:42 | General View - O weirs | @A
19 [16/01/18 17:42 | General View B © | wars | B
20 |16/01/1817:42 | General View 0 | oscws _EE’I‘
21 [16/01/18 17:41 | General View 0O cedwc &
|;u l16/01/18 17:42 | General View _ D | eawc | B
fﬁwnml 17:42 | General View 0 | e s =
26 [16/01/18 17:42 | General View 0 | adic | &
Documentation - -1-1 _EE '-:l__ﬁ
o |Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) || Thumbnall| Print
1 30/11/17 16:32 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED 0 | Losaror
@ 3011417 18:312 | TP GIA REPORT = D | LowdFoF
Y (I —— ﬁmummmmuuummwmumm © | Losdror
4 18/01/1809.48  Emall to AIG to seek advise — s Load PDF
S 16/01/1B03:51 | Screen Shot from TP BUS Load POF |
6 il:ﬂ:ﬂha e Tl:-ﬂl:ﬁﬁh-;ﬁlﬂuhwmhmﬁhmmmﬂ-n% E g ,
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
["-“ehinie No: SLF5372U (Insd veh) Model, VOLVO BITL 9.4 D (A}
SG5579C (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: |25/11/2017
Global Sum Settiemeant | ] [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate 5 9,833.89
Final Repair Cost 5 3,500.00
Loss of Use g 3.00 days at $350.00 per day
Rental (if any) -1 days
LTA { GIA Search Fee .
Olhers 5
-
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) -1 3,500.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
la: 3
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessad Liability (") (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled anly for chain colfisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |SMRT Buses Lid . 1 3.500.00
2] -
3) '3
28 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)
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Adjuster Repont
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg ne 1sss07 1asr)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email surf@ikkauto. com,assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC2/LCR17022808/SWB302

Date: 28/092018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid.  Palicy No 0999995053
me mant Vehicle saes7ec Insured Vehicle No : SLF5372U
Date of Loss: 2512017 Nature af Claim: TP Claim No: 028073113556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SG5579C
Make & Modal: VOLVO BETL, B84 D (A) Engine No: Do195448
Reg Date 30/08/2016 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No YV3S4PO26GA1TA5TH
Colour: Green Odometer 62040 km
Engine Capacily: 9364 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: NiA
Sum Insured (5%) Market Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF T THE TI F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake {Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 27570 R22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 2T5MMOR22.5
Fronl Left Side: Firenza 8 mm Rear Lefi Side. Firenza 6 mm
Front Right Side: Firenza 6 mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 6 mm
The sbove values repgrasant [he remaining tyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 7.892.89 1,140.28 6,743.61 B5.44
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0,00
Labour 1,841.00 1,323.00 618.00 3184
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S§) 9,833.89 2,472.28 7,361.61 74.86
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S$350.00/day) (S§) 1.,050.00
+ Doc/Search Fea (55) 5.00
Nett Liability (S§) 3,527.28
Global Sum Settlement {S5) 3,500.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignmen; 20112017
Date Inspected. 29/11°2017 Inspecied Al SMRT Automolive Services Pte Lid

(Woodlands)

60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 28/9/2018
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Adjuster: Sebastian Yeang Wai Keen Manager: VIVIAN LAL PEI FENG

NOTE: This report represents our fimdwigs ar e fime ang piace of magection siated hensin. Such ingpoction has been carmied ouf 1o the best of our
knowigdge and abiity huf any other labiify under any olher eircumstancss i hereby sepressly sscluged
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qiy Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *N/S CORNER BUMPER CL2 Cracked 947 85F *947 B5FL
2 1 *N/S CORNER DEFLECTOR Cracked 326.13F *329.13FL
3 1 *LOWER FRONT DOME CL2 Repair 6,32583F *FL
4 1 *FRT N/5 LIGHT BEZEL CL2 Repair 280.03F FL
F=Franchise pan. L=ListiemDisc
Sub Total (58) 7.892.89 1,276.98
- List tem Discount on L ltems 0.00/10.00% (55) 0.00 127.70
Total Parts (SS) 7,892.89 1,149.28
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.
hitps://singapore. menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 28/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanoous items selected,
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amaount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & INSTALL ALL ABOVE ITEMS AND REPAIR MNaw 1,325 00 795.00

OTHERS DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS
2 PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY MNaw 616.00 528.00

REPAIR ITEMS

Gross Labour Cost (5§) 1,941,00 1,323.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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