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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 9:58 AM
To: clara.li@fwd.com; assignments; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; Admin A
Subject: RE: GBG7669P & SLD8249J ACCIDENT DATED ON 16.11.2017 ALONG RAFFLES PLACE 

TWD COLLYER QUAY    Our Ref: 1201700007844

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange. 

 
Best Regards, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: clara.li@fwd.com [mailto:clara.li@fwd.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 30 November, 2017 9:41 AM 

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-d@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; 

AsherSng@lkkauto.com 

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com 

Subject: RE: GBG7669P & SLD8249J ACCIDENT DATED ON 16.11.2017 ALONG RAFFLES PLACE TWD COLLYER QUAY Our 

Ref: 1201700007844 

 

Hi LKK team, 

 

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement. 

 

Attached is OI GIA report. 

 

Please explore direct settlement with TP repairer and create the case in Merimen. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Kind Regards 

Clara Li 

Senior Executive, Claims 

  

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. 

6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986 

 

T    (65) 6727 5722 

E    clara.li@fwd.com 

W   fwd.com.sg 
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From: Karen Tan [mailto:karentan@thinkone.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 29 November, 2017 2:06 PM 

To: SG Corporate Contact 

Subject: RE: GBG7669P & SLD8249J ACCIDENT DATED ON 16.11.2017 ALONG RAFFLES PLACE TWD COLLYER QUAY 

Importance: High 

 

 

Dear Sir/ Mdm, 

 

Able to assist to arrange a surveyor to survey for GBG7669P for the above mentioned. 

 

 

 

YYoouurrss  SSiinncceerreellyy,, 

  

KKaarreenn  TTaann  

Claim Advisor 
Think One Autocare Pte Ltd  
No.18 Defu Avenue 2 
Singapore 539522 

HP : 9128 8488 
DID : 6844 3300 FAX : 6842 4988 
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