Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: winson ong <winsonls@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 January 2018 3:34 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Richard Toh Chin Huat

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR TP GIA REPORT - FBL 6163L *** LKK REF: CC6/11117022764/Gka3
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Zaini,

Our customer agreed on the amount.
Can forward us the DV for our customer to sign.
Thanks

Winson Ong

97684247

LI SHENG Automobile Trading
Blk K Pandan Loop #01-18
Singapore 128219

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

To: winson ong <winsonls@yahoo.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Richard Toh Chin Huat <lishengauto@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 January 2018, 12:15

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR TP GIA REPORT - FBL 6163L *** LKK REF: CC6/11117022764/Gka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: LSA237TJS
Our Ref: CC#6/11117022764/Gka3

Dear Winson,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 3255X & FBL 6163L ON 22/11/2017
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $2,100.00
2. Loss of Use(5days x $30.00) $ 150.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 5.35

TOTAL §2,255.35

Please confirm acceptance.



Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: winson ong [mailto:winsonls @ yahoo.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December 2017 9:11 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Richard Toh Chin Huat

<lishengauto @yahoo.com.sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR TP GIA REPORT - FBL 6163L *** LKK REF: CC6/11117022764/Gka3

Hi Zaini,

The above attachment is our Tax Invoice, LOD, LOA and LTA Search.

Breakdown:
Amount($)
1) Repair cost $2,100.00
2) Loss of use $400.00
(5 days $80 x 5)
3) Miscellaneous (LTA search fee) $5.35
Total $2,505.35

Please check and revert.
Thanks

Winson Ong

97684247

LI SHENG Automobile Trading
Blk K Pandan Loop #01-18
Singapore 128219



