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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrtal Park, Singapore 408533

TEL 5256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315
Reg. No: 199607 188R GST Reg. No. 18-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaoblle

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

5 MAXWELL ROAD
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110

Ref CC4/EQI1T022627/T1eal

Date: 28-11-2017

[ AAREA

Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 88385 Veh. Inspected SHD 2694T
Palicy No. Coverage (8) 0.00
Claim No. DM17HOD2678/JT Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 281172017
Z Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RI/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damag 15
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/11/2017 Inspection Date 281172017
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTELTD
& BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 829927
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

8)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




ZB8-11-17.11 48

e ce nolily
PRIME GROUP Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2‘}45
_'-1||‘ g
LT NS
Date: 28.11.2017 lematon
.= b4 P'I!!'M il oy 1
Elfe -1 |
EQ Insurance Company Ltd b resurveyed g

5 Maxwell Road #17-00
Tower Block MND Complex
Singapare 062110

From: To: 62655084

GST Reg. No : 201606560M
5 Benai Place Singapore-529526

‘ ¥ rom insurancs Company

[ o

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2694T HYUNDAI AVANTE (2010)

To Supply
1] 1pc Rearbumper A1 2 |
2] 1pc Rear bumperclip (M
3) 1pc Rear bootlid "Hyundai" emblem e
4) 1pc Lefttaillamp X &
Sub total pI'ls
Less: 20% discouynt
L/charzes
1) Towing charges
2 ) Torepair rear boot lid, rear end panel. Remove & replace rear |

3)

bumper & the above parts

To putty, respray painting rear boot lid outer, rear end panel &
rear bumper

Sub rotal L/charges
Estimated total

gl v/

|M U -'}'”’3"}“{"

=W’ ”LJ 13 @ (5%
ftﬂw'\a)"'dk’" *f‘f

LUV Clhl{fu*\:,"l A=

"

5 447 .00

g 30.00

$ 35.00

3 290.00
8 802.00

5 160.40

5 541.60

S 35.&0?-

S 450.00 e
5 £50.00 ?
5 1,135.00

s 1,776.60

— =




B 74 74

o S Considtants
A Wa = Pia Lt Company Reglstration No. 10060T158R

ST AVE 1L #0225 PAYA UBHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SN LMIRE 408930 TEL : (651 BIS6I5H) FAN @ (TS H2ShAA ]S

Your ref: TBA
Our ref: CC4/EQINT022627/T1ea3 Date: 04.12.2017

The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD 2694T
We refer to the above maltter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 28.11.2017

at the premises of M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd (Benoi Place) and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 1,776.60
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1.109.60
“Check” Items Amount : 8% 3500
Market Value : S8 -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% -
Nett Value : §8 -

Description of Damage: -
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

e —— e e et

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc
Subject:

Categories: LO

WITHOUT | TEJUDICE
Hi Alice,
We refer to your email dated U5/

Please be informed that our Princ
conditions

Therefore, we will close the matter ot

Kindly redirect your client's claim ¢
Thank You

pest Regaros

Asher Sng | Case Hondler

LKK Auvle Consultonts Ple Lid
phone: 684 1-4051 | amoll: ot esnn 2k
Bik 51, Payo 1 Inchiibdcd |

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 January 2018 10:27
To: 'Alice Leong' <alicelecnpl
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 25 11
Without Prejudice

Hi Alice,

We acknowledge your email below
However we are still pen np instr

We shall revert to you u

Thank You.

er Snn (LKKAUta)
sday, 27 February 2018 4:43 PM
e Leong’

- [LEKAuUtD)

ACCIOENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2694T & YP8B38S

11H

nad repudiated the elaim due to our insured breach of policy terms and

our end.

he cwnerof YP 88385,

roorn | ke &741-4108
15 | Sf‘ﬂﬂ? "l'l

ms.com=
LVING VEHICLES SHD2694T & YPEB38S

i irom our principal due to policy issue.

tion from our principal.



Best Regarc

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LXK Aulo Consullants Ple Lid
phone; 8416051 | emol; gitorng
Bk 51, Poya Ll industricd Poee . Ll

From: Alice Leong [ma !

Sent: Friday, 5 January 2/

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT 07 2511
Importance: High

Dear Asher,

Your below e-muail refi-

Fl’case tcl ns hu‘.’c ﬂ“! wloteie jal s

Thank vo:

Mays the sririt of the Christmas |

e | fone 6741-4108
Ul 28 | S[408933)

-autoclaims.com]

com>

LVING VEHICLES SHD2694T & YP8838S

«ipnl decision by 12,01.2018

(our hovme wih peace, Jpg and Love.

I wish Hou atl Merrgs Christwmas a. .1 Har nif New Year.

Ms: Alice Leor
Prime Avio Claiins .

Office: No. 5 Benoi Plooe Sin
Workshe: Na.b !

Tel: 6861 N8 F.

HP: 878! 00§

Disclaimer

This e=muoil (meluding all muschimeni ) ooy

1o whom i ic sddressed. 17 you aee ot pn |

copy or use it or oy purnose. o ailier

From: Asher Sng (LKEAGT T
Sent: 22 Derember, 771

To: Alice Leong <alic:
Subject: ' ACCIDENT ©
Without Prejudice

Hi Alice,

We acknowledge your oo 11
However we are still no

We shall o ot toyo o

0926
£29927

el entiad mformation which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s}
Urew pient, please reply to us immedintely and delete this message from your systeme Y ou may not

C it4 contents W any person.

' Alkkauto.com]

5.C0mM>
CLVING VEHICLES SHD2694T & YPBB38S

1 our principal due to policy issue.

tinn from our principal.

2



Thank You

Bast Regor:

Asher Sng | Cowe Handlar

LKK Auto Consuflants Pre Lid

phone: 4841 4051 | emal: gotieos | fouc &741-4108

Blic 51. Paycs L Inclustricl e 25 | 5|408933)

From: Alice Leong [malite 0 itoclal

Sent: Fric1y, 22 Decemb 1

To: Asher ong [LKKAuUio| ' rom>

Subject: ACCIDENTON 2" | LV/71G VEHICLES SHD2694T & YP8B38S
Importanco: High

Hi Asher,

See enclosed our LOD « h - euments for vour retention. Original documents mailing out to your
office.

For swift X nimiea! " ¢ |1 us have your offer.

May the =it of the Chr ) wne wik peace, joy and love.

f wish Yo 5.'.’1“:.‘.??3 Christinas pEis MNew Year.

Hj:l ﬂg{ sy ém ?1'?‘7’

Prime ! lain

(¥ fice: No. § Benoi | 1926

Warksh: > Nab I L0927

Tel: 6! )

HP: 87 5

Disclaimar

This e<muil | including ol mitsel ol i bl Information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified reciplentis)
to wham it {x aldressed. 11 you wee tisk = celplenl, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not
copy. or use 11 lorany purnose, o mh ¢ 175 CONIENIS 10 any Person.



Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 November, 2017 11:34 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP3838S

Attachments: img-171127175325.pdf

Importance: High

Hi Cath, 1%
yon @ P

Please assist. o L

A
Thank you,
Best Regords, "'{w&i[\‘

Mei Kwan | Admin
LKEK Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | emall: MeiKwan@ |kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #oz-25 | ${4089133)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:bazlin.ahmad @eginsurance.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 2B November, 2017 11:05 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TQ ACCIDENT ON 25,11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YPB838S
Importance: High

Dear LKK

Please refer below email and attachments.
Kindly proceed.

Our insured has yet lodge GIA report.
Thank You.
Regards,

Bazlin Ahmad

arm

ed'lnsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did 65 5496 5851 | tel & Fam B4
iHT i

W 1 Mot of Cptate you've got o friend

Prrvilvged/Confidentiol information moy Be contiised in tha mevege [ you are bt the intended reciolent, plegse notlly the aender immeshotely ond delrte ol



From: Pel Yee [mailto: peiyee@iprimeautociaims.com]

Sent: Monday, November 27, 2017 4:15 PM

To: Elaine Cheong

Cc: aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com

Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YPBB38S
Importance: High

Hi

The above referred.

Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1145-1245pm lunch hour.

We select: LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Lid.

Thank you.

Thank you & Best regards,

Ped Yee
Prime Auto Clalms Service Pte. Ltd.

Office : 5 Benol Place Singapore 629926

Workshop : 6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908

Fax: 6515 2948

Disclaimer: This mall (including all attachments) contains confidential Information which may be privileged. [t Is intended
solely for the identified reciplent(s) to whom it Is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us

immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

Virus-free. www avast com




Shirle! Hiew !LKK Autol

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 4 December, 2017 3:23 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Ce Asher 5ng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: DM17HO02676/)T- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING
SHD2694T & YP8B385

Attachments: OLPDF

[ear Shirley / Asher

Attach Ol report. However, OID seems to be holding a Class 3C licence only. .
Please confirm that he has the valid driving licence before settlement.

I:f!egards,

Ianet Tan

eé.lnsuronce

0 Insurance Company Limited

=

iyl IF_'II R R f:]l. I /
L Ipes—r— @___&‘—ﬁ youvegotao | '

Erom: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]

Sent; Monday, December 4, 2017 1:37 PM

Ta: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com:; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

cubject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YPBB38S

Your ref: TBA
LKKref: CC4/EQI17022627 /T1ea3

WITHOUT PREJUDIC™

Dear Sir / Madam,

:Nt.- refer to the above matter.

This is a third party direct settlement case.

;:nclused revert of vehicle: SHD 2694T

pate of survey: 28/11/2017



finclosed for your perusal is:

- TP's Gli. report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

We have not authorized repairs.

Meanwhile, Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident
report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

o check availabili ty of the case handler , you may contact the urdersigned.

Thank pou.

Heyt Regards,

Shirley Hiew | &dmin

%K Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mhane: 6366-0055 | ermall: Shirleybsw i dauto. coer | fax: G741-2108
‘.lllk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

from: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 November, 2017 1:24 PM

To: barlin ahmad@eqinsurance.Com.sg H

Cc: Admin A <admin-a lkkauto com>; assignments <assignments@ikkaulo.com>
Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP88385

Dear Bazlin Ahmad,

Thank you for the assignment.

Fest Hegards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

VKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

i‘::umr: 741-8434 | emall: assignmentsé@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
j:.]ll. 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | SiaoBg9a3)

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:baziin ahmad@eginsurance.com.sd)

Sant: Tuesday, 28 November, 2017 11:05 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|kkaulo.com>

Cc: Janet Tan <janebtan(@eqginsurance Com.sg>

subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP88385

importance: High

pear LKK

Llease refer below email and attachments.
Kindly proceed.

Our Insured has yet lodge GIA report.

Thank You.

=k



fegards,

“azlin Ahmad

ecjnsuronce

=0 Insurance Company Limited

] f elah e 433 omd fax

S

M Alersbes o Cibyitaie - ' you've gol a friend

+ peldgrety Danfiderbin! mformabion may S contased in Phis meings i you ate not the mlended fecigaent, pieetd ROGTY TN e el sy and oelete ot |

:rom: Pel Yee [mallto:pelyeciiprimeautociaims.com]

5Sant: Monday, November 27, 2017 4:15FM

Ta: Elaine Cheang

o adliceleongiprimeautociaims.com

“ubject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHI12694T & YPB838S
‘mportance: High

Hi
The above referred.
Our client's GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
i"]me inform surveyor to avoid 1145-1245pm lunch hour.
i;;{c select: LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd.
b

Yhank you.

Thank you & Best regards,

Jed Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.

Office : 5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926
Workshop : 6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Fel: 6861 0908

Fax; 6515 2948

Nisclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. Itis intended
salely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended reciplent, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
1L3 contents to any person.

.+-E Virus-free. www avast.com






Asher Sng (LKKAuto) —_— e

From: lanet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: “riday, 9 February 2018 2:29 PM

To: Aisher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc Vie (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: HE- [URGENT] RE: DM17HOD2676/JT- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017

INVOLVING SHD2694T & YPBE38S

Dear Asher,

Please inform third party we shall repudiate liability since involved driver did not have valid driving licence at point of
accident.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eﬁnsr Q' ce

L T G-G"- Frcndl

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 941 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eginsurante.com.sg

5

.&nmﬂﬂwuw ﬂ———-

Privileged/Conf - ntin! " rmati + may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify th

From: Asher Sng [! KKAut~) [mailte AsherSng@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, February 9, 2018 9:1

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan™ oginsu £OMm.SE>

Cc: Vic (LKKAutn) «vicalr - h@lkkau o.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [URGENT] Ri: DM17HO02676/)T- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T &

YP8838S

Hi lanet,

We refer to the email below.

The last conversation wit' the bo | = mention that the driver fail his TP test twice and the driver was not supposed to
drive the vehicle at the t e of t! ilent.

Kindly advise.



Thank You.

Besl Regards.

Asher Sng | Case Hondler

LKK Avio Consultants Pte Lid

pinone: 6841-6051 | amal: orhesng@kinviocom | fox 7414108
Bk 51, Payo Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Averic |, #02-25 | §{408933)

From: Janet Tan [ ailtn: netts rance.com.sgl
Sent: Friday, 9 February . 018 B4 |
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AcherS: kkauto.com>

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpech@lkkar o.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [URGENT] RE: DM17HO02676/JT- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T &
YP88385

Dear Asher,

Please make a last follow up with /10 hinss and for OID to see if he has obtained the valid licence by now.
Request for a cor and  ~ceed * settlement,

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

ec':inil.' "ONCE

EQ Insurance Cormpany | mited

5 Maxwell Road H17-00 Tower 'nck MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 94 " 1 oxt 032 | fax 656223 4190

wWww.eqinsurance.com.sg c
W A Member of Cityrtate e

Privileged/Confi' ‘ntinl in*semea* 1 may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Asher Snp "' “¥A i rSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, Fo wruary 71,2010~ 7 '™

To:JanetTan<j n * a0 “glite 'm.se>

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto! < oalp h@lkkar o.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [URGLT] E: DM17HOD2676/JT- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T &

YPBB385
importance: High

Hi Janet,



We refer to the crmail datad on 07 '17/2017.
Third party repairer is chosing fne 2t tlement.
Please kindly let = have vaur i ion is any,

Thank You.

Bedl Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Henrilor

LEK Aulo Consultani: 'le Lid

phone: 6841-6081 | smail orhapnn™® otgoom | o 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Indurbikal P Ui Av |, #02-25 | §[408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKAt

Sent: Monday, 29 January 20181 12 PM

Yo: 'Janet Tan' <[> cLtar Deging: 1 ce.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkar o .com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [URGENT] RE: DM17H002676/JT- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T &
YPERR38S

Hi Janet,

We referto the ernil dossdon & 172017,
Third party repair »isch inp fae lement,
Please kindly let u= have vourins: crion is any.

Thank You.

Rest Regords,

Ather Sng | Cose Hrmelsy

LEK Aute Consullan!

phone: 841-5051 | Tl =S wituonm | fox; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ut incti e | Ui A |, 4(2-25 | 5[408933)

From: Asher Sng (1 XKAu! )

Sent: Wednesday, 10 January 207 7:14 PM

To:Janet Tan' < ~Ltan@agin:  ance.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) < calp h@lkk 5 com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto. >

Subject: RE: [URCTHTI RT: DV 02676/JT- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD26094T &

YP8838s

Hi Janet,

We refer to the er- il da' =1 on {2/2017.



Third party repairrr is choring fo-

Please kindly let v Mave - ourine

Thank You.

Besl Regords.

Ather Sng | Case Hondl
LKK Auto Consultant:
phone: 6B41-6051 [ ronnifl; ot ersnn
Bk 51, Paya Ubl ingd il Pow LA A

ef

From: Asher Sng (| “KAut )

Sent: Tuesday, 2 Jonuary (018 1/

To:Janet Tan <jar ' tan ogin:
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) < 2l @l
Subject: [URGENT! HE; D 117HD
Hi Janet,

We refer to the ro 2l ¢f=* 1 or

Third party repair s ch - ing fo

Please kindly let v "wve  wurir

Thank You.

Best Regands,

Aghet Sng | Caie Ho- ey

LKK Auto Consulian! e Lid

phone: 4841-6051 |+ o onng

bk 51, Poya Ubl fndue ol Por - Uikl A

From: Asher Sng || "KAut |
Sent: Wednesday, ['cc  1ber,
To: 'Jlanet Tan' < ttar eqgl

ottlemont,

iction is any,

avtncom | lax; 4741-4108
e L, i 25 | 5{408933)

A AM

'il'[-‘_fifl!ﬂ_sg)

r.com>; Admin A <a/min-a@lkkauto.com>
176/JT- PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP8838S

A7y,

ttiement.

iction is any.

oo | lox 4741-4108
o 1, #02-25 | ${A0B9II)

Ce Vie (LKKAuto) < sicalpr hilk!

Subject: RE: DM17HO02676/JT-

Hi Janet,

We refer ta the e il ho' o,
Conversation with "~ - - gft
the midst of waiti "+ - nee

Insured driver is |+ 'ding  valid!
allow to drive mo' reary b

75:03 Pm
ICe.Com. SE>
n.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

| REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP88385

apiry Mr Nah, he confirmed the accident and the driver Mr WANG FAGUOQ is in
t “dnte ng the driver had fail twice.

spore driving licence CLASS 3C, however according to our research CLASS 3C only
i el ht=< 2000k built to carry=< 7 passengers (exclude driver).

4



According to Traffic Police websi®

Please kindly let ur have your in:

Thank You.

Bett Regards,

Asher Sng | Cate Hondlio
LKK Auto Consultants #e Lid
phong: B4 16051 | renetls et

Bk 51. Poya Ui oo 15

W T

From: Janet Tan | allto:] get.t
Sent: Monday, 4 Docembor, 201
To: Shirley Hiew [L¥K Aut ) <5h
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) = sher

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: DM17117° 720 76/'T- PRI

Dear Shirley / Asbrr

Attach Ol report. Howevi (. OID ¢

Please confirm th * he b the s

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senbar Execully

eqns:'

EQ Insurance Com
5 Maxwaell Road #17
did 65 6496 9033 | e
B VR LTAr E

y 1Tl

Wy A Member of Cityatacs

Frivilinged/Confldeniio o iy b ¢

el

Fram: Shirloy 1o LV

Sent: Monday, Decembe
To: Janet Tan <

Cc: Asher Sng (L¥) o)

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO AC

1,20

Your refl: THA

srr ey

'ENDIES) insiieed driver Provisional Driving Licence expired on 10/10/2017.

uction if any.

|l ATAL.AT08

25 | S{eimov3)

b Waraill

123 PM
Hiew 'lkkauto.com>
lkko to.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

WEST TD ACCIDENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP83385

ms to e holding a Class 3C licence only.

Uebrivie ¢ licence before settlement,

9110

TRl

tax T

a0
ajra

you've got o friend

weieed et | is message, If you are not the intended reciplent, please notify the sender immediotely and delete oll copies of it

€11 oyHiow Dkkauto,com]

37 PN
2.60 NS>
ek~ 1.com>; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

ENT ON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP8838S



LKK ref: CCA/FN11707 627/
WITHOUT PRE]DICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the ahove prttier,
This is a third party dire
Enclosed revert of vehic 51D
Date of survey: 2%9/11/% 17

Enclosed for vour perus-! is:

- TMs GIA et

- Estimate Lolr
- Proliminn < ool
We have not authorized o irs
Meanwhile, Kini'» advi et
report for nur ne =oar clion
Kindly take note that th se he
To check availa' ity ~it
Thank you.
Aest Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Admin
LMK Auto Cromsult -t a1
Phone: B30
Blk 51, Payn Lihl Industelal Bart 40 Ay
From: Admin-N (1 ¥V Ayt
Sent: Tuesday, 20 Move

-

To: hazlin ahmad _
Ce: Admin A <adi lh-a "
Subject: 17 PRI AU \C
Dear Baz!'' Al oa

Thank you far the assigns

Best Regards,
C-l!ﬂl{!rlm- l.llll'|l'|1_= P
LEKEK Auto Consull wnte |

Phome: 674 1- L340 | ol il
Blk 51, P 11ad "ol vt ol

Ceottle

Y

it case,

04T

mair

imsured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident

«Iler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

and o, you may contact the undersigned.

witpeom | fax: 6741-4108
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

1:24 PM

L o

.-,..3-.. ipnments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
NT 0N 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP8838S

Faighin ooy | fax: Aag6-4315
nz-25 | S(408933)



From: Bas' 1 0 [ i oqins ance.com.se)
Sent: Tuesday, 28 Nove 20 7 11:05 AM

To: Admin ' < ito.
Cc:lanet Ton< i s LE.C0SE>

Subject: (' PULRE DUES D AC . DENTON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP8838S
Impartance: High

Dear LKV

Please roar holow g and stta-hments.
Kindly r

Qurins d Ve ge reiort.
Thank You
Regards,

Bazlin Ahmad

Exechitivi
[ g

EQ Insur. Ca

Vel (Y18 Tt 655110
did &5 &4 1| b 56223 ai BO1 | fax 65 G223 4310
W W DL n 1
WA A e 1 Cityatate you've got o friend
Privileged i i P e B A messige. (f you gre not the intended reciplent, please notify the sender mmediately and delete all copies of 1
From: P! ‘oo ! g &y ' clims.cem]
Sent: Mro oy, mb 20°7 415 "M
To: Elair
Ce: alic: | ms.
Subject: 11 o1 \CC1 NTON 25.11.2017 INVOLVING SHD2694T & YP8838S
Import.
Hi

The above retirmed,

Our elic ot loeo e vour retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please "\ av 1 1145-1245pm lunch hour.
Weselo Y sult.: s e Lad,

Thank yuir.



Thank your & Nest regards,

Pe;,, Yeco

Prime Aut o Cloims Sy o e, 1,
Office:5 i MareShr ore 29926
Worksho; 61 100 Ply ngo; e 629927
Tel: 6861 00

Fax: 6515 294

Disclaimer: This mail (incluiling all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recinient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediat an ' 00lete th message from vour system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its
contents Lo iy prriin,




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i B = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408933
-”’_—! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 108607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ral CC4/EQI17022627/T1ea3n2
o ToNER B L
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Dale: 02-03-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110
Code : EQI
1: Paolicy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP BB38S Veh. Inspected SHD 2684T
Palicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM17HOO267E/T Excess ($) 0,00
Assign From JANET Assign Date 281112017
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Modal HYUNDAI AVANTE c.c 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 20m
Chassis No. KMHDU41BMALID21742 Colour ORANGE
Odometer 591830 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |18585R15 WEST LAKE &8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 WEST LAKE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |18565R15 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |18585R15 WEST LAKE 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/11/2017 |inspection Date 28/11/2017
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
6 BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 6289827
ba. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




174’4

Ssn mnm =

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 2694T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industnal Park. Singapore 408633
TEL' 5256 3581 FAX G258 4315
Reg. No: 18860T188R GS5T Reg No. 15-B&07T188-R

Page Mo.:7 of 1

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Con E(;l :
ity i dition | workshop (5)| ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 447 00 447 00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR BOOT LID 'HYUNDAI' EMBLEM NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|LEFT TAIL LAMP NOT NECESSARY 290.00 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -180.40 -102.40
641.80 408.80
LABOUR
TOWING CHARGES NOT NECESSARY 35.00 -
TO REPAIR REAR BOOT LID REAR END PANEL REMOVE 450,00 300.00
& REPLACE REAR BUMPER & THE ABOVE PARTS
TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING REAR BOOT LID 650.00 400.00
OUTER REAR END PANEL & REAR BUMPER
1.135.00 T00.00
GRAND TOTAL 1.776.60 1,109.60
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI17022627/T1eadq2

M.

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI,L AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

ERCLAIMER OF LLABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:. This Report is made selely for the use shd banefil of the Client named on the fromst pege of ihis Report.

Ne lapity of resgonsibilily wiAISCEVEL. i GOALESE GF 101, I8 BECEA10E 10 ANy SNifD PAIT)
Bepurt, in whole o in part. does ao &l 188 G her owm k.

|
|
'}
|

HO LEONG CHUAN
Automolive Assessor




