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. M m Pl Company Registration No. 199607 188R

(

&1 LRI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (065 2563501 FAN @ (065) h2364315

Yourref: To Be Advised Date: 31.12.2015

Our ref: CC3/CT115022417/H1hg3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD
Dear Smyth,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD3456H

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 30.12.2015
at the premises of M/s gﬂuwp_ﬁumwﬂ_l&!ﬂ&md have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 5.520.20

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2.936.36

"Check" Items Amount : S5 227.76

Market Value : 8% s

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -

Nett Value ; 8% -

Description of Damage: d 1 \ mot
The vehicle sustained damages at the X o

O/S Front portion s
Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days
Yours faithfully,

HENRY NG
Licensed Appraiser



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE ~0 : SHD 34561

MAKE
MODEL

: HYUNDAI SONATA

IM.TI: 122005 10:15

Iy

Parts Deseription/ Labour
Front Bumper Cover ¢
Front Bumper Sponge <. «
Front Bumper Reinforcement . o+
Front Bumper Bracket Top (RH) -
Front Bumper Protector (RH)
Front Bumper Bracket (RH)
Front Bumper Side Bracket
Headlamp Support Panel Assy -
Headlamp (R11)
Front Fender (RH) [ , 4~/
Front Fender Shield (RH) ./
Front Fender Retainer | |
Front Wheel Rim (RH) =/
Front Wheel Hub Cap (RH) . 4

Worrmr— mie o —
SUB TOTAL
LESS 20%
DISCOUNTED TOTAL
| T i =t

Front Tyre (RH) -,
Front Fender Adventisement Logo (RH) /LY

Labour Charge

Spray Painting Charge

Wiring Charge A
Tuff Kote

Remove Relix Aircon & Refill Gas

TOTAL LABOUR

ESTIMATE TOTAL

Panel Beating sl [ e WEWE |

b\%’[‘ﬂw\w L[S)

LUnit Prlu

A

LW

- ,:)L-f'
LAY

Amnum
53880
136,30

29.20
20.10

[023.00

9.20
284.70
145.00

4,204.00
B40.80

HM“,HMH%MMMHMWMHMHMM

3,363.20

§  207.00
5 100.00

§ 30700

S 1.200.00
S 40000
§ 5000
5 50.00
8 150,00

§ L850.00

$ 5,520.20

Lk~ ff{wm

504.10 -
2240 ¢

14.30 ¢+
797.90 |-

583.00 |
86.00 -

A

Nett ~
Nett -

This is an imaual estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
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Our Job Ref No 304849879
Date 02i01/16
FINALIZATION FORM

Ta LKK

Atn - HENRY NG

Vehicle Rug No SHD3456H

C{JMFDR'IDLLLHE,
ENGINEERING

Far: 6546 8155
Fax
Date of Acciden| 20-Dec-15

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentoned vehicle ars as Tollpws: -

T The repair job shall Bill o

CHINA TAIPING —_ GEBEB23885

2 The finalized amount shall ba:
i8]  Spare Paris afler List discoun

{bl  Labour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cos|

) Lumpsum Repair (f applicable)

Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less
Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3 Estmated normal period for repairs:

4

20% ~ $2,550.00

$2,550.00

working days

4. We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there i no raply from you

within T working days

5 Thank vou for your assislance

We confirm the estimates and

finalized amaun
Signalure e Signature F ﬁ;tk
Mame LimTSs - Name HEMNRY
Tel 62148398 Date 511/ 6
Fax 65468156
For Official Use Only
Document
Item Amount Aftached %”mmgf Remmarks
Yes or Mo
1._Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paig
3 Suf’\a‘ﬂj" Fees e —,
. LTA Seall:h Firg
5. Medical Fees |on behall
of driver, il apphcabile)
6 Overrun

Remarks:
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 4:46 PM
To: Admin A
Subject: <REOPEN CASE> FW: <URGENT> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving

GBBZ3685 (SNM15D04889C02/8) and SHD3456H (TP : LKK REF -
CCS;’CHISUEMI?;’HIHQEJ on 29.12.2015

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: AGNES
Dear All,

Please assist to reopen case,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industria] Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

RBAER T the Earth: Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 4:34 PM

To: loel Goh

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Admin A: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <URGENT> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB2368S (SNM15D04889C02/8) and SHD3456H
(TP : LKK REF - CEE{'CTI]SDEEdl?;’thgB} on 29.12.2015

Dear Joel,
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will proceed as instructed.

Thank you.



We refer further to our below email.

Please be informed that TP chased for an update/settlement.
Kindly advise further instructions.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: ummmmm | fax: 6741-9108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Uhj Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S(408933)

FICE &
TONCAT N g R Earth- Frint only when Aecessary.

This &-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Usa or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof. and inform the

From: Vic (LkkAuto)

Sent: Friday, 17 March, 2017 5:41 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: 'Alfred Toh'; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB23685 fSNMlSDﬂdEBEiCGHE} and SHD3456H (TP : LKK REF -
CEB!ETI1502241?IH1hg3} on 29.12.2015

Dear Alfred,

We refer to your below email,

Please be informed that we had rejected the TP claim as instructed.

However, TP had informed us that our Insured’s claim was settled at around 50%. Please see enclosed email for your
reference.

TP repairer requested to reconsider the matter for an amicable settlement.
For your further instructions, please.

Thank you.



From: Vic [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikka uto.com)

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 10:23 AM

To: Alfred Toh; Jason Tea; Hwang Shiang Yi; Smyth Woo

Ce: Admin A: Vic; Claims Dept of cTI

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB2368s fSNMlSDMBSBCDZI&} and SHD3456H (TP : LKK REF -
CCE..-"CTllSDEZdI?z’HIth} on 29.12.2015

CT1 REF - SNM15D04889C02/8/LKKDS
LKK REF - CC3/CTI15022417/H1 hg3

e =Sz =c-z=== S===ss==c

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBB 23685 AND SHD 3456H ON 29/12/2015
We refer to the above reference,

Our insured reported that the accident was due to the entire negligence of the third-party taxi driver who wanted to make an
illegal U-turn whilst he was travelling straight.

The third-party taxi driver clearly stated in his report and to quote “I signal my intention to filter right and | started to move to
the right”.

Since both parties mentioned that third-party had passenger(s) on board, we requested for their witness details and statement
and any other related evidence however, third-party had naone.

Basing on the circumstances of the accident reported, where third-party clearly stated in his report of intending to filter and
started moving, we are of the view that third-party claimant had changed/encroached into our insured’s lane and as such, we
are of the view that third-party claimant is more to be blamed for the accident.

In view of this, we sesk Your approval to deny claim,
Kindly let us have your view, opinion and or instruction for this claim please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

E R o
TIUOER e Cove the Earths Frine only when necessary-

This email may contain confidential and/ar privileged information. i you are nat the intended recipient [or have received this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unautherized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Hwang Shiang Yi [maiitu:shiangvi,hwanE@SR.cntafpina.c:}m]
Sent: Thursday, 31 December, 2015 3:29 PM

To: Agnes Lim (LKK Auto) <AgnesLim@Ikkauto.com>: Smyth Woo <smyth.woo@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: KKLau -:kk!au@lkkaum.comh; Jas Khine (LKK Auto) <iaskhine{:‘ﬂlkkautu.mm>; Vic <vfcalneh@!kkautu.cnm>;
Admin A <admin-a @lkkauto.com>; Smyth Woo <smyth.woo@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB23685 (O1: CAI-TBA) and SHD3456H (TP : LKK REF -
CE3;"CTF15G2241?;’H11133} on 29.12.2015




Best Regards,
Agnes Lim| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: .ﬂgngsl_lmfﬁglkkautg.gur_\] | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hnn:ffmaw.sx-'mantecclﬂud.mm

—-—-_.________——-_._________ ——— -

Thie et ——————— . . .
T'his email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:ffww,svmanteccqud.cmn

e ERS

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Emai Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hiln:e’fwuw.svmanteccinud.cnm
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LKK Auto Cons ultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607 198R G5T Reg. No 19-9607198-R

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
Ref : CCSICTITSDEEM?!ngSqE
e mosaoe N
Code: cTI

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. GEB 23885 Veh. Inspected SHD 3456H
Policy No. DMCVSN8013911507 Coverage ($) 0.00
i Claim No. 20150000948/C02/8/LKKDS Excess ($) 0.00
]Aﬁsign From Assign Date 301212015
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI SONATA, (A) c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
- Chassis No. KMHET41VR9ABE3372 Colour BLUE
Odometer 374918 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOooD
B Conditions of Tyres _
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [215/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R1g WEST LAKE 7 mm
RIH Rear Tyre |215/80 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
|THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/12/2015 |m5pecﬁgn Date 3011212015
Sur\rey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508989
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: B258 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

dledd B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Fark, Singapore 408933

Reg. Mo: 1886071088 GST Reg. No, 18-9807198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE No. SHD 3456H
Estimate By | Our
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {,3;} ‘{g}w
BEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 504.10 504.10
T[FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (RH) CRACKED 22.40 22.40
1\FRONT BUMPER PROTECTOR (RH) CRACKED 28.20 29.20
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (RH) CRACKED 20.10 20.10
T[FRONT BUMPER sSIDE BRACKET CRACKED 14.30 14.30
1(HEADLAMP SUPPORT PAMNEL ASSY SERVICEABLE 1,023.00 -
1|HEADLAMP (RH) CRACKED ¥97.90 797.90
1|FRONT FENDER (RH) DENTED 583.00 593.00
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD (AH) TORN B6.00 86.00
1|FRONT FENDER RETAINER NECESSARY 9.20 8.20
1|FRONT WHEEL RiM (RH) SERVICEABLE 284.70 -
TI[FRONT WHEEL HUE Cap (RH) cuTt 145.00 145.00
1|WIPER WASHER SPRAY MOTOR (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 63.00 63.00
1|RADIATOR GRILLE (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 28210 282,10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -774.80 -513.26
3,099.20 2,053.04
1/FRONT BUMPER COVER (50%) (SN) CRACKED 538.80 269.40
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -107.76 -
431.04 269.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT TYRE (RH) (SN) SERVICEABLE 207.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH) (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
307.00 100.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING, 1,200.00 400.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 400.00 360.00
WIRING CHARGE, 50.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE . NOT NECESSARY 50,00 -

Report Ref No. CC3/CT115022417/H1 hg3g2




y _L’ | V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 40125 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408533
— TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607186.1 Page No.:2 of 2
By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate
Workshop ($)) ($)
REMOVE/REFIX AIRCON & REFILL GAS. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 :
1,850.00 790.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,687.24 3,212.44
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,550.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI15022417/H1hgaq2

NG KOK HUa

Automotive Assessor

SCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO) THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benedit of The Client named on the front Page of this Report,
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" Our Ref 11215/ SHD 3456H [ WT (J)

Date 26-Jan-16

ENGINEERING

J'r"-".,r(r” i (o 4'Jr‘f’“h-’33
cose 1ascams v 2 PMFORTDELGRO

—

|ulr|wl1'||g Pia Lid

Broddell Road Singapars 570701
Mamhne +A5 A383 R28N

Facsimilie +55 5280 8755

M/s China Taiping Insurunce (Singupore) Pre Lid 59 Loyang Drive

FANSON ROAD ath Noor

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWIR Singapore 508969 R e

SINGAPORE 0799009 Fax: 6214 1843

Atin : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir "

ACCIDENT INVOLVING QUR TAXI SHD 3456H YOUR INSURED
GBB 23685 OTHER ON 29.12.15

driver concermned have requested ang

authorized us to assist them In presenting their claims against the party responsibie
for all applicable matters arising from the damage to the vehicle,

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving :

GBB 23688
we are submitting this claim for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

Chomuneny Rpgacraien sy

WWWLCOHIE GO, 5g

Varruahihaa sy
Woarkshops

Braddall
205 Broddel Roard
Singapare 579701

Loyang

58 Loyang Diive
HNgape 2]
Sin Ming

383 8in Ming Drive
Eingapore 575717
Famdan

45 Pandan Bogd
Smngapom 809905

Litu
320 Ubi Rood 3
Singapore J0AMG

TAX]I OWNER’S CLAIM
! Costof Repair s$ 272850 Senokg
2 3__days Loss of Rental @3 100.58 per day S$ __ 30174 siqmomoknloos
3 urvey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/is LKK ) ss > ——
4 LTA Search Fees oo . S b
5 GIA / Palice Report Feas S$ - Singapora 72870
8 Towing / Medical / Transportation Fees -1 & . Defu
SubTotal: 8§ ~FUIEET— 450N Mame |
HIRER'S CLAIM -
1 3 days Loss of Income @s B0.00 per days ss 240.00
T ekl Claims s$ T 327550
___
We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims: -
a)  Original repair bill, pcs
b)  LTA search slip/s of GBB 2368S -
¢)  GIA/Police report/s of | D
d)  Letterof authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Photocopiess of Accident Scene Pholos { ) Traffic Police Compound
{ 1 Wilness statement's { x ) Rental Rate letter [ x ) Downlime/Mileage record
Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
S00n as possible,
Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shail be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver, This condition shall apply even if medical
expenses are claimed herewith and part of the settlement reached
Please nole that, for the tima being, we are not making this claim via solicitors provided you treat
thie letter as our intention to file & efaim In court according to the provizions of the Non-njury Motor
Accident Litigation {"NIMA”) protocol and further, you agree that if negotiations should breakdown
and this claim Is mhrrodmmm“ruuﬂlﬂlnutrﬁlmrnbhdhn that the NIMA protocol has
nat been complied with. If you disagres with this condition please reply in writing within the next
2 working days falling which wimmumm-ﬁm on the basis that you have
acquiesced to the sald condition by your conduct.
Yours faithfully
Werlliam Tan
Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Departmen|
Tel (6214 8737 Fax:6214 1843 Email - williamian@cdge com sg
L — F
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STUBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI15022417/H1ha3-1
04 DECEMBER 2017

M/S B.H. MINI MART

BLOCK 137 POTONG PASIR AVENUE 3
#01-142

SINGAPORE 350137

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 2368S AND SHD 3456H ON 29/12/2015

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 15/12/2017, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by You/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours failh’fuﬂy,

/
o i 1
Vic/Alpe
Cm{e Hﬁmd:‘er
DID: 6841 2096
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com

e.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



. CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
[NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SONATA SHD3456H , GBB2316aS
ALONG along potong pasir ave 1
Lfwe NG CHIN HENG {Hirer) NRIC Mo, :
and/or (Relief) NRIC No.:
Tazi Number SHD3456H

hereby authonse ComiontDelGrg Engineering Ple LLd{CDGE):

Page | of |

ON 29-Dec-15 14:45

51318897F

1. To submit my/our daims for damages, custs and expense, Induding loss of income, loss of rental,

medical fee and legal costs,

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount In respect of myfour daim

against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Vaucher an my/our behalf.

4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) In respect of the claim against thirg party and payment by cheque
shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's Instruction and made in favour of

“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd",

Date 29-Dec-2015

Name of Hirer NG CHIN HENG

Hirer NRIC $1328897F Signature :

Address 123 LORONG 1 TOA PAYOM #03-501
310123

Contact No. 975157214

M



PDJiEy No = DMCUENQG]BEIIEGT Claim No :ENHlSDU4BB&CDZEE
Claimant o COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Amount : 551, 520.00

S INGAFORE DOLLARS ONE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED TWENTY ONLY

Claimant Vehicle Wo. : 2D 3456H
Tnsured vehicle Wo. : GEB 2348%3

Date of Lass : 291272015

Place of Accident  ALONG POTONG PASIR AVENUE 1

IN CONSIDERATION of Lhe payment made ta mefus of the aforement ioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {SINGAFGREJ PTE. LTD., I/Wa agree ahsohmely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE fSINGAPGRE} FTE. LD, and/ar

Insured Name i B.H. MINT MART
Driver MName : ONG SAYE KEAT @ ong ALK SENG

from all claims, present or future ip Fespect of all loss, injury or damarge
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge thar this payment is made without admisgsion of !iahility on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (3INGAFORE) PTE. LTh,

(1) Globa sum {all in) 85 1,520.00

e kT T — Semmome

TOTAL v o ., . R A R e O ¢ 1,520.00

Bt -_—

Claimant Nape - ANGAPORE Eqnage HNRIC Ne& :

: A B B
Signature : / !L‘#' Date 4 5 7

"The contents of his document agly 10 vehice dameges only
g a1 s e, Bl i i Pleate forvard your cheque made payable to-
Al DETGNA! Ijures and fi-- : TR R R COMFORTDEL GRO Fje it cPING PTE ITH

fom e anbit & goos



=._;::JM}0RTDELGRQ
ENGINEERING,

ComfortDelGro Engineering pte Lty
2085 Brairige T rr—. LT
Masiline + £2 magy M0 Facumilg & 55 L P A

S0 Ly Dwwe Singspane sooas 24 Bencks Loy S SR AR 5

353 8 Ming Psium By 5TET? 75 apos Tae
HINEMET Gt COMIORDELGRO gpﬁdﬁ?fﬂh"]%if.;‘ ﬂuzﬁml‘miﬁmi
COMEANY REG. NO.: 199506048
GST REG. NO. M2-g921817.9 TAX INVOICE Page: 1
E010012 VEHCLE No INV. NO/DATE
i 3456H 07.01.201¢
uﬂé?ﬂ' }I‘;jﬁﬂ;ﬂ }.xr’*LfL'Ii.r‘..:{LL'.'-Z CO{5) FTE L = JﬂlEiﬁ{‘i ¥ o2
5] Gl TOWRR MAKE .
Y ANSON ROAD # HYUNDAT %4&498?9
3 2 ROAD #1f-ry
SINGARPORE a746a00 MODEL OMTEH READING
= SONATA et
CONTACT M 222736 MTE oF
22.01.2009
. CHASSTS 1 JOB TYPR
H!ﬂiEle?Rc?AﬁEBBTE
Description - ACC.29,12. 15/¢
Invoice for Lump Sum Repair
Total [, Sum Repair Am 2,550, 00
Adéd GSTHEF %.Gﬂﬂ 3 178.50
Total Inveice amount. 2,728.50

lasued by
Repair =1

! LHI?HBE%}E.‘%EG 07.01.2016 09:16:45
~ Payment Type/Term :

CLSO/5
‘Credit 30 days

JmfortDelGro Engineering Pte L1d ;
membor of COMAORIDELCAG ACCOUNT No, INVOICE No, AMOUNT 4 BANK/CHO N
lead Omuﬂ: e e

05 Braddell Road
imgnpere $7970]

Indly note that no receipt shall be issusg uniess requested,
USTOMER'S copy




Our Ref: CT15121191 n

Dale; 30 December 2015 fﬂﬂfﬂff
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirMadam

ACCIDENT ON 29/12/2015 @ 14:45 hrg

ALONG ALONG POTONG FPASIR AVENUE 1

INVOLVING GBB2368s

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3456H (the “Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to NG CHIN HENG IC NO
S1328897F a registered hirer-operatar of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
cof occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $100.58 per day

(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with First Capital Insurance Ltd on a
third party basis al the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a mator

workshop of his choice.

Please lisise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshap directly for
settlement of claims with third party's insurance company In respect of the sald

accident,

Yours faithfully

Christine Tay
Executive, Fleat Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required,

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainling +55 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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. Insurance Particyjar Enquiry By Agents Detai]

Page 1 of 1
|; TE.;I Size + -ji
0% 259, 50% - 75%  100%
Enquire Vehicle Insurance Particulars
Vehicle Search Date/Tima Search Insurance Comn:ny Insurance Company Nama
Nao. Status Code
289 Dec 2015 CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (s E)
GoB23ess 25 Dec Successfl (g9 ATECE NGAPOR
Previous ok
Larul Ir.-unwr&-\ml‘u Wiy

Pizase read through the Privacy Stalement, Temns of Use and Disclaimey,
Pfuamdnmtumﬂmﬂmkamd mmm-lﬂiquMIhnmmhﬂmmm.
h-1m~¢w!ubm-m“mxmm

Comyright © 2005 LTA | &mﬂm i

Immlmulﬂﬁhmm
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Vic (LKKAuto)
F

rom: Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.coms

Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2017 4:18 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Admin A

Subject: RE: <URGENT> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB2368S
I{SNMISDMESECDE;‘HJ and SHD3456H (TP : LKK REF - CC3;"CTI1502241?,.-"H1h93} on
29122015

Dear Vic

My apologies for the late response.
Please proceed to settle third party’s claim at 500,

Best Reaards

loel Goh
Claims Executive (Motor Division)
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd,
3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6184

Fax: 6224 7175 /6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

l.gah i :
Website: WWW,5g.cntaiping.com

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailtc:vicalpeh@lkkauto.mm]

Sent: Thursday, 16 November, 2017 10:08 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Jowyn Tay cjowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.cum::; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.coms; Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: <URGENT> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB23685S (SNM15D04889C02/8) and SHD3456H (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CTI15022417/H1 hg3) on 29.12.2015

Importance: High

Dear Alfred,

We refer further to our below email,

Please be informed that TP chased for an update/settlement,
Kindly advise further instructions.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | emajl: vicalpeh @ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ub; Avenue 1, #oz-25 | 5(408933)
yITEr o=

b

T Save the Larth- Pripe only when pecessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material. ang are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipiant jg prohibited, and may be a violation of jaw. |f You believe that you received this e-mail in errgr, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and ail attachments, including any capies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies theregf Thank you,

From: Vic | LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 17 March, 2017 5:41 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: 'Alfred Toh': Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB23685 [SNMJSDMSEBCDE;‘B} and SHD3456H (TP : Lkk REF -
CCS!CTIISUZE#I?!thgB} on 29,12.2015

Dear Alfred,
We refer to your below email.
Please be informed that we had rejected the TP claim as instructed.

However, TP had informed us that our Insured’s claim was settled at around 509, Please see enclosed email for your
reference,

For your further instructio ns, please,
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consulta nts Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: mmm@lgkmm | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubj Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

L3 7d 7
“‘-;: e LA

Save the Lorth- Prips Only when pecessary

This email may contain cenfidential and/or privileged information. If You are not the intended recipient {or have recehved this email in error) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email, Any unautharized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden,

Lcntaiping.com

From: Claims Dept of T mailto:claimsd

Sent: Monday, 16 May, 2016 10:34 AM

To: Vic <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>:; Admin A <admin-a@lkkautn.mm>; Agnes Lim (LKK Auto)
2




